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Licensing and Approval of Adult and Child 
Car!' Programs (H. P. 791) (L. D. 1032) (C. "A" 
11·208 ) 

Was reported by the Committee on En­
gross('d Bills as truly and strictly ('ngrossed. 

On motion of Mrs. Mitchell of Vassalboro, 
tahled pending passage to he enacted and to­
morrow assigned. 

----
An A(·t to ({evise the Markup Percentage for 

Maim' Produced Products Under the Liquor 
Law (H. 1'. 1(84) (L. D. 1432) 

An Act Relating to Victims' Bill of Rights (H. 
P. 1192) (L. D. 1578) 

Finally Passed 
RESOLVE, Directing th(' State Planning Of­

fice to Inventory Virgin Timber Stands on State 
Lands(H.P. 1193) (L.D. 1579) 

Were reported by the Committee on En­
gross('d Bills as truly and strictly ('ngrossed, 
th(' Bills passed to be enact('d and the Resolve 
finally passed, all signed by the Speaker and 
spnt to thp Spnate. 

The following papprs appearing on Supple­
ment No.4 w('rp taken up out of order by un­
animolls consent: 

Bill "An Act Concerning Group Life Insu­
ranep for State Employees and Teachers" 
(Emergency) (S. P. 556) 

Came from the Senate referred to the Com­
mittee on Aging, Retirement and Veterans and 
ordered printed. 

In the House, the Bill was referred to the 
Committee on Aging, Retirement and Veterans 
in (·oncurrence. 

Bill "An Act to Define Connection under the 
Liquor Laws" (S. P. 557) 

Came from the Senate referred to the Com­
mitt!'!' on Legal Affairs and ordered printed. 

In the House, the Bill was referred to the 
Committee on Legal Affairs in concurrence. 

Bill "An Act Concerning Volunteer Marine 
Patrol Officers" (Emergency) (S. P. 558) 

Came from the Senate referred to the Com­
mittee on Marine Resources in concurrence. 

In the House, the Bill was referred to the 
Committee on Marine Resources in concur­
rence. 

Unanimous Ought Not to Pass 
Report of the Committee on Appropriations 

and Financial Affairs reporting "Ought Not to 
Pass" on Bill "An Act to Abolish County Subsi­
dies to the Superior Court System" (S. P. 271) 
(L.D.824) 

Was placed in the Legislative Files without 
further action pursuant to Joint Rule 15 in 
concurrence. 

Unanimous Leave to Withdraw 
Heport of the Committee on Judiciary re­

porting "Leave to Withdraw" on Bill" An Act Re­
lating to Guidelines for Certain Police Powers" 
(S.P.285)(L.D.873) 

Report of the Committee on Judiciary re­
porting "Leave to Withdraw" on Bill "An Act Re­
lating to Leases of Dwelling Units in a 
Multi-unit Residential Building where More 
than a Month's Rent is Required in Advance" 
(S.P.291)(L.D.879) 

Report of the Committee on Judiciary re­
porting "Leave to Withdraw" on Bill "An Act to 
Create a State Civil Rights Act" (S. P. 329) (L. D. 
974) 

Were placed in the Legislative Files without 
further action pursuant to Joint Rule 15 in 
concurrence. 

Ought to Pass in New Draft 
Report of the Committee on Agriculture on 

Hill "An Act to Protect the Public from Unsafe 
Pesticide Vse" (S. P. 348) (L. D. 1(22) reporting 
"Ought to Pass" in New Draft (S. P. 553) (L. D. 
16(2) 

Came from the Senate with the Report read 
and accepted and the New Draft passed to be 
engrossed. 

In the House, the Report was read and ac­
cepted, the New Draft read once and assigned 
for second reading tomorrow. 

Divided Report 
Six Members of the Committee on Health 

and Institutional Services on Bill "An Act to 
Prohibit Smoking in Food Stores and Portions 
of Restaurants" (S. P. 68) (L. D. 174) report in 
Report "A" that the same "Ought to Pass" in 
New Draft under Nt~w Title Bill "An Act to Re­
quire Signs Relating to Smoking in Retail Food 
Stores and Restaurants, and to Require a No 
Smoking Area in Larger Restaurants" (S. P. 
549) (L. D. 1591) 

Report was signed by the following mem­
bers: 

Senator: 
BUSTIN of Kennebec 

- of the Senate. 
Represen tatives: 

CARROLL of Gray 
BRODEUR of Auburn 
MELENDY of Rockland 
MANNING of Portland 
NELSON of Portland 

- of the House. 
Four Members of the same Committee on 

the same Bill report in Report "B" that the 
same "Ought to Pass" in New Draft under New 
Title Bill "An Act to Require Signs Relating to 
Smoking in Retail Food Stores and Restau­
rants" (S. P. 550) (L. D. 1592) 

Report was signed by the following mem­
bers: 

Senator: 
GILL of Cumberland 

- of the Senate. 
Representatives: 

PINES of Limestone 
RICHARD of Madison 
MA ¥BURY of Brewer 

- of the House. 
Three Members of the same Committee on 

the same Bill report in Report "C" that the 
same "Ought Not to Pass" 

Report was signed by the following mem­
bers: 

Senator: 
CARPENTER of Aroostook 

- of the Senate. 
Representatives: 

WEBSTER of Farmington 
SEAVEY of Kennebunkport 

- of the House. 
Came from the Senate with the Bill and Ac­

companying Papers Indefinitely Postponed. 
In the House: Reports were read. 
The SPEAKER: The Chair recognizes the 

gentleman from Madison, Mr. Richard. 
Mr. RICHARD: Mr. Speaker, I move accep­

tance of Committee Report B and would like to 
speak briefly to my motion. 

The SPEAKER: The gentleman from Madi­
son, Mr. Richard, moves that Report B, "Ought 
to Pass" in New Draft be accepted in non­
concurrence. 

The gentleman may proceed. 
Mr. RICHARD: Mr. Speaker, Ladies and Gen­

tlemen of the House: After a long, prolonged 
debate in the Committee on Health and Insti­
tutional Services, and in failing to arrive at a 
consensus, this can truly be considered as a 
compromise position on this piece of legisla­
tion regarding smoking in food stores and res­
taurants. Essentially, it asks that each ofthese 
institutions post whatever their policy may be. 
There are no fines imposed and essentially this 
is it. 

The SPEAKER: The Chair recognizes the 
gentleman from Farmington, Mr. Webster. 

Mr. WEBSTER: Mr. Speaker, Ladies and Gen­
tlemen of the House: I don't intend to debate 
this issue today. Ijust feel the legislation is un­
necessary and unenforceable and would re­
quest a division. 

The SPEAKER: The Chair recognizes the 
gentleman from Portland, Mr. Manning. 

Mr. MANNING: Mr. Speaker, Ladies and Gen­
tlemen of the House: Although I am not on the 
same side as the gentleman from Madison, Mr. 
Richard, I realize the realities of this bill and I 
would hope you would go along with the gen­
tleman's motion to accept the Report B. 

The SPEAKER: The Chair recognizes the 
gentleman from Canton, Mr. McCollister. 

Mr. McCOLISTER: Mr. Speaker, Ladies and 
Gentlemen of the House: I move the indefinite 
postponement of this Bill and all its accom­
panying papers and request that the commit­
tee report be read. 

The SPEAKER: The gentleman from Canton, 
Mr. McCollister, moves that this bill and all its 
accompanying papers be indefinitely post­
poned in concurrence. 

The Chair will order a vote. All those in favor 
will vote yes; those opposed will vote no. 

A vote of the House was taken. 
Whereupon, Mr. Manning of Portland re­

quested a roll call vote. 
The SPEAKER: For the Chair to order a roll 

call, it must have the expressed desire of one 
fifth of the members present and voting. All 
those in favor will vote yes; those opposed will 
vote no. 

A vote of the House was taken, and more 
than one ftfth of the members present having 
expressed a desire for a roll call, a roll call was 
ordered. 

The SPEAKER: The Chair recognizes the 
gentleman from Portland, Mr. Manning. 

Mr. MANNING: Mr. Speaker, Ladies and Gen­
tlemen of the House: This amendment is not 
forcing anyone to go to court. It is just making 
it that if any supermarket indicated that they 
were not going to allow smoking in the super­
market, then they must post the sign outside 
or inside so people are aware of that. 

I am sure you have had many of your con­
stituents say to you that when they have gone 
shopping, they get a little upset when some­
body is smoking a cigarette or a cigar over the 
fresh tomatoes. Also, they have looked around 
and they have seen them smoking a big cigar 
over the fresh cuts of meat. Mr. Cox says he 
hasn't gotten any calls on it; well, I have. I got a 
call, and it was a call from my mother. Every­
time I see her when she comes back from 
shopping, she says, can't you do something 
about that? I say, well, we're trying to do some­
thing about it. 

Shaw's Supermarket, which is probably one 
of the largest in the state, and Hannaford, 
which is probably one of the largest in the 
state, have no problem with this part of the 
amendment. 

Also, when it comes to restaurants, all we 
are asking is that the restaurant post just ex­
actly what their policy is. It doesn't say they 
have to have a smoking section. My amend­
ment would have said they would have to have 
a smoking section. This one just says whether 
or not they have a section or they don't have a 
smoking section. 

This is a complete compromise. I just can't 
imagine us not going along with this. All this is 
is notifying the general public on what the pol­
icies are going to be. 

I would hope you wouldn't indefinitely post­
pone this. We don't want to go into what smok­
ing does because I think you all know what 
smoking does. I think the gentleman from Can­
ton heard enough of it two years ago when he 
was on my committee, and if anybody in this 
room can tell me that smoking is not hazard­
ous to one's health, then I would like to see the 
facts and figures. 

The SPEAKER: The Chair recognizes the 
gentleman from Canton, Mr. McCollister. 

Mr. McCOLLISTER: Mr. Speaker, Ladies and 
Gentlemen of the House: Earlier I asked that 
the Committee Report be read, because only by 
listening to it be read does it really dawn on 
you how badly divided that committee was. I 
believe the division within the committeejusti­
fies the indefinite postponement. 
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'I'll .. SI'r;AK~;H: 'I'll" Cllair r('('o)!niz('s til .. 
)!('ntJtoman from Auhurn, Mr. IIrodt'ur. 

Mr. IIHO[)ElIll: Mr. Spt'akpr and M,'mht'rs of 
t.he 110111;(,: V,'ry hrit'lly, t lIis position of Ul'port 
II is a compromisl' t.hat was a)!rpt'd to hy tilt' 
Mairw Rl'staurants Association. TIH' reason 
that we agreed to all this particular motion to 
he made and to support it was in order to get 
some sort of support for the bill, and I hope the 
memhers of the House will support Report B. 

The SPEAKER: The Chair recognizes the 
gpntieman from Augusta, Mr. Paradis. 

Mr. PARADIS: Mr. Speaker, Ladies and Gen­
tlemen of the House: I would just like to com­
ml'nd those who have signed Report B. There 
arl' many people out there in the main who are 
allergic to smoke and I am one of them. I have 
gont' manytimes to restaurants to eat only to 
haw the person next to me have a very delight­
ful after dinner smoke. I don't begrudge him 
that, and I don't smoke, the only reason I don't 
smoke is because I am allergic to it and I have a 
severe allergic reaction. So I think they ought 
to be commended for taking into considera­
tion those rights of those people who cannot 
smoke bl'causl' of hl'alth reasons. 

The SPEAKER: The Chair recognizl's the 
g('nt.leman from Madison, Mr. Richard. 

Mr. RICHARD: Mr. Spl'aker, Ladil's and Gen­
tlpmen ofthp Housp: Thl' reason which Reprl'­
s('ntativl' McCollistl'r just indicated for not 
voting for this bill should be the pxact reason 
you should bl' voting for it. It is a compromisl' 
and it dol's takp into consideration the rights 
of smokl'rs and nonsmokers, and it does have 
tile hacking ofthp Retail Association as well as 
tlw ~Iaine Restaurant Association. 

Tlw SPEAKJ;R: The Chair recognizes the 
g.'ntleman from Farmington, Mr. Webster. 

~Ir. WEBSTER: Mr. Speakpr, Ladies and Gen­
tl('men of the House: This may have the back­
ing. Committpe Report B, of the Maine Grocers 
Association, but it does not have the backing of 
my small grocery stores. Those of us who re­
presl'nt rural districts find it frustrating to see 
I hat ('ontinually we pass laws and regulations 
IH'n' in Augusta, manytimes that don't do any­
I hing, and here is an example-we are requir­
ing the grocery stores in my district who sell to 
friends and neighbors who come in to put a 
sign up. The sign simply says "No Smoking" if 
t hat is their policy. Very few stores in my dis­
trict have that policy. They are trying to makp a 
living and they arp not going to stop the local 
IlI'ighbor from coming in and smoking while he 
is in I he store. 

My argument is, this is another unnecessary 
law that we are putting on the books. There's 
no t{,pth in thl' smoking law, as you all know. 
There is no police officer in this state who is 
going to throw anybody out ofa grocery storp. 

[ think two years ago when legislation was 
initially offered to state a state policy, it was a 
good idea. hut we continually pass and more 
laws here on smoking and other areas of legis­
lation that rpally are not necessary and don't 
do anything. So I ask you to indefinitely post­
POIH' this mt'asure so that it can die a solid 
dpath. 

The SPEAKER: The Chair recognizes the 
gentlewoman from Portland, Mrs, Nelson. 

'.Irs. ~ELSO)l;; Mr. Speaker, Men and Women 
of the Housp: That's exactly right. What we 
have done is, we have said to the retail stores, 
managers, and to those people who own and 
run restaurants, mak£' a statement, say you 
prohihit smoking or you don't prohibit smok­
ing. If a small Mom and Pop store has a policy, 
doesn't wish to make a statement, or simply 
says yes, smoking is permitted, you put the sign 
up and you say that. 

It is very, very important that we as a legisla­
t lin' make a stat('ment to the number one killer 
in thp United States, and that is smoking, that 
if you have a policy, you put a sign up and you 
say "No Smoking: 

How does the state prewnt people from 
going into st.ores harpfooted? There is a sign up 

in almost. t'very r!'tail sh)n' t hal says therl' will 
ht, no ont' han'footp(\ allowed in tIlt' sh)n'. Wt' 
an' just saying I h" sam(' thing ahout. smoking, 
that ifth" peopl!' in Ihat slon' dpcidethere will 
1)(' no smoking, they put a sign up and say 
"Smoking is Prohibited." If they don't have a 
policy, then thpy don't put asign up. It is a very 
small step. 

We asked the restaurants of the state if they 
would have a policy, and they came back to us 
and said-well, no one says anything. This way, 
if there is a policy, it is stated at the beginning 
when you come into the restaurant, and if you 
wish to have a no smoking or be seated aside in 
a particular area, there is an area availahle, 
wonderful; if not, you know that too. Also as a 
patron you might say to the person who is 
showing you to your table, do you have a pol­
icy? That would raise the consciousness of 
some of the restauranteurs that there are 
people out there who do prefer a smoke-free 
area. That is exactly what we are trying to do in 
our committl'e, and I do hope that you will vote 
against the indefinite postponement of this 
measure. 

The SPEAKER: The Chair recognizes the 
gentleman from Madison, Mr. Richard. 

Mr. RICHARD: Mr. Speaker, Ladies and Gen­
tlemen of the House: Again the Representative 
from Farmington has strengthened the argu­
ment. Here we have an opportunity to pass a 
law that will actually take into consideration 
the rights and privileges of all the citizens in 
the State of Maine. 

The SPEAKER: The Chair recognizes the 
gpntieman from South Portland, Mr. Ma­
comber. 

Mr. MACOMBER: Mr. Speaker, I would like to 
pose a question to the gentlelady from Por­
tland. Is there anything to prohibit a store 
owner from putting up a sign now without hav­
ing a law that makes it necessary? 

The SPEAKER: The gentleman from South 
Portland, Mr. Macomber, has posed a question 
through the Chair to the gentlpwoman from 
Portland, Mrs. Nelson, who may answer if she 
so desires, and the Chair recognizes the gen­
tlewoman. 

Mrs. NELSON: Mr. Speaker and Members of 
the House: No, there is nothing to prohibit it 
right now, except there is no statement by the 
state to require a store owner or a restauran­
teur to make a statement of determination as 
to whether they have a policy or not, and you 
don't know that as a patron. So what we are 
asking these people is to simply determine 
what your policy is and let the patrons know. 

The SPEAKER: The Chair recognizes the 
gentlewoman from Portland, Mrs. Beaulieu. 

Mrs. BEAULIEU: Mr. Speaker, I would like to 
pose a question through the Chair. I would like 
to expand on Representative Macomber's 
question. Is there a penalty for failure to post 
the policy? 

The SPEAKER: Thp gentlewoman from Port­
land, Mrs. Beaulieu, has posed a question 
through the Chair to the gpntlewoman from 
Portland, Mrs. Nelson, who may answer if she 
so desires, and the Chair recognizes that gen­
tlewoman. 

Mrs. NELSON: Mr. Speaker, Men and Women 
of the House: No, there isn't any, and there isn't 
any penalty regarding those signs that say 
there will be no bare feet in the stores either 
and yet the stores do post t hat. It is a health 
measure, that is why they put it up. This is a 
health measure; we are asking for the same 
consideration. 

The SPEAKER: The Chair recognizes the 
gentlewoman from Portland, Mrs. Beaulieu. 

Mrs. BEAULIEU: Mr. Speaker, Ladies and 
Gentlemen of the House: It is no secret that I 
am a smoker, and my legislative history here 
has been that I have consistently supported 
anti-smoking bills, my record will show that. I 
think only once did I ever vote no on any mea­
sure that would restrict smoking, but I am get­
ting increasingly concerned. I think that the 

mOl"(' pursuan('(' of this thing with bills like this 
that really are meaningless to some degree be­
cause we pass a law that can't be enforced, 
that has no teeth in it, we are going to find out 
or we are going to be put in a position of mak­
ing the anti-smoking effort almost meaningless 
if we keep on going with this thing. Now we 
can't smoke in public buildings, in waiting 
areas, on buses. I presume that the island fer­
ries were probably involved in that. I think the 
motion to indefinitely postpone is in order on 
this piece of legislation. 

The SPEAKER: A roll call has been ordered. 
The pending question before the House is on 
the motion ofthl' gentleman from Canton, Mr. 
McCollister, that this Bill and all its accompan­
ying papers be indefinitely postponed in con­
currence. Those in favor will vote yes; those 
opposed will vote no. 

The Chair recognizes the gentlewoman from 
So. Portland, Ms. Benoit. 

Ms. BENOIT: Mr. Speaker, I request permis­
sion to pair my vote with the gentleman from 
Durham, Mr. Hayden. If Mr. Hayden were pres­
ent and voting, he would be voting yes; I would 
be voting no. 

ROLLCALL 
YEA-Ainsworth, Armstrong, Beaulieu, Bell, 

Bonney, Brown, A.K.; Brown, D.N.; Brown, K.L.; 
Cahill, Callahan, Carter, Cashman, Chonko, 
Clark, Conary, Conners, Cote, Crouse, Crowley, 
Daggett, Davis, Day, Dillenback, Dudley, Erwin, 
Foster, Greenlaw, Hall, Higgins, L.M.; Hobbins, 
Holloway, Ingraham, Jacques, Joseph, Kane, 
Kelleher, Kelly, Kiesman, Kilcoyne, Lebowitz, 
Lehoux, Lewis, Lisnik, MacEachern, Macom­
ber, Manning, Martin, H.C.; Masterton, Mat­
thews, K.L.; Maybury, McCollister, McSweeney, 
Michaud, Moholland, Murphy, E.M.; Murphy, 
T.W.; Nadeau, Parent, Paul, Randall, Reeves, 
J.W.; Ridley, Roberts, Roderick, Salsbury, Scar­
pino, Seavey, Sherburne, Small, Smith, C.W.; 
Soucy, Sproul, Stover, Strout, Telow, Theriault, 
Tuttle, Vose, Walker, Webster, Willey, Zirnkil­
ton. 

NA Y -Allen, Anderson, Andrews, Bost, Bott, 
Brannigan, Brodeur, Carroll, D.P.; Carroll, G.A.; 
Connolly, Cooper, Cox, Curtis, Dexter, Dia­
mond, Drinkwater, Gauvreau, Gwadosky, 
Handy, Hickl'Y, Higgins, H.C.; Ketover, La­
Plante, MacBride, Martin, A.C.; Masterman, 
McGowan, McHenry, McPherson, Melendy, Mi­
chael, Mitchell, E.H.; Mitchell, J.; Murray. Nel­
son, Norton, Paradis, E.J.; Paradis, P.E.; 
Perkins, Perry, Pines, Racine, Reeves, P.; Ri­
chard, Rolde, Smith, C.B.; Soule, Stevens, Stev­
enson, Swazey, Tammaro, Thompson, Went­
worth. 

ABSENT -Baker, Carrier, Jackson, Jalbert, 
Joyce, Livesay, Locke, Mahany, Matthews, Z.E.; 
Pouliot, Rotondi, Weymouth, the SpI'aker. 

Yes, 82; No, 53; Absent, 13; Paired, 2; Vacant, 
1. 

The SPEAKER: Eighty-two having voted in 
the affirmative and fIfty-three in the negative, 
with thirteen being absent, two pairl'd and one 
vacant, the motion does prevail. 

The Chair recognizes the gentleman from 
Farmington, Mr. Webster. 

Mr. WEBSTER: Mr. Speaker, having voted on 
the prevailing side, I now move that we recon­
sider our action whereby this bill was indefi­
nitely postponed and ask you all to vote 
against me. 

The SPEAKER: The gentleman from Far­
mington, Mr. Webster, moves that the House 
reconsider its action whereby this body voted 
to indefinitely postpone this Bill. 

The Chair recognizes the gentleman from 
Portland, Mr. Manning. 

Mr. MANNING: Mr. Speaker, Ladies and Gen­
tlemen of the House: I request a division. I 
know that this bill is going down the tube but I 
just wanted to remind you that this is one of 
the number one killers throughout the whole 
country. I think it is about time that govern­
ment started looking at where we are contri­
buting 50 percent ofthe costs of hospitals and 
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nO percent to the cost of most health care, that 
WI' start looking at it now. 

The SPEAKER: The Chair will order a vote. 
The pending question before the House is on 
the motion of the gentleman from Farmington, 
Mr. Webster, that the House reconsider its ac­
tion whereby this body voted to indefinitely 
postpone this bill in concurrence. Those in 
favor will vote yes; those opposed will vote no. 

A vote of the House was taken. 
51 having voted in the affirmative and 80 in 

the negative, the motion did not prevail. 

Petitions, Bills and Resolves 
Requiring Reference 

The following Bills were received and 
referred to the following Committees: 

Business Legislation 
Bill "An Act Amending the Charter of the 

Telephone Workers Credit Union of Maine" CH. 
P. 1219) (Presented by Representative Gauv­
reau of Lewiston) (Cosponsor: Senator 
Charette of Androscoggin) (Approved for in­
troduction by a majority of the Legislative 
Council pursuant to Joint Rule 27) 

(Ordered Printed) 
Sent up for concurrence. 

Fisheries and Wildlife 
Bill "An Act to Require Life Preservers to be 

Used by Canoeists" (H. P. 1220) (Presented by 
Representative Parent of Benton) (Cosponsor: 
Senator Teague of Somerset) (Approved for 
introduction by a majority of the Legislative 
Council pursuant to Joint Rule 27) (By Re­
qupst) 

(Ordered Printed) 
Sent up for concurrence. 

Labor 
Bill "An Act to Clarify the Status of Workfare 

R<'cipients under the Workers' Compensation 
Act" (H. P. 1221) (Presented by Representative 
Beaulipu of Portland) (Cosponsor: Senator 
Dutremble of York) (Approved for introducti­
on by a majority of the Legislative Council pur­
suant to Joint Rule 27) 

Bill "An Act to Debar from State Contracts 
Employers Guilty of Willful or Repeated Viola­
tion of Safety Standards" (H. P. 1222) (Pres­
ented by Representative Tuttle of Sanford) 
(Cosponsors: Representatives Tammaro of 
Baileyville, Bonney of Falmouth, and Senator 
Dutremble of York) (Submitted by the De­
partment of Labor pursuant to Joint Rule 24) 

(Ordered Printed) 
Sent up for concurrence. 

Orders 
On Motion of Representative Mitchell of Vas­

salboro, the following Joint Order: (H. P. 1224) 
ORDERED, the Senate concurring, that "AN 

ACT to Revise the Composition of the Maine 
Resources Advisory Council" (H. P. 1038) (L. D. 
1363) be recalled from the Governor's desk to 
the House. 

The Order was read and passed and sent up 
for concurrence. 

By unanimous consent, ordered sent forth­
with to the Senate. 

Unanimous Ought Not to Pass 
Representative Zirnkilton from the Commit­

tee on Labor on Bill "An Act to Increase the 
Minimum Wage" (H. P. 1013) (L. D. 1338) re­
porting "Ought Not to Pass" 

Was placed in the Legislative Files without 
further action pursuant to Joint Rule 15 and 
spnt up for concurrence. 

Unanimous Leave to Withdraw 
Representative Hickey from the Committee 

on Aging. Retirement and Veterans on Bill "An 
Act to Equalize the Years of Participation and 
Benefits Under the Maine State Retirement 
System" (H. P. 1098) (L. D. 1449) reporting 
"Leave to Withdraw" 

Representative Stevenson from the Commit-

tee on Election Laws on Bill "An Act to 
Promote Better Voter Participation and to De­
signate the Day of the State General Election a 
State Holiday" (H. P. 820) (I... D. 1060) report­
ing "Leave to Withdraw" 

Representative Nadeau from the Committee 
on Election Laws on Bill "An Act to Improve 
and Strengthen the Referendum Process" (H. 
P. 1032) (L. D. 1357) reporting "Leave to With­
draw" 

Were placed in the Legislative Files without 
further action pursuant to Joint Rule 15 and 
sent up for concurrence. 

The following papers appearing on Supple­
ment No.5 were taken up out of order by un­
animous consent: 

Petitions, Bills and Resolves 
Requiring Reference 

The following Bill was received and referred 
to the following Committee: 

Labor 
Bill "An Act to Provide Authority to the De­

partment of Labor to Receive Federal Funds in 
Order to Expand the Workplace Safety Com­
pliance Consultation Program" (Emergency) 
(H. P. 1225) (Presented by Representative Nor­
ton of Biddeford) (Cosponsors: Representa­
tives Lewis of Auburn, Swazey of Bucksport, 
and Senator Hayes of Penobscot) (Submitted 
by the Department of Labor pursuant to Joint 
Rule 24) 

(Ordered Printed) 
Sent up for concurrence. 

Unanimous Ought Not to Pass 
Representative Brannigan from the Com­

mittee on Business Legislation on Bill "An Act 
Relating to Banking Disclosure" (H. P. 947) (L. 
D. 1228) reporting "Ought Not to Pass" 

Was placed in the Legislative Files without 
further action pursuant to Joint Rule 15 and 
sent up for concurrence. 

The Chair laid before the House the fol­
lowing matter: 

Bill" An Act to Revise the Truancy Laws" (H. 
P. 877) (L. D. 1131) (C. "An H-213) which was 
tabled and later today assigned pending the 
motion of Mr. Connolly of Portland to recon­
sider whereby the Bill was passed to be en­
grossed. 

On motion of Mr. Diamond of Bangor, re­
tabled pending the motion of Mr. Connolly of 
Portland to reconsider and tomorrow as­
signed. 

The Chair laid before the House the follow­
ing matter: 

Bill" An Act Adjusting the Rate of Refund of 
Motor Fuel Tax to Users of Aircraft and to 
Make Technical Adjustments to the Motor Fuel 
Tax Laws" (Emergency) (H. P. 1177) (I... D. 
1571) which was tabled and later today as­
signed pending further consideration. (In 
House, referred to the Committee on Taxation. 
In Senate, passed to be engrossed as amended 
by Senate Amendment "A" (S-113) without 
reference to a Committee) 

The SPEAKER: The Chair recognizes the 
gentleman from Portland, Mr. Higgins. 

Mr. HIGGINS: Mr. Speaker, we are waiting 
for an amendment to be put forth from the 
Department of Transportation to clear up 
some inconsistencies in the suppliers'law, and 
I would ask that somebody table this two legis­
lative days. 

Whereupon, on motion of Mrs. Mitchell of 
Vassalboro, tabled pending further considera­
tion and speCially assigned for Wednesday, 
May 18. 

The Chair laid before the House the fol­
lowing matter: 

JOINT ORDER: (H. P. 1204) relative to 
amending Joint Rule 21-A-which was tabled 
and later today assigned pending passage. 

Mrs. Nelson of Portland requested permis-

sion to withdraw the Joint Order, which was 
granted. 

The Chair laid before the House the follow­
ing matter: 

An Act Relating to Drinking in Public (S. P. 
420) (L D. 1273) (H. "A" H-201 to C. "A" S-86) 
which was tabled and later today assigned 
pending passage to be enacted. 

The SPEAKER: The Chair recognizes the 
gentleman from Brewer, Mr. Cox. 

Mr. COX: Mr. Speaker, Ladies and Gentle­
men of the House: At this point, I think this was 
pretty welI explained in the caucus this morn­
ing and it was pretty well explained the other 
night, as possible as it is to explain a fairly 
complicated bill, but I will read into the record 
the statement that refers to the section as to 
whether or not the bill would cover bottle 
clubs. There have been some attorneys' opin­
ions that it would be read that way, and I 
simply want to read the sponsor's intention 
into the record. The sponsor's intention is that 
it would not cover bottle clubs. Further, the in­
tention of the Legal Affairs Committee was 
that it would not cover bottle clubs. 

Mr. Speaker, I would request a roll call on 
enactment. 

The SPEAKER: The Chair recognizes the 
gentleman from Lincoln, Mr. MacEachern. 

Mr. MacEACHERN: Mr. Speaker, Ladies and 
Gentlemen of the House: Two years ago, this 
House spent a lot of time and a lot of effort try­
ing to put together a sensible drinking bill. We 
accomplished that. We have the bill in place 
now and it is working very well. 

I have read this bill over and I see nowhere 
where it is going to improve what we have now. 
As a matter offact, it will sap away at the effec­
tiveness of what we have on the books now. I 
firmly feel that if something isn't broken, you 
shouldn't bother to fix it, and that is about the 
condition this law is in right now. 

I move the indefinite postponement of this 
Bill and alI its accompanying papers. 

The SPEAKER: The gentleman from Lincoln, 
Mr. MacEachern, moves that this bill and all its 
accompanying papers be indefinitely post­
poned in non-concurrence. 

The Chair recognizes the gentleman from 
Cumberland, Mr. Dillenback. 

Mr. DILLENBACK; Mr. Speaker, Ladies and 
Gentlemen of the House: The Legal Affairs 
Committee spent some time on this bill and I 
think it is an important bill. You all heard the 
last time, two years ago, whenever it was that 
we had this bill, about the problem in Old Or­
chard Beach and all the other areas where 
people were drinking in public. The officer had 
to warn them and warn them again, and then 
there was no action after they had, really. This 
bill does provide for some action. The people 
still are warned once, particularly people who 
might be on the beach from Canada and not 
aware that there is a law, but this will firm up 
the law and if we have an habitual offender, we 
can do something because the law has put 
some teeth into it. So I recommend that you 
not do away with this and that you accept this 
bill as written with the amendments. 

Mr. MacEachern of Lincoln request a ron call 
vote. 

The SPEAKER: For the Chair to order a roll 
call, it must have the expressed desire of one 
fifth of the members present and voting. All 
those desiring a roll call vote will vote yes; 
those opposed will vote no. 

A vote of the House was taken, and more 
than one fifth ofthe members present having 
expressed a desire for a roll call, a roll call was 
ordered. 

The SPEAKER: The pending question is on 
the motion of the gentleman from Lincoln, Mr. 
MacEachern, that this Bill and all its accom­
panying papers be indefinitely postponed in 
non-concurrence. All those in favor will vote 
yes; those opposed will vote no. 

The Chair recognizes the gentleman from 




