
Task Order Landscape Construction Services Statewide 2025 

Item No Schedule of Items / Item Description Qty. Unit Region 1 
Unit Cost 

Region 1 
Total 

Region 2 
Unit Cost

Region 2 
Total

Region 3 
Unit Cost

Region 3 
Total

Region 4 
Unit Cost

Region 4  
Total

Region 5 
Unit Cost

Region 5  
Total

304.09 Aggregate Base Course - Crushed Type A 10 CY 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
411.131 Stone Dust Surface Course 200 SF 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
609.11 Vertical Curb Type I 80 LF 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
613.319 Erosion Control Blanket 50 SY 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
615.07 Loam 10 CY 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
617.35 Compost 10 CY 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
618.13 Seeding Method Number 1 4 1,000 SF 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
618.14 Seeding Method Number 2 4 1,000 SF 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
618.141 Seeding Method Number 3 4 1,000 SF 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
619.12 Cellulose Fiber Hydroseed Mulch 4 1,000 SF 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
619.13 Bark Mulch 10 CY 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
619.14 Erosion Control Mix 10 CY 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.014 Evergreen Trees 18”- 24” Group A 5 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.025 Evergreen Trees 3’- 4’ B&B Group A 5 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.026 Evergreen Trees 3’- 4’ B&B Group B 5 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.031 Evergreen Trees 4’- 5’ B&B Group A 5 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.032 Evergreen Trees 4’- 5’ B&B Group B 5 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.037 Evergreen Trees 5’- 6’ B&B Group A 3 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.038 Evergreen Trees 5’- 6’ B&B  Group B 3 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.039 Evergreen Trees 5’- 6’ B&B  Group C 3 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.043 Evergreen Trees 6’- 8’ B&B  Group A 3 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.044 Evergreen Trees 6’- 8’ B&B  Group B 3 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.046 Evergreen Trees 8’- 10’ B&B Group A 3 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.047 Evergreen Trees 8’- 10’ B&B Group B 3 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.052 Evergreen Trees 10’- 12’ B&B Group A 3 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.053 Evergreen Trees 10’- 12’ B&B Group B 3 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.1011 Woody Plant Plug 2” Pot 100 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.1012 Woody Plant Plug 2” Deep Pot 100 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.1014 Woody Plant Plug 3” Deep Pot 100 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.122 Small Decid Trees 5’- 6’ Multistem Group C 1 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.127 Small Decid Trees 6’- 8’ cont. Group B 3 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.184 Med Decid Trees 8’- 10’ Multistem B&B Group A 3 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.202 Med Decid Trees 2”- 2 ½” cal. B&B Group B 3 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.210 Lg. Decid  Trees 12"- 18"  cont. Group A 20 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.225 Lg. Decid  Trees 18"- 24"  cont. Group A 20 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.245 Lg. Decid  Trees 2’- 3’  cont. Group A 20 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.246 Lg. Decid  Trees 3’- 4’  cont. Group A 20 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.247 Lg. Decid  Trees 4’- 5’  cont. Group A 10 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.248 Lg. Decid  Trees 5’- 6’  cont. Group A 10 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.249 Lg. Decid  Trees 6’- 8’  cont. Group A 10 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
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621.255 Lg. Decid  Trees 8’- 10’ cont. or B&B Group A 10 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.267 Lg. Decid  Trees 1¾ ”- 2" cal. B&B Group A 5 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.273 Lg. Decid Trees 2"- 2½ ” cal. B&B Group A 5 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.279 Lg. Decid  Trees 2½"- 3” cal.  B&B Group A 5 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.285 Lg. Decid  Trees 3"- 3½” cal. B&B Group A 1 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.291 Lg. Decid  Trees 3½"- 4” cal. B&B Group A 1 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.297 Lg. Decid  Trees 4"- 4½” cal. B&B Group A 1 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.389 Evergreen Shrubs 15”- 18” cont. Group B 10 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.395 Evergreen Shrubs 18"- 24" cont. Group A 10 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.396 Evergreen Shrubs 18”- 24” cont. Group B 10 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.401 Evergreen Shrubs 2’- 2 ½’  cont. Group A 10 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.402 Evergreen Shrubs 2’- 2 ½’  cont. Group B 10 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.413 Evergreen Shrubs 3’- 3 1/2’ cont. Group A 10 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.486 Broadleaf Evergreens 18"- 24" cont. Group A 10 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.492 Broadleaf Evergreens 24"- 30" cont. Group A 10 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.498 Broadleaf Evergreens 30"- 36" cont. Group A 10 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.512 Decid Shrubs 15”- 18” cont. Group A 10 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.54 Decid Shrubs 18”- 24” cont. Group A 10 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.546 Decid Shrubs 2’- 3’ cont. Group A 10 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.552 Decid Shrubs 3’- 4’ cont. Group A 10 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.558 Decid Shrubs 4’- 5’ cont. or B&B Group A 10 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.559 Decid Shrubs 4’- 5’ cont. or B&B Group B 10 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.65 Vines 12"- 15" cont. Group A 3 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.661 Vines 18"- 24" cont. Group B 3 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.703 Herbaceous Plant Plug 2” Pot 100 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.704 Herbaceous Plant Plug 2” Deep Pot 100 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.706 Herbaceous Plant Plug 3” Deep Pot 100 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.71 Herbaceous Perennials 1 Gal. Group A    12 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.711 Herbaceous Perennials 1 Gal. Group B   12 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
621.713 Herbaceous Perennials & Groundcover 1 Qt. 12 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
629.05 Hand Labor, Straight Time 24 HR 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
631.08 Generator (Calendar Day) 1 CD 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
631.12 All-Purpose Excavator (Including Operator) 8 HR 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
631.122 Mini All-Purpose Excavator (Including Operator) 8 HR 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
631.133 Skid Steer (Including Operator) 8 HR 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
631.18 Chainsaw Rental (Including Operator) 1 HR 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
631.20 Stump Chipper (Including Operator) 1 HR 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
631.28 Brush Chipper (Including Operator) 1 HR 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
642.22 Granite Post 2 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
659.10  Mobilization (Lump Sum) 1 LS 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
890.02 Supplemental Landscape Materials 1 LS No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 Totals  
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