
 

 

          February 11, 2021 

          Subject: Task Order Landscaping & 

        Hydro-Seeding Services 

          State WIN: PH20210210TOL 

Location: Statewide  

        Amendment No. 1    

 

 

Dear Sir/Ms.: 

 

 

Please make the following changes to the Bid Documents: 

 

In the Bid Book: 

 

REMOVE pages 16 – 17, Schedule of Items, 2 pages, and REPLACE with the attached Schedule of 

Items, 2 pages, Revised February 10, 2021. 

 

 

Consider these changes and information prior to submitting your bid on March 3, 2021. 

 

 

 

      Sincerely, 

 

 

 

 

George M. A. Macdougall P.E. 

      Contracts & Specifications Engineer 

 

 



Region 4 

Total

Region 5

Unit Cost

621.273 Lg. Decid Trees 2 - 2½ ” cal B&B Gr A 6 Each

621.267 Lg. Decid  Trees 1¾ ”- 2 cal Gr A 3 Each

621.255 Lg. Decid  Trees 8’-10’ Gr A 3 Each

621.249 Lg. Decid  Trees 6’-8’  Gr A 3 Each

621.247 Lg. Decid  Trees 4’-5’  Gr A 3 Each

621.202 Med Decid Trees 2”-2 ½ ”cal B&B Gr B 3 Each

621.184 Med Decid Trees 8’-10’multi Gr A 3 Each

621.127 Small Decid Trees 6’- 8’ Gr B 6 Each

621.122 Small Decid Trees 5’- 6’multi Gr C 1 Each

621.101 Plug/starter plant 2”cont. 6” min. 50 Each

621.048 Evergreen Trees 8’- 10’ B&B Gr C 6 Each

621.047 Evergreen Trees 8’- 10’ B&B Gr B 6 Each

621.046 Evergreen Trees 8’- 10’ B&B Gr A 6 Each

621.045 Evergreen Trees 6’- 8’ B&B  Gr C 6 Each

621.044 Evergreen Trees 6’- 8’ B&B  Gr B 6 Each

621.043 Evergreen Trees 6’- 8’ B&B  Gr A 6 Each

621.039 Evergreen Trees 5’- 6’ B&B  Gr C 6 Each

621.038 Evergreen Trees 5’- 6’ B&B  Gr B 6 Each

621.037 Evergreen Trees 5’- 6’ B&B  Gr A 6 Each

621.032 Evergreen Trees 4’- 5’ B&B Gr B  6 Each

621.031 Evergreen Trees 4’- 5’ B&B Gr A 6 Each

621.026 Evergreen Trees 3’- 4’ B&B Gr B  6 Each

621.025 Evergreen Trees 3’- 4’ B&B Gr A  6 Each

621.014 Evergreen Trees 18” – 24” Gr A 24 Each

619.1401 Erosion Control Mulch 10 CY

619.1301 Bark Mulch 5 CY

619.1201 Cellulose Fiber Hydroseed Mulch 10 1,000 SF

618.1411 Seeding Method Number 3 5 1,000 SF

618.1401 Seeding Method Number 2 10 1,000 SF

618.1301 Seeding Method Number 1 10 1,000 SF

617.35 Compost 5 CY

616.08 Sod 100 SY

615.07 Loam 5 CY

613.319 Erosion Control Blanket 10 SY

609.11 Vertical Curb Type I 250 LF

411.131 6" Compacted stone dust gravel base 100 SF

304.09 Aggregate Base Course- crushed  Type A 3 CY
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Region 4 

Total

Region 5
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0.00 No Bid

Totals

No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00890.02 Supplemental Landscape Materials 1 LS No Bid 0.00

659.101 Mobilization (Lump Sum) 1 LS

642.19 Granite Post 2 Each

631.111 Hammer Drill  Rental 1 LS

631.2 Stump Grinder  Rental 1 LS

631.18 Chainsaw Rental 1 LS

631.133 Skid Steer/Bobcat and operator 8 HR

631.122 Mini-excavator and operator 8 HR

631.12 Excavator and operator 8 HR

631.08 Generator 1 LS

629.05 Hand Labor, Straight Time 24 HR

621.713 Perennials & Groundcovers 1 Quart cont. 24 Each

621.711 Perennials 1 gal. Group B 24 Each

621.71 Perennials & Groundcovers 1gal. Group A 24 Each

621.661 Vines 18" - 24"  Group C 1 Each

621.654 Vines 12" - 15"  Group A 1 Each

621.559 Decid Shrubs 4’-5’ Group B 10 Each

621.558 Decid Shrubs 4’-5’ Group A 10 Each

621.552 Decid Shrubs 3’-4’  Group A 10 Each

621.546 Decid Shrubs 2’-3’  Group A 10 Each

621.54 Decid Shrubs 18”-24”  Group A 10 Each

621.51 Decid Shrubs 15”-18” . Group A 10 Each

621.498 Broadleaf Evergreens 2½ ’-3’Gr A 10 Each

621.487 Broadleaf Evergreens 18"-24"Gr A 10 Each

621.404 Evergreen Shrubs 3’- 4’  Group C 10 Each

621.402 Evergreen Shrubs 2’- 2 ½’  cont. Gr B 10 Each

621.401 Evergreen Shrubs 2’- 2 ½’  Group A 10 Each

621.397 Evergreen Shrubs 18”- 24” Gr C 10 Each

621.396 Evergreen Shrubs 18" -24" Gr B 10 Each

621.389 Evergreen Shrubs 15”-18” cont. Gr B 10 Each

621.297 Lg. Decid  Trees 4 - 4½" cal B&B Gr A 1 Each

621.291 Lg. Decid Trees 3½ - 4” cal B&B Gr A 3 Each

621.285 Lg. Decid  Trees 3 - 3½" cal B&B Gr A 3 Each

621.279 Lg. Decid  Trees 2½ -3” cal  B&B Gr A 6 Each
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