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304.09 Aggregate Base Course - Crushed Type A 10 CY 50 500 50 500 50 500 30 500 50 500
411.131 Stone Dust Surface Course 200 SF 8 1600 8 1600 8 1600 8 1600 8 1600
609.11 Vertical Curb Typel 80 LF 60 4800 60 4800 60 4800 60 4800 60 4800
613319 Erosion Control Blanket 50 SY 7k 350 i 350 7 350 i 350 7 350
615.07 Loam 10 CY 66 660 66 660 66 660 66 660 66 660
617.35 Compost 10 Cx 70 700 70 700 70 700 70 700 70 700
618.13 Seeding Method Number 1 4 1,000 SF 40 160 40 160 40 160 40 160 40 160
618.14 Seeding Method Number 2 4 1,000 SF 40 160 40 160 40 160 40 160 40 160
618.141 Seeding Method Number 3 4 1,000 SF 50 200 50 200 50 200 50 200 50 200
619,12 Cellulose Fiber Hydroseed Mulch 4 1,000 SF 40 160 40 160 40 160 40 160 40 160
619.13 Bark Mulch 10 CY 66 660 66 660 66 660 66 660 66 660
619.14 Erosion Control Mix 10 CY 65 650 65 650 65 650 65 650 65 650
621.014 Evergreen Trees 187- 24” Group A 5 Each 50 250 50 250 50 250 50 250 50 250
621.025 Evergreen Trees 3°-4° B&B Group A 5 Each 150 750 150 750 150 750 150 750 150 750
621.026 Evergreen Trees 3°-4° B&B Group B 5 Each 160 800 160 800 160 800 160 800 160 800
621.031 Evergreen Trees 4’- 5° B&B Group A 5 Each 250 1250 250 1250 250 1250 250 1250 250 1250
621.032 Evergreen Trees 4’- 5° B&B Group B 5 Each 180 900 180 900 180 900 180 900 180 900
621.037 Evergreen Trees 5°- 6° B&B Group A 3 Each 240 720 240 720 240 720 240 720 240 720
621.038 Evergreen Trees 5°- 6° B&B Group B 3 Each 220 660 220 660 220 660 220 660 220 660
621.039 Evergreen Trees 5°- 6° B&B Group C 3 Each 340 1020 340 1020 340 1020 340 1020 340 1020
621.043 Evergreen Trees 6°- 8° B&B Group A 3 Each 300 900 300 900 300 900 300 900 300 900
621.044 Evergreen Trees 6°- 8’ B&B Group B 3 Each 300 900 300 900 300 900 300 900 300 900
621.046 Evergreen Trees §°- 10° B&B Group A 3 Each 650 1950 650 1950 650 1950 650 1950 650 1950
621.047 Evergreen Trees §’- 10 B&B Group B 3 Each 650 1950 650 1950 650 1950 650 1950 650 1950
621.052 Evergreen Trees 10°- 12° B&B Group A 3 Each 1100 3300 1100 3300 1100 3300 1100 3300 1100 3300
621,053 Evergreen Trees 10°- 12° B&B Group B 3 Each 1250 3750 1250 3750 1250 3750 1250 3750 1250 3750
621.1011 | Woody Plant Plug 2™ Pot 100 Each 10 1000 10 1000 10 1000 10 1000 10 1000
621.1012 | Woody Plant Plug 2" Deep Pot 100 Each 11 1100 11 1100 11 1100 11 1100 11 1100
621.1014 | Woody Plant Plug 3” Deep Pot 100 Each 13 1300 13 1300 13 1300 13 1300 13 1300
621.122 Small Decid Trees 5°- 6” Multistem Group C 1 Each 288 288 288 288 288 288 288 288 288 288
621.127 Small Decid Trees 6°- 8’ cont. Group B 3 Each 250 750 250 750 250 750 250 750 250 750
621.184 Med Decid Trees 8- 10’ Multistem B&B Group A | 3 Each 500 1500 500 1500 500 1500 500 1500 500 1500
621202 Med Decid Trees 27- 2 ¥ cal. B&B Group B 3 Each 300 900 300 900 300 900 300 900 300 900
621.210 Lg. Decid Trees 12"- 18" cont. Group A 20 Each 45 900 45 900 45 900 45 900 45 900
621.225 Lg. Decid Trees 18"- 24" cont. Group A 20 Each 45 900 45 900 45 900 45 900 45 900
621.245 Lg. Decid Trees 2°-3° cont. Group A 20 Each 75 1500 75 1500 7 1500 75 1500 75 1500
621.246 Le. Decid Trees 3°-4° cont. Group A 20 Each 100 2000 100 2000 100 2000 100 2000 100 2000
621.247 Lg. Decid Trees 4°- 5 cont. Group A 10 Each 125 1250 125 1250 125 1250 125 1250 125 1250
621248 Lg. Decid Trees 5°-6° cont. Group A 10 Each 175 1750 175 1750 175 1750 175 1750 175 1750
621.249 Lg. Decid Trees 6’- 8" cont. Group A 10 Each 249 2490 249 2490 249 2490 249 2490 249 2490
621.255 Lg. Decid Trees 8- 10" cont. or B&B Group A 10 Each 350 3500 350 3500 350 3500 350 3500 350 3500
621267 Lg. Decid Trees 134 "-2" cal. B&B Group A 5 Each 410 2050 410 2050 410 2050 410 2050 410 2050
621273 Lg. Decid Trees 2"-2'2 " cal. B&B Group A 5 Each 525 2625 525 2625 525 2625 525 2625 525 2625
621.279 Lg. Decid Trees 2!4"- 37 cal. B&B Group A 5 Each 675 3375 675 3375 675 3375 675 3375 675 3375
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621.285 Lg. Decid Trees 3"-3%" cal. B&B Group A 1 Each 850 850 850 850 850 850 850 850 850 850
621291 Le. Decid Trees 3%"-4" cal. B&B Group A 1 Each 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000
621297 L. Decid Trees 4"- 4%” cal. B&B Group A 1 Each 1100 1100 1100 1100 1100 1100 1100 1100 1100 1100
621.389 Everareen Shrubs 157- 18" cont. Group B 10 Each 110 1100 110 1100 110 1100 110 1100 110 1100
621.395 Evergreen Shrubs 18"- 24" cont. Group A 10 Each 110 1100 110 1100 110 1100 110 1100 110 1100
621.396 Everereen Shrubs 187-24" cont. Group B 10 Each 110 1100 110 1100 110 1100 110 1100 110 1100
621.401 Evergreen Shrubs 2°- 2 %' cont. Group A 10 Each 110 1100 110 1100 110 1100 110 1100 110 1100
621.402 Evergreen Shrubs 2°-2 1% cont, Group B 10 Each 110 1100 110 1100 110 1100 110 1100 110 1100
621413 Evergreen Shrubs 3°- 3 1/2” cont. Group A 10 Each 185 1850 185 1850 185 1850 185 1850 185 1850
621486 Broadleaf Evergreens 18"- 24" cont. Group A 10 Each 100 1000 100 1000 100 1000 100 1000 100 1000
621.492 Broadleaf Evergreens 24"- 30" cont. Group A 10 Each 150 1500 150 1500 150 1500 150 1500 150 1500
621.498 Broadleaf Evergreens 30"- 36" cont. Group A 10 Each 175 1750 175 1750 175 1750 175 1750 175 1750
621.512 Decid Shrubs 157- 18” cont. Group A 10 Each 55 550 55 550 55 550 35 550 55 550
621.54 Decid Shrubs 187- 247 cont. Group A 10 Each 75 750 75 750 75 750 75 750 73 750
621.546 Decid Shrubs 2°- 37 cont. Group A 10 Each 90 900 90 900 90 900 90 900 90 900
621.552 Decid Shrubs 3°- 4’ cont. Group A 10 Each 150 1500 150 1500 150 1500 150 1500 150 1500
621.558 Decid Shrubs 4°- 5’ cont. or B&B Group A 10 Each 200 2000 200 2000 200 2000 200 2000 200 2000
621.559 Decid Shrubs 4°- 57 cont. or B&B Group B 10 Each 200 2000 200 2000 200 2000 200 2000 200 2000
621.65 Vines 12"- 15" cont. Group A 3 Each 45 135 45 135 45 135 45 135 45 135
6521.661 Vines 18"-24" cont. Group B 3 Each 50 150 50 150 50 150 50 150 50 150
621.703 Herbaceous Plant Plug 2” Pot 100 Each 8 800 8 800 8 800 8 800 8 800
621.704 Herbaceous Plant Plug 2” Deep Pot 100 Each 8 800 8 800 8 800 800 8 800
621.706 Herbaceous Plant Plug 3” Deep Pot 100 Each 8 800 8 800 8 800 800 8 800
621.71 Herbaceous Perennials 1 Gal. Group A 12 Each 25 300 20 300 25 300 25 300 25 300
621.711 Herbaceous Perennials 1 Gal. Group B 12 Each 23 276 23 276 23 276 23 276 23 276
621.713 Herbaceous Perennials & Groundcover 1 Qf. 12 Each 22 264 22 264 22 264 22 264 22 264
629.05 Hand Labor, Straight Time 24 HR 53 1320 55 1320 ) 1320 55 1320 35 1320
631.08 Generator (Calendar Day) 1 CD 150 150 150 150 150 150 150 150 150 150
631.12 All-Purpose Excavator (Including Operator) 8 HR 185 1480 185 1480 185 1480 185 1480 185 1480
631.122 Mini All-Purpose Excavator (Including Operator) 8 HR 120 960 120 960 120 960 120 960 120 960
631.133 Skid Steer (Including Operator) 8 HR 115 920 115 920 115 920 115 920 115 920
631.18 Chainsaw Rental (Including Operator) 1 HR 80 80 80 80 80 80 80 80 80 80

631.20 Stump Chipper (Including Operator) 1 HR 95 95 95 95 95 95 95 95 95 95

631.28 Brush Chipper (Including Operator) 1 HR 95 95 95 95 95 95 95 95 95 95

64222 Granite Post 2 Each 300 600 300 600 300 600 300 600 300 600
659.10 Mobilization (Lump Sum) 1 LS 1100 1100 1100 1100 1000 1000 1000 1000 1500 1500
890.02 Supplemental Landscape Materials 1 LS No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00

Totals 91,453.00 91,453.00 91,353.00 91,353.00 91,853.00
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304.09 Aggregate Base Course - Crushed Type A 10 CY 54 540 54 540 56 56 0 56 56 560
411.131 Stone Dust Surface Course 200 SF 75 1500 75 1500 8 1600 8 1600 8 1600
609.11 Vertical Curb Type | 80 LF 70 5600 70 5600 74 5920 74 5920 74 5920
613.319 Erosion Control Blanket 50 SY 8 400 8 400 8 400 8 400 8 400
615.07 Loam 10 CY 66 660 66 660 71 710 66 660 71 710
617.35 Compost 10 CY 66 660 66 660 71 710 66 660 71 710
618.13 Seeding Method Number 1 4 1,000 SF 65 260 65 260 65 260 65 260 65 260
618.14 Seeding Method Number 2 4 1.000 SF 67 268 67 268 70 280 70 280 70 280
618.141 Seeding Method Number 3 4 1,000 SF 76 304 76 304 82 328 82 328 82 328
619.12 Cellulose Fiber Hydroseed Mulch 4 1,000 SF 54 216 54 216 54 216 54 216 54 216
619.13 Bark Mulch 10 CYy 68 680 68 680 74 740 72 720 74 740
619.14 Erosion Control Mix 10 €Y 66 660 66 660 70 700 70 700 70 700
621.014  |Evergreen Trees 187- 24” Group A 5 Each 53 265 53 265 53 265 53 265 32 265
621.025 Evergreen Trees 3°-4° B&B Group A 5 Each 143 715 143 715 143 715 143 715 143 715
621.026 Evergreen Trees 3°- 4’ B&B Group B 5 Each 145 725 145 725 149 745 149 745 149 745
621.031 Evergreen Trees 4°- 57 B&B Group A 5 Each 245 1225 245 1225 245 1225 245 1225 245 1225
621.032 Evergreen Trees 4'- 5” B&B Group B 5 Each 223 1115 223 1115 223 1115 223 1115 223 1115
621.037 Evergreen Trees 5°- 6” B&B Group A 3 Each 255 765 255 765 265 795 265 795 265 795
621.038 Evergreen Trees 5’- 6° B&B Group B 3 Each 264 792 264 792 268| 804 268 804 268 804
621.039 Evergreen Trees 5°- 6 B&B Group C 3 Each 365 1095 365 1095 380 1140 380 1140 380 1140
621.043 Evergreen Trees 6'- 8 B&B Group A 3 Each 353 1059 353 1059 358 1074 333 1059 358 1074
621.044 Evergreen Trees 6'- 8” B&B Group B 3 Each 370 1110 370 1110 380 1140 380 1140 390 1170
621.046 Eversreen Trees 8- 10° B&B Group A 3 Each 535 1605 535 1605 545 1635 535 1605 550 1650
621.047 Evergreen Trees §'- 10° B&B Group B 3 Each 696 2088 695 2085 715 2145 700 2100 715 2145
621.052 Evergreen Trees 10’- 12° B&B Group A 3 Each 900 2700 900 2700 930 2790 930 2790 930 2790
621.053 Evergreen Trees 10°- 12° B&B Group B 3 Each 980 2940 980 2940 1010 3030 1010 3030 1010 3030
621.1011  |Woody Plant Plug 2” Pot 100 Each 10.5 1050 10.5 1050 10.5 1050 10.5 1050 10.5 1050
621.1012  |Woody Plant Plug 2 Deep Pot 100 Each 10.5 1050 10.5 1050 10.5 1050 10.5 1050 10.5 1050
621.1014  |Woody Plant Plug 3" Deep Pot 100 Each 11 1100 11 1100 13 1300 13 1300 13 1300
621.122 Small Decid Trees 5°- 6° Multistem Group C 1 Each 312 312 312 312 320 320 312 312 328 328
621.127 Small Decid Trees 6°- 8 cont. Group B 3 Each 242 726 242 726 250 750 250 750 255 765
621.184  |Med Decid Trees 8- 10° Multistem B&B Group A | 3 Each 549 1647 549 1647 555 1665 555 1665 555 1665
621.202 Med Decid Trees 27~ 2 4" cal. B&B Group B 3 Each 552 1656 552 1656 552 1656 552 1656 552 1656
621.210 Le. Decid Trees 12"- 18" cont. Group A 20 Each 23 460 25 460 23 460 23 460 23 460
621.225 Lg. Decid Trees 18"- 24" cont. Group A 20 Each 25 500 25 500 27 540 26 520 27 540
621.245 Lg, Decid Trees 2°-3° cont. Group A 20 Each 33 660 33 660 33 660 33 660 33 660
621246  |Lg. Decid Trees3’-4" cont. Group A 20 Each 58 1160 58 1160 62 1240 60 1200 63 1260
621.247 Lg. Decid Trees 4’-5° cont. Group A 10 Each 130 1300 130 1300 135 1350 135 1350 135 1350
621.248 Lg. Decid Trees 5°-6° cont. Group A 10 Each 135 1350 135 1350 135 1350 135 1350 135 1350
621.249 Lg. Decid Trees 6’- 87 cont. Group A 10 Each 213 2130 215 2150 223 2230 223 2230 223 2230
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621.255 Lg. Decid Trees 8'- 10° cont. or B&B Group A 10 Each 295 2950 295 2950 305 3050 300 3000 305 3050
621.267 Lg. Decid Trees 1% - 2" cal. B&B Group A 5 Each 445 2225 445 2225 450 2250 445 2225 450 2250
621.273 Lg. Decid Trees 2"'- 2% ” cal. B&B Group A 5 Each 557 2785 557 2785 565 2825 565 2825 565 2825
621.279 Lg. Decid Trees 244"-3” cal. B&B Group A 5 Each 625 3125 625 3125 635 3175 635 3175 635 3175
621.285 Lg. Decid Trees 3"- 3% cal. B&B Group A 1 Each 875 875 875 875 890 890 890 890 890 890
621.291 Lg. Decid Trees 3/4"- 47 cal. B&B Group A 1 Each 953 953 953 953 965 965 965 965 965 965
621.297 Le. Decid Trees 4"- 412" cal. B&B Group A 1 Each 1390 1390 1390 1390 1400 1400 1400 1400 1400 1400
621.389 Evergreen Shrubs 157- 18” cont. Group B 10 Each 63 630 63 630 67 670 67 670 67 670
621.395 Evergreen Shrubs 18"- 24" cont. Group A 10 Each 72 720 72 720 74 740 T2 720 74 740
621.396  |Evergreen Shrubs 18”- 24" cont. Group B 10 Each 82 820 82 820 85 850 85 850 85 850
621.401 Evergreen Shrubs 2°- 2 4" cont. Group A 10 Each 85 850 85 850 85 850 85 850 85 850
621.402 Evergreen Shrubs 2’- 2 14 cont. Group B 10 Each 104 1040 104 1040 112 1120 112 1120 112 1120
621.413 Everereen Shrubs 3°- 3 1/2” cont. Group A 10 Each 242 2420 242 2420 242 2420 242 2420 242 2420
621.436 Broadleaf Evergreens 18"- 24" cont. Group A 10 Each 102 1020 102 1020 102 1020 102 1020 102 1020
621.492 Broadleaf Evergreens 24"- 30" cont. Group A 10 Each 136 1360 136 1360 142 1420 142 1420 142 1420
621.498 Broadleaf Evergreens 30"- 36" cont. Group A 10 Each 173 1730 173 1730 185 1850 180 1800 185 1850
621512  IDecid Shrubs 157- 18" cont. Group A 10 Each 56 560 56 560 58 580 58 580 58 580
621.54 Decid Shrubs 187- 247 cont. Group A 10 Each 63 630 63 630 63 630 63 630 63 630
621.546 Decid Shrubs 2°- 3’ cont. Group A 10 Each 74 740 74 740 78 780 74 740 74 740
621.552 Decid Shrubs 3’- 4° cont. Group A 10 Each 116 1160 116 1160 116 1160 116 1160 116 1160
621.558 Decid Shrubs 4°- 5” cont. or B&B Group A 10 Each 188 1880 188 1880 195 1950 195 1950 195 1950
621559  [Decid Shrubs 4°- 5 cont. or B&B Group B 10 Each 203 2030 203 2030 215 2150 203 2030 215 2150
621.65 Vines 12"- 15" cont. Group A 3 Each 35 105 35 105 35 105 35 105 35 105
621.661 Vines 18"- 24" cont. Group B 3 Each 58 174 58 174 61 183 61 183 61 183
621.703 Herbaceous Plant Plug 2" Pot 100 Each 6.5 650 6.5 650 6.5 650 6.5 650 6.5 650
621.704 Herbaceous Plant Plug 2™ Deep Pot 100 Each 7 700 ¢l 700 7 700 7 700 7 700
621.706  |Herbaceous Plant Plug 3" Deep Pot 100 Each 9 900 9 900 9 900 9 900 9 900
621.71 |Herbaceous Perennials 1 Gal. Group A 12 Each 22 264 22 264 22 264 22 264 22 264
621.711 IHerbaceous Perennials 1 Gal. Group B 12 Each 23 276 23 276 24 288 24 288 24 288
621.713  |Herbaceous Perennials & Groundcover 1 Qt 12 Each 18 216 13 216 19 228 18 216 19 228
629.05 Hand Labor, Straight Time 24 HR 60 1440 60 1440 60 1440 60 1440 60 1440
631.08 Generator (Calendar Day) 1 CD 140 140 140 140 140 140 140 140 140 140
631.12 All-Purpose Excavator (Including Operator) 8 HR 190 1520 190 1520 190 1520 190 1520 190 1520
631.122 Mini All-Purpose Excavator (Including Operator) 8 HR 135 1080 135 1080 140 1120 140 1120 140 1120
631.133 Skid Steer (Including Operator) 8 HR 135 1080 135 1080 135 1080 135 1080 135 1080
631.18 Chainsaw Rental (Including Operator) 1 HR 105 105 105 105 105 105 105 105 105 1035
631.20 Stump Chipper (Including Operator) 1 HR 162 162 162 162 172 172 172 172 172 172
631.28 Brush Chipper (Including Operator) 1 HR 205 205 203 205 205 205 205 205 203 205
642.22 Granite Post 2 Each 235 470 235 470 245 490 245 490 245 490
659.10 Mobilization (Lump Sum) 1 LS 950 950 950 950 1700 1700 1600 1600 2000 2000
1890.02 Supplemental Landscape Materials 1 LS No Bid 0.00 Ne Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00
Totals 87,378.00 87,395.00 90,194.00 $9,499.00 91,046.00
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304.09 Ageregate Base Course - Crushed Type A 10 cY 50 500 50 500 50 500 50 500 50 500
411.131 Stone Dust Surface Course 200 SF 20 4000 20 4000 20 4000 20 4000 20 4000
609.11 Vertical Curb Type | 80 LF 50 4000 50 4000 50 4000 50 4000 50 4000
613319 Erosion Conirol Blanket 50 SY 30 1500 30 1500 30 1500 30 1500 30 1500
615.07 Loam 10 CY 65 650 65 650 65 650 65 650 63 650
617.35 Compost 10 Y 70 700 70 700 70 700 70 700 70 700
618.13 Seeding Method Number 1 4 1,000 SF 40 160 40 160 40 160 40 160 40 160
618.14 Seeding Method Number 2 4 1,000 SF 40 160 40 160 40 160 40 160 40 160
618.141 Seeding Method Number 3 4 1.000 SF 50 200 50 200 50 200 50 200 50 200
619.12 Cellulose Fiber Hydroseed Mulch 4 1,000 SF 40 160 40 160 40 160 40 160 40 160
619.13 Bark Mulch 10 CYy 70 700 70 700 70 700 70 700 70 700
619.14 Erosion Control Mix 10 CcY 70 700 70 700 70 700 70 700 70 700
621.014 Evergreen Trees 187- 247 Group A S Each 166.25 831.25 166.25 831.25 166.25 831.25 166.25 831.25 166.25 831.25
621.025 Evergreen Trees 3°- 4" B&B Group A 5 Each 218.75 1093.75 218.75 1093.75 218.75 1093.75 218.75 1093.75 218.75 1093.75
621.026 Evergreen Trees 3°- 4° B&B Group B 5 Each 218.75 1093.75 218.75 1093.75 218.75 1093.75 218.75 1093.75 218.75 1093.75
621.031 Evergreen Trees 4°- 5° B&B Group A 5 Each 393.75 1968.75 393.75 1968.75 393.75 1968.75 393.75 1968.75 393.75 1968.75
621.032 Evergreen Trees 4’- 5° B&B Group B 5 Each 393.75 1968.75 393.75 1968.75 393.75 1968.75 393.75 1968.75 393.75 1968.75
621.037 Evergreen Trees 5°- 6° B&B Group A 3 Each 568.75 1706.25 568.75 1706.25 568.75 1706.25 568.75 1706.25 568.75 1706.25
621.038 Evergreen Trees 5°- 6° B&B Group B 3 Each 568.75 1706.25 568.75 1706.25 568.75 1706.25 568.75 1706.25 568.75 1706.25
621.039 Everereen Trees 5°- 6’ B&B Group C 3 Each 656.25 1968.75 656.25 1968.75 656.25 1968.75 656.25 1968.75 656.25 1968.75
621.043 Evergreen Trees 6'- 8§ B&B Group A 3 Each 778.75 2336.25 778.75 2336.25 778.75 2336.25 778.75 2336.25 778.75 2336.25
621.044 Evergreen Trees 6°- 8" B&B Group B 3 Each 778.75 2336.25 778.75 2336.25 778.75 2336.25 778.75 2336.25 778.75 2336.25
621.046 Evergreen Trees 8°- 10° B&B Group A 3 Each 1216.25 | 3648.75 121625 | 3648.75 121625 | 3648.75 121625 | 3648.75 1216.25 | 3648.75
621.047 Evergreen Trees 8'- 10° B&B Group B 3 Each 1216.25 | 3648.75 1216.25 | 3648.75 1216.25 | 3648.75 1216.25 | 3648.75 1216.25 | 3648.75
621.052 Evergreen Trees 10°- 12° B&B Group A 3 Each 1662.5 4987.5 1662.5 4987.5 1662.5 4987.5 1662.5 4987.5 1662.5 4987.5
621.053 Evergreen Trees 10°- 12° B&B Group B 3 Each 1662.5 4987.5 1662.5 4987.5 1662.5 4987.5 1662.5 4987.5 1662.5 4987.5
621.1011  |Woody Plant Plug 2" Pot 100 Each 937 937 9.37 937 9.37 937 9.37 937 9.37 937
621.1012  |Woody Plant Plug 2" Deep Pot 100 Each 11.87 1187 11.87 1187 11.87 1187 11.87 1187 11.87 1187
621.1014  |Woody Plant Plug 3" Deep Pot 100 Each 1312 1312 13.12 1312 13.12 1312 13.12 1312 13.12 1312
621.122 Small Decid Trees 5°- 6° Multistem Group C 1 Each 341.25 341.25 341.25 341.25 341.25 341.25 341.25 341.25 341.25 341.25
621.127 Small Decid Trees 6'- 8 cont. Group B 3 Each 341.25 1023.75 34125 1023.75 341.25 1023.75 341.25 1023.75 341.25 1023.75
621.184 Med Decid Trees 8- 10° Multistem B&B Group A | 3 Each 1006.25 | 3018.75 1006.25 | 3018.75 1006.25 | 3018.75 1006.25 | 3018.75 1006.25 | 3018.75
621.202 Med Decid Trees 27- 2 V4" cal. B&B Group B 3 Each 787.5 2362.5 787.5 2362.5 787.5 2362.5 787.5 2362.5 787.5 2362.5
621.210 Lg. Decid Trees 12"- 18" cont. Group A 20 Each 166.25 3325 166.25 3325 166.25 3325 166.25 3325 166.235 3325
621225 Lg. Decid Trees 18"- 24" cont. Group A 20 Each 166.25 3325 166.25 3325 166.25 3325 166.25 3305 166.25 3325
621.245 Lg. Decid Trees2°- 3" cont. Group A 20 Each 166.25 3325 166.25 3325 166.25 3325 166.25 3325 166.25 3325
621.246 Le. Decid Trees 3'-4" cont. Group A 20 Each 166.25 3325 166.25 3325 166.25 3325 166.25 3325 166.25 3325
621.247 L. Decid Trees4’-5° cont. Group A 10 Each 341.25 34125 341.25 34125 341.25 3412.5 341.25 3412.5 341.25 34125
621.248 Lg. Decid Trees 5°- 6 cont. Group A 10 Each 34125 3412.5 341.25 3412.5 341.25 3412.5 341.25 3412.5 341.25 34125
621.249 Lg. Decid Trees 6'- 8 cont. Group A 10 Each 341.25 34125 341.25 3412.5 341.25 34125 341.25 34125 341.25 34125
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621.233 Lg. Decid Trees 8°- 10° cont. or B&B Group A 10 Each 516.25 5162.5 516.25 5162.5 516.25 5162.5 516.25 5162.5 516.25 5162.5
621.267 Lg. Decid Trees 1% "- 2" cal. B&B Group A 3 Each 726.25 3631.25 726.25 3631.25 726.25 3631.25 72625 3631.25 726.25 3631.25
621.273 Lg. Decid Trees 2"~ 214~ cal. B&B Group A 5 Each 787.5 3937.5 787.5 3937.5 787.5 3937.5 787.5 3937.5 787.5 3937.5
621.279 Lg. Decid Trees 214"- 3" cal. B&B Group A 5 Each 918.75 4593.75 918.75 4593.75 918.75 4593.75 918.75 459375 918.75 4593.75
621.285 Lg. Decid Trees 3"- 3%4" cal. B&B Group A 1 Each 1076.25 1076.25 1076.25 1076.25 1076.25 1076.25 1076.25 1076.25 1076.25 1076.25
621.291 Le Decid Trees 3%4"- 47 cal. B&B Group A 1 Each 142625 | 142625 § 142625 | 142625 | 142625 | 142625 | 142625 || 142625 | 142625 | 1426.25
621.297 Le. Decid Trees 4"- 4147 cal. B&B Group A 1 Each 1793.75 1793.75 1793.75 1793.75 1793.75 1793.75 1793.75 1793.75 1793.75 1793.75
621.389 Everareen Shrubs 15”- 18" cont. Group B 10 Each 06.22 962.2 96.22 962.2 96.22 962.2 96.22 962.2 96.22 962.2
621.395 Evergreen Shrubs 18"- 24" cont. Group A 10 Each 96.22 962.2 96.22 962.2 96.22 962.2 96.22 962.2 96.22 962.2
621.396 Evergreen Shrubs 18- 24 cont. Group B 10 Each 139.97 1399.7 139.97 1399.7 139.97 1399.7 139.97 1399.7 139.97 1399.7
621.401 Evergreen Shrubs 2°- 2 /4 cont. Group A 10 Each 262.5 2625 262.5 2625 262.5 2625 262.5 2625 262.5 2625
621.402 Evergreen Shrubs 2°-2 14’ cont. Group B 10 Each 262.5 2625 262.5 2625 262.5 2625 262.5 2625 262.5 2625
621.413 Evergreen Shrubs 3°- 3 1/2° cont. Group A 10 Each 4375 4375 437.5 4375 437.5 4375 437.5 4375 437.5 4375
621.486 Broadleaf Evergreens 18"- 24" cont. Group A 10 Each 96.22 962.2 96.22 962.2 96.22 962.2 96.22 962.2 96.22 962.2
621.492 Broadleaf Evergreens 24"- 30" cont. Group A 10 Each 253.75 2537.5 253:75 2537.5 259,73 2537.5 253,15 2537.5 253.73 2537.5
621498 |Broadleaf Everereens 30"- 36" cont, Group A 10 Each 39375 | 39375 § 39375 | 39375 | 39375 | 3937.5 | 39375 | 39375 | 393.75 | 39375
621512 Decid Shrubs 157- 187 cont. Group A 10 Each 87.47 874.7 87.47 874.7 87.47 874.7 87.47 874.7 8747 874.7
621.54 Decid Shrubs 18- 24" cont. Group A 10 Each 96.22 962.2 96.22 962.2 96.22 962.2 96.22 962.2 96.22 962.2
621.546 Decid Shrubs 2°- 3” cont. Group A 10 Each 148.75 1487.5 148.75 1487.5 148.75 1487.5 148.75 1487.5 148.75 1487.5
621.552 Decid Shrubs 3°- 4 cont. Group A 10 Each 166.25 1662.5 166.25 1662.5 166.25 1662.5 166.25 1662.5 166.25 1662.5
621.558 Decid Shrubs 4°- 57 cont. or B&B Group A 10 Each 437.5 4375 4375 4375 4375 4375 437.5 4375 4375 4375
621.559 Decid Shrubs 4°- 5° cont. or B&B Group B 10 Each 341.25 3412.5 341.25 3412.5 341.25 34125 341.25 3412.5 341.25 34125
621.65 Vines 12"- 15" cont. Group A 3 Each 79.97 239.91 79.97 239.91 79.97 239.91 79.97 239.91 79.97 239.91
621.661 Vines 18"- 24" cont. Group B 3 Each 139.97 41991 139.97 41991 139.97 419.91 139.97 41991 139.97 419.91
621.703 Herbaceous Plant Plug 27 Pot 100 Each 9.37 937 9.37 937 9.37 937 9.37 937 937 937
621.704 Herbaceous Plant Plug 2 Deep Pot 100 Each 937 937 937 937 9.37 937 9.37 937 937 937
621.706 Herbaceous Plant Plug 37 Deep Pot 100 Each 11.87 1187 11.87 1187 11.87 1187 11.87 1187 11.87 1187
621.71 Herbaceous Perennials 1 Gal. Group A 12 Each 39.97 479.64 39.97 479.64 39.97 479.64 39.97 479.64 39.97 479.64
621.711 Herbaceous Perennials 1 Gal, Group B 12 Each 49.97 599.64 49.97 599.64 49.97 599.64 49.97 599.64 49.97 599.64
621.713 Herbaceous Perennials & Groundcover 1 Qt. 12 Each 39.97 479.64 39.97 479.64 39.97 479.64 39.97 479.64 3997 479.64
629.05 Hand Labor, Straight Time 24 HR 50 1200 50 1200 50 1200 50 1200 50 1200
631.08 Generator (Calendar Day) 1 CD 200 200 200 200 200 200 200 200 200 200
631.12 All-Purpose Excavator (Including Operator) 8 HR 56.25 450 56.25 450 56.25 450 56.25 450 56.25 450
631.122 Mini All-Purpose Excavator (Including Operator) | 8 HR 56.25 450 56.25 450 56.25 450 56.25 450 56.25 450
631.133 Skid Steer (Including Operator) 8 HR 25 200 25 200 25 200 25 200 25 200
631.18 Chainsaw Rental (Including Operator) 1 HR 18.75 18.75 18.75 18.75 18.75 18.75 18.75 18.75 18.75 18.75
631.20 Stump Chipper (Including Operator) 1 HR 56.25 56.25 56.25 56.25 56.25 56.25 56.25 56.25 56.25 56.25
631.28 Brush Chipper (Including Operator) 1 HR 56.25 56.25 56.25 56.25 56.25 56.25 56.25 56.25 36.25 56.25
642.22 Granite Post 2 Each 250 500 250 500 250 500 250 500 250 500
659.10 Mobilization (Lump Sum) 1 LS 1500 1500 1500 1500 1500 1500 1500 1500 1300 1500
890.02 Supplemental Landscape Materials 1 LS No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00
Totals 146,125.19 146,125.19, 146,125.1 146,125.19 146,125.19




