
Region 1 - 2023
Schedule of Items / Item Description Unit price Region 1     

Total Unit price Region 1     
Total Unit price Region 1     

Total Unit price Region 1     
Total 

304.09 Aggregate Base Course- crushed  Type A 3 CY 48 144 50 150 60 180 68 204.00
411.131 6" Compacted stone dust gravel base 100 SF 6.5 650 6 600 25 2500 10 1,000.00
609.11 Vertical Curb Type I 50 LF 78 3900 59 2950 52.5 2625 60 3,000.00
613.319 Erosion Control Blanket 50 SY 7.5 375 6 300 31.5 1575 7 350.00
615.07 Loam 10 CY 66 660 60 600 75 750 70 700.00
616.08 Sod 100 SY 16.1 1610 14 1400 15.75 1575 18 1,800.00
617.35 Compost 10 CY 66 660 65 650 73.5 735 77 770.00
617.381 Erosion Control Mulch 10 CY 50 500 65 650 73.5 735 65 650.00
618.13 Seeding Method Number 1 10 1,000 SF 49 490 80 800 42.5 425 55 550.00
618.14 Seeding Method Number 2 10 1,000 SF 49 490 82 820 42.5 425 45 450.00
618.141 Seeding Method Number 3 10 1,000 SF 52 520 96 960 57.75 577.5 45 450.00
619.12 Mulch Cellulose Fiber Hydroseed Mulch 10 1,000 SF 49 490 48 480 42.5 425 45 450.00
619.13 Bark Mulch 10 CY 65 650 62 620 73.5 735 70 700.00
619.14 Erosion Control Mulch 10 CY 68 680 62 620 73.5 735 65 650.00
621.014 Evergreen Trees 18” – 24” Gr A 5 Each 55 275 43 215 20 100 50 250.00
621.025 Evergreen Trees 3’- 4’ B&B Gr A 5 Each 170 850 80 400 90 450 150 750.00
621.026 Evergreen Trees 3’- 4’ B&B Gr B 5 Each 150 750 83 415 90 450 140 700.00
621.031 Evergreen Trees 4’- 5’ B&B Gr A 5 Each 180 900 152 760 200 1000 300 1,500.00
621.032 Evergreen Trees 4’- 5’ B&B Gr B 5 Each 160 800 157 785 200 1000 160 800.00
621.037 Evergreen Trees 5’- 6’ B&B  Gr A 6 Each 200 1200 217 1302 350 2100 220 1,320.00
621.038 Evergreen Trees 5’- 6’ B&B  Gr B 6 Each 185 1110 217 1302 320 1920 220 1,320.00
621.039 Evergreen Trees 5’- 6’ B&B  Gr C 6 Each 170 1020 278 1668 400 2400 350 2,100.00
621.043 Evergreen Trees 6’- 8’ B&B  Gr A 6 Each 250 1500 274 1644 400 2400 300 1,800.00
621.044 Evergreen Trees 6’- 8’ B&B  Gr B 6 Each 215 1290 318 1908 500 3000 300 1,800.00
621.045 Evergreen Trees 6’- 8’ B&B  Gr C 6 Each 230 1380 330 1980 500 3000 400 2,400.00
621.046 Evergreen Trees 8’- 10’ B&B Gr A 3 Each 925 2775 525 1575 700 2100 1000 3,000.00
621.047 Evergreen Trees 8’- 10’ B&B Gr B 3 Each 845 2535 575 1725 825 2475 900 2,700.00
621.048 Evergreen Trees 8’- 10’ B&B Gr C 3 Each 785 2355 675 2025 950 2850 850 2,550.00
621.101 Plug/starter plant 2”cont. 6” min. 36 Each 20 720 8 288 6 216 11 396.00
621.122 Small Decid Trees 5’- 6’multistem clump  Gr C 1 Each 185 185 283 283 350 350 275 275.00
621.127 Small Decid Trees 6’- 8’ Gr B 3 Each 310 930 180 540 200 600 330 990.00
621.184 Med Decid Trees 8’-10’ Gr A 3 Each 500 1500 443 1329 550 1650 500 1,500.00
621.201 Med Decid Trees 2”-2 ½”cal B&B Gr A 3 Each 525 1575 485 1455 570 1710 600 1,800.00
621.247 Lg. Decid  Trees 4’-5’  Gr A 3 Each 150 450 91 273 110 330 180 540.00
621.249 Lg. Decid  Trees 6’-8’  Gr A 3 Each 250 750 183 549 200 600 250 750.00
621.255 Lg. Decid  Trees 8’-10’ Gr A 3 Each 330 990 265 795 330 990 400 1,200.00
621.267 Lg. Decid  Trees 1¾ ”- 2" cal Gr A 3 Each 390 1170 436 1308 410 1230 475 1,425.00
621.273 Lg. Decid Trees 2"-2½ ” cal B&B Gr A 3 Each 525 1575 417 1251 570 1710 550 1,650.00
621.279 Lg. Decid  Trees 2½" - 3” cal  B&B Gr A 3 Each 750 2250 576 1728 670 2010 675 2,025.00
621.285 Lg. Decid  Trees 3" - 3½” cal B&B Gr A 1 Each 950 950 676 676 850 850 800 800.00
621.291 Lg. Decid  Trees 3½" - 4” cal B&B Gr A 1 Each 1400 1400 805 805 1100 1100 1050 1,050.00
621.297 Lg. Decid  Trees 4"- 4½” cal B&B Gr A 1 Each 1500 1500 940 940 1200 1200 1050 1,050.00
621.389 Evergreen Shrubs 15”-18” cont. Gr B 10 Each 110 1100 59 590 50 500 100 1,000.00

LG Whitcomb Rosengren Landscaping, Inc. Peter A. Lyford, Inc A.D. Smith Trucking
Item No Qty. Unit



Region 1 - 2023
Schedule of Items / Item Description Unit price Region 1     

Total Unit price Region 1     
Total Unit price Region 1     

Total Unit price Region 1     
Total 

LG Whitcomb Rosengren Landscaping, Inc. Peter A. Lyford, Inc A.D. Smith Trucking
Item No Qty. Unit

621.395 Evergreen Shrubs 18" - 24" Gr A 10 Each 115 1150 66 660 60 600 120 1,200.00
621.396 Evergreen Shrubs 18”- 24” Gr B 10 Each 110 1100 69 690 60 600 125 1,250.00
621.401 Evergreen Shrubs 2’- 2 ½’  Group A 10 Each 100 1000 81 810 90 900 125 1,250.00
621.402 Evergreen Shrubs 2’- 2 ½’  cont. Gr B 10 Each 95 950 94 940 120 1200 110 1,100.00
621.413 Evergreen Shrubs 3’- 3 1/2’  Group A 10 Each 180 1800 253 2530 190 1900 180 1,800.00
621.486 Broadleaf Evergreens 18"-24"Gr A 10 Each 150 1500 88 880 90 900 120 1,200.00
621.492 Broadleaf Evergreens 2'-2 1/2' Gr A 10 Each 225 2250 110 1100 130 1300 250 2,500.00
621.498 Broadleaf Evergreens 2½ ’-3’Gr A 10 Each 240 2400 167 1670 200 2000 278 2,780.00
621.512 Decid Shrubs 15”-18” . Group A 10 Each 75 750 51 510 36 360 80 800.00
621.54 Decid Shrubs 18”-24”  Group A 10 Each 75 750 57 570 40 400 85 850.00
621.546 Decid Shrubs 2’-3’  Group A 10 Each 100 1000 67 670 60 600 125 1,250.00
621.552 Decid Shrubs 3’-4’  Group A 10 Each 125 1250 111 1110 150 1500 150 1,500.00
621.558 Decid Shrubs 4’-5’ Group A 10 Each 170 1700 150 1500 200 2000 200 2,000.00
621.65 Vines 12" - 15"  Group A 3 Each 50 150 44 132 44 132 35 105.00
621.66 Vines 18" - 24"  Group B 3 Each 60 180 60 180 60 180 42 126.00
621.71 Perennials & Groundcovers 1gal. Group A    12 Each 25 300 20 240 12.5 150 25 300.00
621.711 Perennials 1 gal. Group B   12 Each 25 300 22 264 16 192 25 300.00
621.713 Perennials & Groundcovers 1 Quart cont. 12 Each 25 300 19 228 10 120 22 264.00
629.05 Hand Labor, Straight Time 24 HR 60 1440 55 1320 52.5 1260 55 1,320.00
631.08 Generator 1 LS 150 150 132 132 275 275 100 100.00
631.12 Excavator and operator 8 HR 130 1040 160 1280 575 4600 165 1,320.00
631.122 Mini-excavator and operator 8 HR 120 960 110 880 500 4000 125 1,000.00
631.133 Skid Steer/Bobcat and operator 8 HR 105 840 110 880 250 2000 100 800.00
631.18 Chainsaw Rental 1 LS 1 1 190 190 200 200 125 125.00
631.2 Stump Grinder  Rental 1 LS 400 400 400 400 500 500 400 400.00
631.111 Hammer Drill  Rental 1 LS 1 1 180 180 200 200 180 180.00
642.2 Granite Post 2 Each 750 1500 325 650 300 600 400 800.00
659.10  Mobilization (Lump Sum) 1 LS 2500 2500 950 950 2000 2000 1000 1,000.00
890.02 Supplemental Landscape Materials 1 LS No Bid 0 No Bid 0 No Bid 0 No Bid 0

75,266.00 63,660.00 84,957.50 78,785.00

s

 Totals  



Region 2 - 2023
Schedule of Items / Item Description Unit price Region 2      

Total Unit price Region 2      
Total Unit price Region 2      

Total Unit price Region 2      
Total 

304.09 Aggregate Base Course- crushed  Type A 3 CY 48 144 50 150 60 180 68 204.00
411.131 6" Compacted stone dust gravel base 100 SF 6.5 650 6 600 25 2500 10 1,000.00
609.11 Vertical Curb Type I 50 LF 78 3900 59 2950 52.5 2625 60 3,000.00
613.319 Erosion Control Blanket 50 SY 7.5 375 6 300 31.5 1575 7 350.00
615.07 Loam 10 CY 66 660 60 600 75 750 70 700.00
616.08 Sod 100 SY 16.1 1610 14 1400 15.75 1575 18 1,800.00
617.35 Compost 10 CY 66 660 65 650 73.5 735 77 770.00
617.381 Erosion Control Mulch 10 CY 50 500 65 650 73.5 735 65 650.00
618.13 Seeding Method Number 1 10 1,000 SF 49 490 80 800 42.5 425 55 550.00
618.14 Seeding Method Number 2 10 1,000 SF 49 490 82 820 42.5 425 45 450.00
618.141 Seeding Method Number 3 10 1,000 SF 52 520 96 960 57.75 577.5 45 450.00
619.12 Mulch Cellulose Fiber Hydroseed Mulch 10 1,000 SF 49 490 48 480 42.5 425 45 450.00
619.13 Bark Mulch 10 CY 65 650 62 620 73.5 735 70 700.00
619.14 Erosion Control Mulch 10 CY 68 680 62 620 73.5 735 65 650.00
621.014 Evergreen Trees 18” – 24” Gr A 5 Each 55 275 43 215 20 100 50 250.00
621.025 Evergreen Trees 3’- 4’ B&B Gr A 5 Each 170 850 80 400 90 450 150 750.00
621.026 Evergreen Trees 3’- 4’ B&B Gr B 5 Each 150 750 83 415 90 450 140 700.00
621.031 Evergreen Trees 4’- 5’ B&B Gr A 5 Each 180 900 152 760 200 1000 300 1,500.00
621.032 Evergreen Trees 4’- 5’ B&B Gr B 5 Each 160 800 157 785 200 1000 160 800.00
621.037 Evergreen Trees 5’- 6’ B&B  Gr A 6 Each 200 1200 217 1302 350 2100 220 1,320.00
621.038 Evergreen Trees 5’- 6’ B&B  Gr B 6 Each 185 1110 217 1302 320 1920 220 1,320.00
621.039 Evergreen Trees 5’- 6’ B&B  Gr C 6 Each 170 1020 278 1668 400 2400 350 2,100.00
621.043 Evergreen Trees 6’- 8’ B&B  Gr A 6 Each 250 1500 274 1644 400 2400 300 1,800.00
621.044 Evergreen Trees 6’- 8’ B&B  Gr B 6 Each 215 1290 318 1908 500 3000 300 1,800.00
621.045 Evergreen Trees 6’- 8’ B&B  Gr C 6 Each 230 1380 330 1980 500 3000 400 2,400.00
621.046 Evergreen Trees 8’- 10’ B&B Gr A 3 Each 925 2775 525 1575 700 2100 1000 3,000.00
621.047 Evergreen Trees 8’- 10’ B&B Gr B 3 Each 845 2535 575 1725 825 2475 900 2,700.00
621.048 Evergreen Trees 8’- 10’ B&B Gr C 3 Each 785 2355 675 2025 950 2850 850 2,550.00
621.101 Plug/starter plant 2”cont. 6” min. 36 Each 20 720 8 288 6 216 11 396.00
621.122 Small Decid Trees 5’- 6’multistem clump  Gr C 1 Each 185 185 283 283 350 350 275 275.00
621.127 Small Decid Trees 6’- 8’ Gr B 3 Each 310 930 180 540 200 600 330 990.00
621.184 Med Decid Trees 8’-10’ Gr A 3 Each 500 1500 443 1329 550 1650 500 1,500.00
621.201 Med Decid Trees 2”-2 ½”cal B&B Gr A 3 Each 525 1575 485 1455 570 1710 600 1,800.00
621.247 Lg. Decid  Trees 4’-5’  Gr A 3 Each 150 450 91 273 110 330 180 540.00
621.249 Lg. Decid  Trees 6’-8’  Gr A 3 Each 250 750 183 549 200 600 250 750.00
621.255 Lg. Decid  Trees 8’-10’ Gr A 3 Each 330 990 265 795 330 990 400 1,200.00
621.267 Lg. Decid  Trees 1¾ ”- 2" cal Gr A 3 Each 390 1170 436 1308 410 1230 475 1,425.00
621.273 Lg. Decid Trees 2"-2½ ” cal B&B Gr A 3 Each 525 1575 417 1251 570 1710 550 1,650.00
621.279 Lg. Decid  Trees 2½" - 3” cal  B&B Gr A 3 Each 750 2250 576 1728 670 2010 675 2,025.00
621.285 Lg. Decid  Trees 3" - 3½” cal B&B Gr A 1 Each 950 950 676 676 850 850 800 800.00
621.291 Lg. Decid  Trees 3½" - 4” cal B&B Gr A 1 Each 1400 1400 805 805 1100 1100 1050 1,050.00
621.297 Lg. Decid  Trees 4"- 4½” cal B&B Gr A 1 Each 1500 1500 940 940 1200 1200 1050 1,050.00
621.389 Evergreen Shrubs 15”-18” cont. Gr B 10 Each 110 1100 59 590 50 500 100 1,000.00

LG Whitcomb Rosengren Landscaping, Inc. Peter A. Lyford, Inc A.D. Smith Trucking
Item No Qty. Unit



Region 2 - 2023
Schedule of Items / Item Description Unit price Region 2      

Total Unit price Region 2      
Total Unit price Region 2      

Total Unit price Region 2      
Total 

LG Whitcomb Rosengren Landscaping, Inc. Peter A. Lyford, Inc A.D. Smith Trucking
Item No Qty. Unit

621.395 Evergreen Shrubs 18" - 24" Gr A 10 Each 115 1150 66 660 60 600 120 1,200.00
621.396 Evergreen Shrubs 18”- 24” Gr B 10 Each 110 1100 69 690 60 600 125 1,250.00
621.401 Evergreen Shrubs 2’- 2 ½’  Group A 10 Each 100 1000 81 810 90 900 125 1,250.00
621.402 Evergreen Shrubs 2’- 2 ½’  cont. Gr B 10 Each 95 950 94 940 120 1200 110 1,100.00
621.413 Evergreen Shrubs 3’- 3 1/2’  Group A 10 Each 180 1800 253 2530 190 1900 180 1,800.00
621.486 Broadleaf Evergreens 18"-24"Gr A 10 Each 150 1500 88 880 90 900 120 1,200.00
621.492 Broadleaf Evergreens 2'-2 1/2' Gr A 10 Each 225 2250 110 1100 130 1300 250 2,500.00
621.498 Broadleaf Evergreens 2½ ’-3’Gr A 10 Each 240 2400 167 1670 200 2000 278 2,780.00
621.512 Decid Shrubs 15”-18” . Group A 10 Each 75 750 51 510 36 360 80 800.00
621.54 Decid Shrubs 18”-24”  Group A 10 Each 75 750 57 570 40 400 85 850.00
621.546 Decid Shrubs 2’-3’  Group A 10 Each 100 1000 67 670 60 600 125 1,250.00
621.552 Decid Shrubs 3’-4’  Group A 10 Each 125 1250 111 1110 150 1500 150 1,500.00
621.558 Decid Shrubs 4’-5’ Group A 10 Each 170 1700 150 1500 200 2000 200 2,000.00
621.65 Vines 12" - 15"  Group A 3 Each 50 150 44 132 44 132 35 105.00
621.66 Vines 18" - 24"  Group B 3 Each 60 180 60 180 60 180 42 126.00
621.71 Perennials & Groundcovers 1gal. Group A    12 Each 25 300 20 240 12.5 150 25 300.00
621.711 Perennials 1 gal. Group B   12 Each 25 300 22 264 16 192 25 300.00
621.713 Perennials & Groundcovers 1 Quart cont. 12 Each 25 300 19 228 10 120 22 264.00
629.05 Hand Labor, Straight Time 24 HR 60 1440 55 1320 52.5 1260 55 1,320.00
631.08 Generator 1 LS 150 150 132 132 275 275 100 100.00
631.12 Excavator and operator 8 HR 130 1040 160 1280 575 4600 165 1,320.00
631.122 Mini-excavator and operator 8 HR 120 960 110 880 500 4000 125 1,000.00
631.133 Skid Steer/Bobcat and operator 8 HR 105 840 110 880 250 2000 100 800.00
631.18 Chainsaw Rental 1 LS 1 1 190 190 200 200 125 125.00
631.2 Stump Grinder  Rental 1 LS 400 400 400 400 500 500 400 400.00
631.111 Hammer Drill  Rental 1 LS 1 1 180 180 200 200 180 180.00
642.2 Granite Post 2 Each 750 1500 325 650 300 600 400 800.00
659.10  Mobilization (Lump Sum) 1 LS 2200 2200 950 950 2000 2000 1000 1,000.00
890.02 Supplemental Landscape Materials 1 LS No Bid 0 No Bid 0 No Bid 0 No Bid 0

74,966.00  63,660.00 84,957.50 78,785.00 Totals  



Region 3 - 2023
Schedule of Items / Item Description Unit price Region 3     

Total Unit price Region 3     
Total Unit price Region 3     

Total Unit price Region 3     
Total 

304.09 Aggregate Base Course- crushed  Type A 3 CY 48 144 52 156 60 180 68 204.00
411.131 6" Compacted stone dust gravel base 100 SF 6.5 650 6 600 25 2500 10 1,000.00
609.11 Vertical Curb Type I 50 LF 78 3900 61 3050 52.5 2625 60 3,000.00
613.319 Erosion Control Blanket 50 SY 7.5 375 6 300 31.5 1575 7 350.00
615.07 Loam 10 CY 66 660 62 620 75 750 70 700.00
616.08 Sod 100 SY 16.1 1610 16 1600 15.75 1575 18 1,800.00
617.35 Compost 10 CY 66 660 66 660 73.5 735 77 770.00
617.381 Erosion Control Mulch 10 CY 50 500 66 660 73.5 735 65 650.00
618.13 Seeding Method Number 1 10 1,000 SF 49 490 85 850 42.5 425 55 550.00
618.14 Seeding Method Number 2 10 1,000 SF 49 490 87 870 42.5 425 45 450.00
618.141 Seeding Method Number 3 10 1,000 SF 52 520 98 980 57.75 577.5 45 450.00
619.12 Mulch Cellulose Fiber Hydroseed Mulch 10 1,000 SF 49 490 48 480 42.5 425 45 450.00
619.13 Bark Mulch 10 CY 65 650 63 630 73.5 735 70 700.00
619.14 Erosion Control Mulch 10 CY 68 680 63 630 73.5 735 65 650.00
621.014 Evergreen Trees 18” – 24” Gr A 5 Each 55 275 43 215 20 100 50 250.00
621.025 Evergreen Trees 3’- 4’ B&B Gr A 5 Each 170 850 80 400 90 450 150 750.00
621.026 Evergreen Trees 3’- 4’ B&B Gr B 5 Each 150 750 83 415 90 450 140 700.00
621.031 Evergreen Trees 4’- 5’ B&B Gr A 5 Each 180 900 152 760 200 1000 300 1,500.00
621.032 Evergreen Trees 4’- 5’ B&B Gr B 5 Each 160 800 157 785 200 1000 160 800.00
621.037 Evergreen Trees 5’- 6’ B&B  Gr A 6 Each 200 1200 220 1320 350 2100 220 1,320.00
621.038 Evergreen Trees 5’- 6’ B&B  Gr B 6 Each 185 1110 220 1320 320 1920 220 1,320.00
621.039 Evergreen Trees 5’- 6’ B&B  Gr C 6 Each 170 1020 288 1728 400 2400 350 2,100.00
621.043 Evergreen Trees 6’- 8’ B&B  Gr A 6 Each 250 1500 274 1644 400 2400 300 1,800.00
621.044 Evergreen Trees 6’- 8’ B&B  Gr B 6 Each 215 1290 318 1908 500 3000 300 1,800.00
621.045 Evergreen Trees 6’- 8’ B&B  Gr C 6 Each 230 1380 340 2040 500 3000 400 2,400.00
621.046 Evergreen Trees 8’- 10’ B&B Gr A 3 Each 925 2775 525 1575 700 2100 1000 3,000.00
621.047 Evergreen Trees 8’- 10’ B&B Gr B 3 Each 845 2535 575 1725 825 2475 900 2,700.00
621.048 Evergreen Trees 8’- 10’ B&B Gr C 3 Each 785 2355 675 2025 950 2850 850 2,550.00
621.101 Plug/starter plant 2”cont. 6” min. 36 Each 20 720 8 288 6 216 11 396.00
621.122 Small Decid Trees 5’- 6’multistem clump  Gr C 1 Each 185 185 283 283 350 350 275 275.00
621.127 Small Decid Trees 6’- 8’ Gr B 3 Each 310 930 180 540 200 600 330 990.00
621.184 Med Decid Trees 8’-10’ Gr A 3 Each 500 1500 443 1329 550 1650 500 1,500.00
621.201 Med Decid Trees 2”-2 ½”cal B&B Gr A 3 Each 525 1575 490 1470 570 1710 600 1,800.00
621.247 Lg. Decid  Trees 4’-5’  Gr A 3 Each 150 450 91 273 110 330 180 540.00
621.249 Lg. Decid  Trees 6’-8’  Gr A 3 Each 250 750 187 561 200 600 250 750.00
621.255 Lg. Decid  Trees 8’-10’ Gr A 3 Each 330 990 265 795 330 990 400 1,200.00
621.267 Lg. Decid  Trees 1¾ ”- 2" cal Gr A 3 Each 390 1170 436 1308 410 1230 475 1,425.00
621.273 Lg. Decid Trees 2"-2½ ” cal B&B Gr A 3 Each 525 1575 417 1251 570 1710 550 1,650.00
621.279 Lg. Decid  Trees 2½" - 3” cal  B&B Gr A 3 Each 750 2250 584 1752 670 2010 675 2,025.00
621.285 Lg. Decid  Trees 3" - 3½” cal B&B Gr A 1 Each 950 950 684 684 850 850 800 800.00
621.291 Lg. Decid  Trees 3½" - 4” cal B&B Gr A 1 Each 1400 1400 814 814 1100 1100 1050 1,050.00
621.297 Lg. Decid  Trees 4"- 4½” cal B&B Gr A 1 Each 1500 1500 960 960 1200 1200 1050 1,050.00
621.389 Evergreen Shrubs 15”-18” cont. Gr B 10 Each 110 1100 61 610 50 500 100 1,000.00

LG Whitcomb Rosengren Landscaping, Inc. Peter A. Lyford, Inc A.D. Smith Trucking
Item No Qty. Unit



Region 3 - 2023
Schedule of Items / Item Description Unit price Region 3     

Total Unit price Region 3     
Total Unit price Region 3     

Total Unit price Region 3     
Total 

LG Whitcomb Rosengren Landscaping, Inc. Peter A. Lyford, Inc A.D. Smith Trucking
Item No Qty. Unit

621.395 Evergreen Shrubs 18" - 24" Gr A 10 Each 115 1150 66 660 60 600 120 1,200.00
621.396 Evergreen Shrubs 18”- 24” Gr B 10 Each 110 1100 69 690 60 600 125 1,250.00
621.401 Evergreen Shrubs 2’- 2 ½’  Group A 10 Each 100 1000 82 820 90 900 125 1,250.00
621.402 Evergreen Shrubs 2’- 2 ½’  cont. Gr B 10 Each 95 950 96 960 120 1200 110 1,100.00
621.413 Evergreen Shrubs 3’- 3 1/2’  Group A 10 Each 180 1800 253 2530 190 1900 180 1,800.00
621.486 Broadleaf Evergreens 18"-24"Gr A 10 Each 150 1500 90 900 90 900 120 1,200.00
621.492 Broadleaf Evergreens 2'-2 1/2' Gr A 10 Each 225 2250 110 1100 130 1300 250 2,500.00
621.498 Broadleaf Evergreens 2½ ’-3’Gr A 10 Each 240 2400 187 1870 200 2000 278 2,780.00
621.512 Decid Shrubs 15”-18” . Group A 10 Each 75 750 53 530 36 360 80 800.00
621.54 Decid Shrubs 18”-24”  Group A 10 Each 75 750 61 610 40 400 85 850.00
621.546 Decid Shrubs 2’-3’  Group A 10 Each 100 1000 67 670 60 600 125 1,250.00
621.552 Decid Shrubs 3’-4’  Group A 10 Each 125 1250 111 1110 150 1500 150 1,500.00
621.558 Decid Shrubs 4’-5’ Group A 10 Each 170 1700 150 1500 200 2000 200 2,000.00
621.65 Vines 12" - 15"  Group A 3 Each 50 150 44 132 44 132 35 105.00
621.66 Vines 18" - 24"  Group B 3 Each 60 180 60 180 60 180 42 126.00
621.71 Perennials & Groundcovers 1gal. Group A    12 Each 25 300 20 240 12.5 150 25 300.00
621.711 Perennials 1 gal. Group B   12 Each 25 300 23 276 16 192 25 300.00
621.713 Perennials & Groundcovers 1 Quart cont. 12 Each 25 300 19 228 10 120 22 264.00
629.05 Hand Labor, Straight Time 24 HR 60 1440 56 1344 52.5 1260 55 1,320.00
631.08 Generator 1 LS 150 150 132 132 275 275 100 100.00
631.12 Excavator and operator 8 HR 130 1040 160 1280 575 4600 165 1,320.00
631.122 Mini-excavator and operator 8 HR 120 960 110 880 500 4000 125 1,000.00
631.133 Skid Steer/Bobcat and operator 8 HR 105 840 110 880 250 2000 100 800.00
631.18 Chainsaw Rental 1 LS 1 1 190 190 200 200 125 125.00
631.2 Stump Grinder  Rental 1 LS 400 400 430 430 500 500 400 400.00
631.111 Hammer Drill  Rental 1 LS 1 1 180 180 200 200 180 180.00
642.2 Granite Post 2 Each 750 1500 340 680 300 600 400 800.00
659.10  Mobilization (Lump Sum) 1 LS 2500 2500 1600 1600 2000 2000 1000 1,000.00
890.02 Supplemental Landscape Materials 1 LS No Bid 0 No Bid 0 No Bid 0 No Bid 0

75,266.00 65,466.00 84,957.50 78,785.00 Totals  



Region 4 - 2023
Schedule of Items / Item Description Unit price Region 4     

Total Unit price Region 4     
Total Unit price Region 4     

Total Unit price Region 4     
Total 

304.09 Aggregate Base Course- crushed  Type A 3 CY 48 144 52 156 60 180 68 204.00
411.131 6" Compacted stone dust gravel base 100 SF 6.5 650 6 600 25 2500 10 1,000.00
609.11 Vertical Curb Type I 50 LF 78 3900 61 3050 52.5 2625 60 3,000.00
613.319 Erosion Control Blanket 50 SY 7.5 375 6 300 31.5 1575 7 350.00
615.07 Loam 10 CY 66 660 62 620 75 750 70 700.00
616.08 Sod 100 SY 16.1 1610 14 1400 15.75 1575 18 1,800.00
617.35 Compost 10 CY 66 660 66 660 73.5 735 77 770.00
617.381 Erosion Control Mulch 10 CY 50 500 66 660 73.5 735 65 650.00
618.13 Seeding Method Number 1 10 1,000 SF 49 490 85 850 42.5 425 55 550.00
618.14 Seeding Method Number 2 10 1,000 SF 49 490 87 870 42.5 425 45 450.00
618.141 Seeding Method Number 3 10 1,000 SF 52 520 98 980 57.75 577.5 45 450.00
619.12 Mulch Cellulose Fiber Hydroseed Mulch 10 1,000 SF 49 490 48 480 42.5 425 45 450.00
619.13 Bark Mulch 10 CY 65 650 63 630 73.5 735 70 700.00
619.14 Erosion Control Mulch 10 CY 68 680 63 630 73.5 735 65 650.00
621.014 Evergreen Trees 18” – 24” Gr A 5 Each 55 275 43 215 20 100 50 250.00
621.025 Evergreen Trees 3’- 4’ B&B Gr A 5 Each 170 850 80 400 90 450 150 750.00
621.026 Evergreen Trees 3’- 4’ B&B Gr B 5 Each 150 750 83 415 90 450 140 700.00
621.031 Evergreen Trees 4’- 5’ B&B Gr A 5 Each 180 900 152 760 200 1000 300 1,500.00
621.032 Evergreen Trees 4’- 5’ B&B Gr B 5 Each 160 800 157 785 200 1000 160 800.00
621.037 Evergreen Trees 5’- 6’ B&B  Gr A 6 Each 200 1200 220 1320 350 2100 220 1,320.00
621.038 Evergreen Trees 5’- 6’ B&B  Gr B 6 Each 185 1110 220 1320 320 1920 220 1,320.00
621.039 Evergreen Trees 5’- 6’ B&B  Gr C 6 Each 170 1020 288 1728 400 2400 350 2,100.00
621.043 Evergreen Trees 6’- 8’ B&B  Gr A 6 Each 250 1500 274 1644 400 2400 300 1,800.00
621.044 Evergreen Trees 6’- 8’ B&B  Gr B 6 Each 215 1290 318 1908 500 3000 300 1,800.00
621.045 Evergreen Trees 6’- 8’ B&B  Gr C 6 Each 230 1380 340 2040 500 3000 400 2,400.00
621.046 Evergreen Trees 8’- 10’ B&B Gr A 3 Each 925 2775 525 1575 700 2100 1000 3,000.00
621.047 Evergreen Trees 8’- 10’ B&B Gr B 3 Each 845 2535 575 1725 825 2475 900 2,700.00
621.048 Evergreen Trees 8’- 10’ B&B Gr C 3 Each 785 2355 675 2025 950 2850 850 2,550.00
621.101 Plug/starter plant 2”cont. 6” min. 36 Each 20 720 8 288 6 216 11 396.00
621.122 Small Decid Trees 5’- 6’multistem clump  Gr C 1 Each 185 185 283 283 350 350 275 275.00
621.127 Small Decid Trees 6’- 8’ Gr B 3 Each 310 930 180 540 200 600 330 990.00
621.184 Med Decid Trees 8’-10’ Gr A 3 Each 500 1500 443 1329 550 1650 500 1,500.00
621.201 Med Decid Trees 2”-2 ½”cal B&B Gr A 3 Each 525 1575 490 1470 570 1710 600 1,800.00
621.247 Lg. Decid  Trees 4’-5’  Gr A 3 Each 150 450 91 273 110 330 180 540.00
621.249 Lg. Decid  Trees 6’-8’  Gr A 3 Each 250 750 187 561 200 600 250 750.00
621.255 Lg. Decid  Trees 8’-10’ Gr A 3 Each 330 990 265 795 330 990 400 1,200.00
621.267 Lg. Decid  Trees 1¾ ”- 2" cal Gr A 3 Each 390 1170 436 1308 410 1230 475 1,425.00
621.273 Lg. Decid Trees 2"-2½ ” cal B&B Gr A 3 Each 525 1575 417 1251 570 1710 550 1,650.00
621.279 Lg. Decid  Trees 2½" - 3” cal  B&B Gr A 3 Each 750 2250 584 1752 670 2010 675 2,025.00
621.285 Lg. Decid  Trees 3" - 3½” cal B&B Gr A 1 Each 950 950 684 684 850 850 800 800.00
621.291 Lg. Decid  Trees 3½" - 4” cal B&B Gr A 1 Each 1400 1400 814 814 1100 1100 1050 1,050.00
621.297 Lg. Decid  Trees 4"- 4½” cal B&B Gr A 1 Each 1500 1500 960 960 1200 1200 1050 1,050.00
621.389 Evergreen Shrubs 15”-18” cont. Gr B 10 Each 110 1100 61 610 50 500 100 1,000.00

LG Whitcomb Rosengren Landscaping, Inc. Peter A. Lyford, Inc A.D. Smith Trucking
Item No Qty. Unit



Region 4 - 2023
Schedule of Items / Item Description Unit price Region 4     

Total Unit price Region 4     
Total Unit price Region 4     

Total Unit price Region 4     
Total 

LG Whitcomb Rosengren Landscaping, Inc. Peter A. Lyford, Inc A.D. Smith Trucking
Item No Qty. Unit

621.395 Evergreen Shrubs 18" - 24" Gr A 10 Each 115 1150 66 660 60 600 120 1,200.00
621.396 Evergreen Shrubs 18”- 24” Gr B 10 Each 110 1100 69 690 60 600 125 1,250.00
621.401 Evergreen Shrubs 2’- 2 ½’  Group A 10 Each 100 1000 82 820 90 900 125 1,250.00
621.402 Evergreen Shrubs 2’- 2 ½’  cont. Gr B 10 Each 95 950 96 960 120 1200 110 1,100.00
621.413 Evergreen Shrubs 3’- 3 1/2’  Group A 10 Each 180 1800 253 2530 190 1900 180 1,800.00
621.486 Broadleaf Evergreens 18"-24"Gr A 10 Each 150 1500 90 900 90 900 120 1,200.00
621.492 Broadleaf Evergreens 2'-2 1/2' Gr A 10 Each 225 2250 110 1100 130 1300 250 2,500.00
621.498 Broadleaf Evergreens 2½ ’-3’Gr A 10 Each 240 2400 187 1870 200 2000 278 2,780.00
621.512 Decid Shrubs 15”-18” . Group A 10 Each 75 750 53 530 36 360 80 800.00
621.54 Decid Shrubs 18”-24”  Group A 10 Each 75 750 61 610 40 400 85 850.00
621.546 Decid Shrubs 2’-3’  Group A 10 Each 100 1000 67 670 60 600 125 1,250.00
621.552 Decid Shrubs 3’-4’  Group A 10 Each 125 1250 111 1110 150 1500 150 1,500.00
621.558 Decid Shrubs 4’-5’ Group A 10 Each 170 1700 150 1500 200 2000 200 2,000.00
621.65 Vines 12" - 15"  Group A 3 Each 50 150 44 132 44 132 35 105.00
621.66 Vines 18" - 24"  Group B 3 Each 60 180 60 180 60 180 42 126.00
621.71 Perennials & Groundcovers 1gal. Group A    12 Each 25 300 20 240 12.5 150 25 300.00
621.711 Perennials 1 gal. Group B   12 Each 25 300 23 276 16 192 25 300.00
621.713 Perennials & Groundcovers 1 Quart cont. 12 Each 25 300 19 228 10 120 22 264.00
629.05 Hand Labor, Straight Time 24 HR 60 1440 56 1344 52.5 1260 55 1,320.00
631.08 Generator 1 LS 150 150 132 132 275 275 100 100.00
631.12 Excavator and operator 8 HR 130 1040 160 1280 575 4600 165 1,320.00
631.122 Mini-excavator and operator 8 HR 120 960 110 880 500 4000 125 1,000.00
631.133 Skid Steer/Bobcat and operator 8 HR 105 840 110 880 250 2000 100 800.00
631.18 Chainsaw Rental 1 LS 1 1 190 190 200 200 125 125.00
631.2 Stump Grinder  Rental 1 LS 400 400 430 430 500 500 400 400.00
631.111 Hammer Drill  Rental 1 LS 1 1 180 180 200 200 180 180.00
642.2 Granite Post 2 Each 750 1500 340 680 300 600 400 800.00
659.10  Mobilization (Lump Sum) 1 LS 2200 2200 1550 1550 2000 2000 1000 1,000.00
890.02 Supplemental Landscape Materials 1 LS No Bid 0 No Bid 0 No Bid 0 No Bid 0

74,966.00 65,216.00 84,957.50 78,785.00 Totals  



Region 5 - 2023
Schedule of Items / Item Description Unit price Region 5      

Total Unit price Region 5      
Total Unit price Region 5      

Total Unit price Region 5      
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304.09 Aggregate Base Course- crushed  Type A 3 CY 48 144 55 165 60 180 68 204.00
411.131 6" Compacted stone dust gravel base 100 SF 6.5 650 7 700 25 2500 10 1,000.00
609.11 Vertical Curb Type I 50 LF 78 3900 65 3250 52.5 2625 60 3,000.00
613.319 Erosion Control Blanket 50 SY 7.5 375 6 300 31.5 1575 7 350.00
615.07 Loam 10 CY 66 660 65 650 75 750 70 700.00
616.08 Sod 100 SY 16.1 1610 16 1600 15.75 1575 18 1,800.00
617.35 Compost 10 CY 66 660 68 680 73.5 735 77 770.00
617.381 Erosion Control Mulch 10 CY 50 500 68 680 73.5 735 65 650.00
618.13 Seeding Method Number 1 10 1,000 SF 49 490 90 900 42.5 425 55 550.00
618.14 Seeding Method Number 2 10 1,000 SF 49 490 92 920 42.5 425 45 450.00
618.141 Seeding Method Number 3 10 1,000 SF 52 520 100 1000 57.75 577.5 45 450.00
619.12 Mulch Cellulose Fiber Hydroseed Mulch 10 1,000 SF 49 490 48 480 42.5 425 45 450.00
619.13 Bark Mulch 10 CY 65 650 65 650 73.5 735 70 700.00
619.14 Erosion Control Mulch 10 CY 68 680 65 650 73.5 735 65 650.00
621.014 Evergreen Trees 18” – 24” Gr A 5 Each 55 275 43 215 20 100 50 250.00
621.025 Evergreen Trees 3’- 4’ B&B Gr A 5 Each 170 850 80 400 90 450 150 750.00
621.026 Evergreen Trees 3’- 4’ B&B Gr B 5 Each 150 750 83 415 90 450 140 700.00
621.031 Evergreen Trees 4’- 5’ B&B Gr A 5 Each 180 900 156 780 200 1000 300 1,500.00
621.032 Evergreen Trees 4’- 5’ B&B Gr B 5 Each 160 800 161 805 200 1000 160 800.00
621.037 Evergreen Trees 5’- 6’ B&B  Gr A 6 Each 200 1200 230 1380 350 2100 220 1,320.00
621.038 Evergreen Trees 5’- 6’ B&B  Gr B 6 Each 185 1110 230 1380 320 1920 220 1,320.00
621.039 Evergreen Trees 5’- 6’ B&B  Gr C 6 Each 170 1020 298 1788 400 2400 350 2,100.00
621.043 Evergreen Trees 6’- 8’ B&B  Gr A 6 Each 250 1500 274 1644 400 2400 300 1,800.00
621.044 Evergreen Trees 6’- 8’ B&B  Gr B 6 Each 215 1290 318 1908 500 3000 300 1,800.00
621.045 Evergreen Trees 6’- 8’ B&B  Gr C 6 Each 230 1380 350 2100 500 3000 400 2,400.00
621.046 Evergreen Trees 8’- 10’ B&B Gr A 3 Each 925 2775 525 1575 700 2100 1000 3,000.00
621.047 Evergreen Trees 8’- 10’ B&B Gr B 3 Each 845 2535 575 1725 825 2475 900 2,700.00
621.048 Evergreen Trees 8’- 10’ B&B Gr C 3 Each 785 2355 675 2025 950 2850 850 2,550.00
621.101 Plug/starter plant 2”cont. 6” min. 36 Each 20 720 8 288 6 216 11 396.00
621.122 Small Decid Trees 5’- 6’multistem clump  Gr C 1 Each 185 185 283 283 350 350 275 275.00
621.127 Small Decid Trees 6’- 8’ Gr B 3 Each 310 930 180 540 200 600 330 990.00
621.184 Med Decid Trees 8’-10’ Gr A 3 Each 500 1500 443 1329 550 1650 500 1,500.00
621.201 Med Decid Trees 2”-2 ½”cal B&B Gr A 3 Each 525 1575 495 1485 570 1710 600 1,800.00
621.247 Lg. Decid  Trees 4’-5’  Gr A 3 Each 150 450 91 273 110 330 180 540.00
621.249 Lg. Decid  Trees 6’-8’  Gr A 3 Each 250 750 187 561 200 600 250 750.00
621.255 Lg. Decid  Trees 8’-10’ Gr A 3 Each 330 990 265 795 330 990 400 1,200.00
621.267 Lg. Decid  Trees 1¾ ”- 2" cal Gr A 3 Each 390 1170 436 1308 410 1230 475 1,425.00
621.273 Lg. Decid Trees 2"-2½ ” cal B&B Gr A 3 Each 525 1575 417 1251 570 1710 550 1,650.00
621.279 Lg. Decid  Trees 2½" - 3” cal  B&B Gr A 3 Each 750 2250 592 1776 670 2010 675 2,025.00
621.285 Lg. Decid  Trees 3" - 3½” cal B&B Gr A 1 Each 950 950 690 690 850 850 800 800.00
621.291 Lg. Decid  Trees 3½" - 4” cal B&B Gr A 1 Each 1400 1400 820 820 1100 1100 1050 1,050.00
621.297 Lg. Decid  Trees 4"- 4½” cal B&B Gr A 1 Each 1500 1500 980 980 1200 1200 1050 1,050.00
621.389 Evergreen Shrubs 15”-18” cont. Gr B 10 Each 110 1100 65 650 50 500 100 1,000.00

LG Whitcomb Rosengren Landscaping, Inc. Peter A. Lyford, Inc A.D. Smith Trucking
Item No Qty. Unit



Region 5 - 2023
Schedule of Items / Item Description Unit price Region 5      

Total Unit price Region 5      
Total Unit price Region 5      

Total Unit price Region 5      
Total 

LG Whitcomb Rosengren Landscaping, Inc. Peter A. Lyford, Inc A.D. Smith Trucking
Item No Qty. Unit

621.395 Evergreen Shrubs 18" - 24" Gr A 10 Each 115 1150 66 660 60 600 120 1,200.00
621.396 Evergreen Shrubs 18”- 24” Gr B 10 Each 110 1100 69 690 60 600 125 1,250.00
621.401 Evergreen Shrubs 2’- 2 ½’  Group A 10 Each 100 1000 84 840 90 900 125 1,250.00
621.402 Evergreen Shrubs 2’- 2 ½’  cont. Gr B 10 Each 95 950 96 960 120 1200 110 1,100.00
621.413 Evergreen Shrubs 3’- 3 1/2’  Group A 10 Each 180 1800 253 2530 190 1900 180 1,800.00
621.486 Broadleaf Evergreens 18"-24"Gr A 10 Each 150 1500 90 900 90 900 120 1,200.00
621.492 Broadleaf Evergreens 2'-2 1/2' Gr A 10 Each 225 2250 110 1100 130 1300 250 2,500.00
621.498 Broadleaf Evergreens 2½ ’-3’Gr A 10 Each 240 2400 190 1900 200 2000 278 2,780.00
621.512 Decid Shrubs 15”-18” . Group A 10 Each 75 750 53 530 36 360 80 800.00
621.54 Decid Shrubs 18”-24”  Group A 10 Each 75 750 61 610 40 400 85 850.00
621.546 Decid Shrubs 2’-3’  Group A 10 Each 100 1000 67 670 60 600 125 1,250.00
621.552 Decid Shrubs 3’-4’  Group A 10 Each 125 1250 111 1110 150 1500 150 1,500.00
621.558 Decid Shrubs 4’-5’ Group A 10 Each 170 1700 150 1500 200 2000 200 2,000.00
621.65 Vines 12" - 15"  Group A 3 Each 50 150 44 132 44 132 35 105.00
621.66 Vines 18" - 24"  Group B 3 Each 60 180 60 180 60 180 42 126.00
621.71 Perennials & Groundcovers 1gal. Group A    12 Each 25 300 20 240 12.5 150 25 300.00
621.711 Perennials 1 gal. Group B   12 Each 25 300 24 288 16 192 25 300.00
621.713 Perennials & Groundcovers 1 Quart cont. 12 Each 25 300 19 228 10 120 22 264.00
629.05 Hand Labor, Straight Time 24 HR 60 1440 56 1344 52.5 1260 55 1,320.00
631.08 Generator 1 LS 150 150 132 132 275 275 100 100.00
631.12 Excavator and operator 8 HR 130 1040 170 1360 575 4600 165 1,320.00
631.122 Mini-excavator and operator 8 HR 120 960 115 920 500 4000 125 1,000.00
631.133 Skid Steer/Bobcat and operator 8 HR 105 840 125 1000 250 2000 100 800.00
631.18 Chainsaw Rental 1 LS 1 1 190 190 200 200 125 125.00
631.2 Stump Grinder  Rental 1 LS 400 400 450 450 500 500 400 400.00
631.111 Hammer Drill  Rental 1 LS 1 1 180 180 200 200 180 180.00
642.2 Granite Post 2 Each 750 1500 350 700 300 600 400 800.00
659.10  Mobilization (Lump Sum) 1 LS 2500 2500 2100 2100 2000 2000 1500 1,500.00
890.02 Supplemental Landscape Materials 1 LS No Bid 0 No Bid 0 No Bid 0 No Bid 0

75,266.00 67,238.00 84,957.50 79,285.00 Totals  
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