
Maine Department of Transportation
Tabulation of Bids

Contract ID:  PH20200624ITS

Letting date: July 15, 2020

TOWN/CITY/REGION:  Region 1, 2, 3, 4, 5

Contract Description: On Call Intelligent Transportation Systems Operations Work - Statewide

Approx. Quantity 
and Units Unit Price Region Unit Price Region Unit Price Region Unit Price Region Unit Price Region Unit Price Region Unit Price Region

 Region 1

Region 2

Region 3

Region 4

Region 5

652.365 Work Zone Traffic Control - Two-way road Day $1,207.80 $800.00 $950.00 $1,700.00 $2,600.00 $2,000.00 $2,440.00

652.365 Work Zone Traffic Control - Intersection , 4 way or less Day $2,174.70 $1,600.00 $1,400.00 $1,818.00 $1,580.00 $2,000.00 $3,180.00

Mobilization to Region 1 Day $196.80 No Bid $375.00 $1,228.00 $860.00 $500.00 $440.00

Mobilization to Region 2 Day $196.80 No Bid $460.00 $1,100.00 $586.00 $300.00 $880.00

Mobilization to Region 3 Day $196.80 No Bid $500.00 $1,198.00 $692.00 $600.00 $880.00

Mobilization to Region 4 Day $196.80 $1,200.00 $900.00 $1,485.00 $568.00 $600.00 $1,760.00

Mobilization to Region 5 Day $688.80 $800.00 $1,000.00 $2,486.00 $1,000.00 $800.00 $3,520.00

Parts Markup Percent 10% 20% 4% 15% 15% 20% 12%

General ITS Technician/Electrician Work Hour $77.00 $70.00 $70.00 $129.00 $112.00 $100.00 $186.00

General ITS Priority Work Hour $95.50 $105.00 $70.00 $153.50 $112.00 $120.00 $206.00

Section 4) Road Weather Information Systems (RWIS)

Specialized RWIS Technician/Electrician Hour No Bid $80.00 $70.00 $129.00 No Bid $100.00 $192.00

Specialized RWIS Priority Work Hour No Bid $120.00 $70.00 $153.50 No Bid $120.00 $214.00

Section 5) Weigh in Motion Systems (WIM)

Specialized WIM Technician/Electrician Work Hour No Bid $80.00 $75.00 $129.00 $112.00 $100.00 $192.00

Specialized WIM Priority Work Hour No Bid $120.00 $75.00 $153.50 $150.00 $120.00 $214.00

Section 6) Additional Tasks

Trenching Foot No Bid No Bid $10.00 $15.00 $10.00 $20.00 No Bid

Pole Setting Pole No Bid $1,500.00 No Bid $696.00 No Bid $2,500.00 No Bid

Dagle Electrical Construction Corp

Item Description

Section 1) Check each Region(s) the Contractor is bidding on to perform General ITS Work

Section 2) Traffic Control and Mobilization to Region

Section 3) Travel, General ITS Work, and Parts

Tilson
Lajoie Electric & Control Service, 

Inc Ampire Electric Digital Traffic Systems, Inc. NDC Communications, LLC Hedstrom Electric
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