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NOTE: Electronic Bids will not be accepted for this bid.

Inner Envelope

Outer Envelope

If you need further information regarding Bid preparation, call the DOT Contracts Section at (207) 624-3410.

For complete bidding requirements, refer to Section 102 of the Maine Department of Transportation,
Standard Specifications, March 2020 Edition.
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by State of Maine, Department of Transportation, Standard Specifications, March 2020
Edition, Standard Details, March 2020 Edition

. Standard Detail
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Regions 1 – 5
On Call Milling Machines and Grinders

February 20, 2021

SCHEDULE OF ITEMS

Contractor:  _____________________________________________________

Page 1 of 5

The Department will reject bids if the Bid is not Delivered to the precise location and by the 
precise time set forth in the Notice to Contractors or any applicable Bid Amendment, the Bid is not 
signed, or a bid amount is illegible. Do not make handwritten changes to the bid documents.
The Bidder will have no opportunity to cure the above Non-curable Bid Defects.  For 
clarification, questions, comments/recommendations use the “Request for Information” form 
as directed in the Bid Book instructions.  For a related provision see Standard Specification and 
Special Provision, Section 102.11 – Bid Responsiveness.

Bidders are not required to bid all items, although, no bid for mobilization items will 
result in no pay for mobilization.

REGION 1, SCARBOROUGH

202.2020 Removing Pavement Surface, 
Less than 2,500 square yards

_________ per SY

202.302 Removing Pavement Surface, 
Greater than 2,500 square yards

_________ per SY

202.2029 Removing Concrete Surface, 
Less than 2,500 square yards

_________ per SY

202.303 Removing Concrete Surface, 
Greater than 2,500 square yards

_________ per SY

Item 659.11 Mobilization – Hourly: _________ per Hour
Item 659.12 Mobilization – Overnight: _________ per Calendar Day

Item 659.13 Mobilization – Hourly: _________ per Calendar Day

By signing below, the Bidder (1) represents that the Bidder has examined the Contract Agreement contained in the Bid 
Documents, the Contract, all documents referenced in said Contract, and the site and scope of work, (2) does hereby bid 
and offer to enter into this contract to construct and/or perform the Work in strict accordance with the terms and conditions 
of this Contract at the unit prices bid in the attached “Schedule of Items”, (3) represents that the Bidder has given the 
Department notice of any errors or ambiguities related to the documents or the work that have been discovered by the 
Bidder, (4) represents that the above-named organization is the legal entity entering into the resulting contract with the 
Department if they are awarded the contract and, (5) represents that the undersigned is authorized to enter contractual 
obligations on behalf of the above-named organization.

Bidder acknowledges that the properly completed and signed Schedule of Items provided with the Bid constitutes the 
Bidder’s offer and that this offer shall remain open for 30 calendar days after the date of opening of bids.

The Bidder hereby certifies, to the best of its knowledge and belief that: the Bidder has not, either directly or indirectly, 
entered into any agreement, participated in any collusion, or otherwise taken any action in restraint of competitive bidding 
in connection with its bid, and its subsequent contract with the Department.

Use pen and ink to complete paper bids. Signatures shall be original. Stamped and copied signatures will not be accepted.

__________________________________________________________     ______________________________
Signature Date

_________________________________________________________________________________________________
(Print Bidder’s Name and Title)
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On Call Milling Machines and Grinders
Regions 1 – 5

February 20, 2021

SCHEDULE OF ITEMS

Contractor:  _____________________________________________________________

Page 2 of 5

Bidders are not required to bid all items, although, no bid for mobilization items 
will result in no pay for mobilization.

REGION 2, AUGUSTA

202.2020 Removing Pavement Surface, 
Less than 2,500 square yards

_________ per SY

202.302 Removing Pavement Surface, 
Greater than 2,500 square yards

_________ per SY

202.2029 Removing Concrete Surface, 
Less than 2,500 square yards

_________ per SY

202.303 Removing Concrete Surface, 
Greater than 2,500 square yards

_________ per SY

Item 659.11 Mobilization – Hourly: _________ per Hour
Item 659.12 Mobilization – Overnight: _________ per Calendar Day

Item 659.13 Mobilization – Hourly: _________ per Calendar Day

By signing below, the Bidder (1) represents that the Bidder has examined the Contract Agreement contained in the Bid 
Documents, the Contract, all documents referenced in said Contract, and the site and scope of work, (2) does hereby bid 
and offer to enter into this contract to construct and/or perform the Work in strict accordance with the terms and conditions 
of this Contract at the unit prices bid in the attached “Schedule of Items”, (3) represents that the Bidder has given the 
Department notice of any errors or ambiguities related to the documents or the work that have been discovered by the 
Bidder, (4) represents that the above-named organization is the legal entity entering into the resulting contract with the 
Department if they are awarded the contract and, (5) represents that the undersigned is authorized to enter contractual 
obligations on behalf of the above-named organization.

Bidder acknowledges that the properly completed and signed Schedule of Items provided with the Bid constitutes the 
Bidder’s offer and that this offer shall remain open for 30 calendar days after the date of opening of bids.

The Bidder hereby certifies, to the best of its knowledge and belief that: the Bidder has not, either directly or indirectly, 
entered into any agreement, participated in any collusion, or otherwise taken any action in restraint of competitive bidding 
in connection with its bid, and its subsequent contract with the Department.

Use pen and ink to complete paper bids. Signatures shall be original. Stamped and copied signatures will not be accepted.

__________________________________________________________                ______________________________
Signature Date

_________________________________________________________________________________________________
(Print Bidder’s Name and Title)
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On Call Milling Machines and Grinders
Regions 1 – 5

February 20, 2021

SCHEDULE OF ITEMS

Contractor:  _____________________________________________________________

Page 3 of 5

Bidders are not required to bid all items, although, no bid for mobilization items 
will result in no pay for mobilization.

REGION 3, WILTON

202.2020 Removing Pavement Surface, 
Less than 2,500 square yards

_________ per SY

202.302 Removing Pavement Surface, 
Greater than 2,500 square yards

_________ per SY

202.2029 Removing Concrete Surface, 
Less than 2,500 square yards

_________ per SY

202.303 Removing Concrete Surface, 
Greater than 2,500 square yards

_________ per SY

Item 659.11 Mobilization – Hourly: _________ per Hour
Item 659.12 Mobilization – Overnight: _________ per Calendar Day

Item 659.13 Mobilization – Hourly: _________ per Calendar Day

By signing below, the Bidder (1) represents that the Bidder has examined the Contract Agreement contained in the Bid 
Documents, the Contract, all documents referenced in said Contract, and the site and scope of work, (2) does hereby bid 
and offer to enter into this contract to construct and/or perform the Work in strict accordance with the terms and conditions
of this Contract at the unit prices bid in the attached “Schedule of Items”, (3) represents that the Bidder has given the 
Department notice of any errors or ambiguities related to the documents or the work that have been discovered by the 
Bidder, (4) represents that the above-named organization is the legal entity entering into the resulting contract with the 
Department if they are awarded the contract and, (5) represents that the undersigned is authorized to enter contractual 
obligations on behalf of the above-named organization.

Bidder acknowledges that the properly completed and signed Schedule of Items provided with the Bid constitutes the 
Bidder’s offer and that this offer shall remain open for 30 calendar days after the date of opening of bids.

The Bidder hereby certifies, to the best of its knowledge and belief that: the Bidder has not, either directly or indirectly, 
entered into any agreement, participated in any collusion, or otherwise taken any action in restraint of competitive bidding 
in connection with its bid, and its subsequent contract with the Department.

Use pen and ink to complete paper bids. Signatures shall be original. Stamped and copied signatures will not be accepted.

__________________________________________________________               ______________________________
Signature Date

_________________________________________________________________________________________________
(Print Bidder’s Name and Title)

13



On Call Milling Machines and Grinders
Regions 1 – 5

February 20, 2021

SCHEDULE OF ITEMS

Contractor:  _____________________________________________________________

Page 4 of 5

Bidders are not required to bid all items, although, no bid for mobilization items 
will result in no pay for mobilization.

REGION 4, BANGOR

202.2020 Removing Pavement Surface, 
Less than 2,500 square yards

_________ per SY

202.302 Removing Pavement Surface, 
Greater than 2,500 square yards

_________ per SY

202.2029 Removing Concrete Surface, 
Less than 2,500 square yards

_________ per SY

202.303 Removing Concrete Surface, 
Greater than 2,500 square yards

_________ per SY

Item 659.11 Mobilization – Hourly: _________ per Hour
Item 659.12 Mobilization – Overnight: _________ per Calendar Day

Item 659.13 Mobilization – Hourly: _________ per Calendar Day

By signing below, the Bidder (1) represents that the Bidder has examined the Contract Agreement contained in the Bid 
Documents, the Contract, all documents referenced in said Contract, and the site and scope of work, (2) does hereby bid 
and offer to enter into this contract to construct and/or perform the Work in strict accordance with the terms and conditions
of this Contract at the unit prices bid in the attached “Schedule of Items”, (3) represents that the Bidder has given the 
Department notice of any errors or ambiguities related to the documents or the work that have been discovered by the 
Bidder, (4) represents that the above-named organization is the legal entity entering into the resulting contract with the 
Department if they are awarded the contract and, (5) represents that the undersigned is authorized to enter contractual 
obligations on behalf of the above-named organization.

Bidder acknowledges that the properly completed and signed Schedule of Items provided with the Bid constitutes the 
Bidder’s offer and that this offer shall remain open for 30 calendar days after the date of opening of bids.

The Bidder hereby certifies, to the best of its knowledge and belief that: the Bidder has not, either directly or indirectly, 
entered into any agreement, participated in any collusion, or otherwise taken any action in restraint of competitive bidding 
in connection with its bid, and its subsequent contract with the Department.

Use pen and ink to complete paper bids. Signatures shall be original. Stamped and copied signatures will not be accepted.

__________________________________________________________                ______________________________
Signature Date

_________________________________________________________________________________________________
(Print Bidder’s Name and Title)
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On Call Milling Machines and Grinders
Regions 1 – 5

February 20, 2021

SCHEDULE OF ITEMS

Contractor:  _____________________________________________________________

Page 5 of 5

Bidders are not required to bid all items, although, no bid for mobilization items 
will result in no pay for mobilization.

REGION 5, PRESQUE ISLE

202.2020 Removing Pavement Surface, 
Less than 2,500 square yards

_________ per SY

202.302 Removing Pavement Surface, 
Greater than 2,500 square yards

_________ per SY

202.2029 Removing Concrete Surface, 
Less than 2,500 square yards

_________ per SY

202.303 Removing Concrete Surface, 
Greater than 2,500 square yards

_________ per SY

Item 659.11 Mobilization – Hourly: _________ per Hour
Item 659.12 Mobilization – Overnight: _________ per Calendar Day

Item 659.13 Mobilization – Hourly: _________ per Calendar Day

By signing below, the Bidder (1) represents that the Bidder has examined the Contract Agreement contained in the Bid 
Documents, the Contract, all documents referenced in said Contract, and the site and scope of work, (2) does hereby bid 
and offer to enter into this contract to construct and/or perform the Work in strict accordance with the terms and conditions
of this Contract at the unit prices bid in the attached “Schedule of Items”, (3) represents that the Bidder has given the 
Department notice of any errors or ambiguities related to the documents or the work that have been discovered by the 
Bidder, (4) represents that the above-named organization is the legal entity entering into the resulting contract with the 
Department if they are awarded the contract and, (5) represents that the undersigned is authorized to enter contractual 
obligations on behalf of the above-named organization.

Bidder acknowledges that the properly completed and signed Schedule of Items provided with the Bid constitutes the 
Bidder’s offer and that this offer shall remain open for 30 calendar days after the date of opening of bids.

The Bidder hereby certifies, to the best of its knowledge and belief that: the Bidder has not, either directly or indirectly,
entered into any agreement, participated in any collusion, or otherwise taken any action in restraint of competitive bidding 
in connection with its bid, and its subsequent contract with the Department.

Use pen and ink to complete paper bids. Signatures shall be original. Stamped and copied signatures will not be accepted.

__________________________________________________________                ______________________________
Signature Date

_________________________________________________________________________________________________
(Print Bidder’s Name and Title)
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CONTRACT AGREEMENT, OFFER & AWARD

AGREEMENT made on the date last signed below, by and between the State of Maine, 
acting through and by its Department of Transportation (Department), an agency of state 
government with its principal administrative offices located at Child Street, Augusta, Maine, 
with a mailing address at 16 State House Station, Augusta, Maine 04333-0016, and 
_________________________________________________________________(Contractor)
a corporation or other legal entity organized under the laws of the State of __________, with 
its principal place of business located at __________________________________________
__________________________________________________________________________.

The Department and the Contractor, in consideration of the mutual promises set forth in this 
Agreement (the “Contract”), hereby agree as follows:

A. The Work.

The Contractor agrees to complete all Work as specified or indicated in the Contract
including Extra Work in conformity with the Contract, On Call Milling Machines and
Grinders, in the Regions awarded in the State of Maine. The Work includes
construction, maintenance during construction, warranty as provided in the Contract,
and other incidental work.

The Contractor shall be responsible for furnishing all supervision, labor, equipment,
tools supplies, permanent materials and temporary materials required to perform the
Work including construction quality control including inspection, testing and
documentation, all required documentation at the conclusion of the project, warranting
its work and performing all other work indicated in the Contract.

The Department shall have the right to alter the nature and extent of the Work as
provided in the Contract; payment to be made as provided in the same.

B. Time.

This contract shall commence no earlier than April 1, 2021. The Contractor agrees to
complete all Work beginning after contract execution and continuing until this contract
expires on March 31, 2022.
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C. Price.

The regions in which Bids are received and accepted and Special Provision Section 103 
Basis of Award will be used as the basis for determining the original Contract amount. 
The Department does not guarantee the use of any or all of the Contract amount.  The 
final Contract amount will be determined by the actual work authorized and performed 
at bid prices.   

D. Contract.

This Contract, which may be amended, modified, or supplemented in writing only, 
consists of the Contract documents as defined in the Plans, Standard Specifications, 
March 2020 Edition, Standard Details March 2020 Edition as updated through 
advertisement, Supplemental Specifications, Special Provisions, and Contract 
Agreement.   It is agreed and understood that this Contract will be governed by the 
documents listed above.

E. Certifications.

By signing below, the Contractor hereby certifies that to the best of the Contractor’s 
knowledge and belief:

1. All of the statements, representations, covenants, and/or certifications required or 
set forth in the Bid and the Bid Documents, including those in the Contract are still 
complete and accurate as of the date of this Agreement.

2. The Contractor knows of no legal, contractual, or financial impediment to entering 
into this Contract.

3. The person signing below is legally authorized by the Contractor to sign this 
Contract on behalf of the Contractor and to legally bind the Contractor to the terms 
of the Contract.
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F.    Offer.

The undersigned, having carefully examined the site of work, the Plans, Standard
Specifications March 2020 Edition, Standard Details March 2020 Edition as updated 
through advertisement, Supplemental Specifications, Special Provisions, and Contract 
Agreement; contained herein for On Call Milling Machines and Grinders, in the 
Regions awarded in the State of Maine, on which bids will be received until the time 
specified in the “Notice to Contractors” do(es) hereby bid and offer to enter into this 
contract to supply all the materials, tools, equipment and labor to construct the whole 
of the Work in strict accordance with the terms and conditions of this Contract at the 
unit prices in the attached “Schedule of Items.”

The Offeror agrees to perform the work required at the price specified above and in 
accordance with the bids provided in the attached “Schedule of Items” in strict 
accordance with the terms of this solicitation, and to provide the appropriate insurance 
if this offer is accepted by the Government in writing.  

As Offeror also agrees:

First:  To do any extra work, not covered by the attached “Schedule of Items,” which 
may be ordered by the Resident, and to accept as full compensation the amount 
determined upon a “Force Account” basis as provided in the Standard Specifications, 
March 2020 Edition, and as addressed in the contract documents.

Second:  That this offer shall remain open for 30 calendar days after the date of 
opening of bids.

Third:  The Bidder hereby certifies, to the best of its knowledge and belief that:  the 
Bidder has not, either directly or indirectly, entered into any agreement, participated in 
any collusion, or otherwise taken any action in restraint of competitive bidding in
connection with its bid, and its subsequent contract with the Department.
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IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the Contractor, for itself, its successors and assigns, hereby 
execute this Agreement and thereby binds itself to all covenants, terms, and obligations 
contained in the Contract Documents.

CONTRACTOR

____________________________ _______________________________________
Date (Signature of Legally Authorized Representative

of the Contractor)

____________________________ _______________________________________
Witness (Name and Title Printed)

G. Award.  Your offer is hereby accepted for (see checked boxes):   

Your offer is hereby accepted for (see checked boxes):

Region 1 ____________________
Region 2 ____________________
Region 3 ____________________
Region 4 ____________________
Region 5 ____________________

The original contract amount is: $___________________________________________
________________________________________________________.

This award consummates the Contract, and the documents referenced herein.  

MAINE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

________________________________ _________________________________

Date        By: Benjamin W. Foster
Bridge Maintenance Engineer
Bureau of Maintenance & Operations
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CONTRACT AGREEMENT, OFFER & AWARD

AGREEMENT made on the date last signed below, by and between the State of Maine, 
acting through and by its Department of Transportation (Department), an agency of state 
government with its principal administrative offices located at Child Street, Augusta, Maine, 
with a mailing address at 16 State House Station, Augusta, Maine 04333-0016, and 
_________________________________________________________________(Contractor)
a corporation or other legal entity organized under the laws of the State of __________, with 
its principal place of business located at __________________________________________
__________________________________________________________________________.

The Department and the Contractor, in consideration of the mutual promises set forth in this 
Agreement (the “Contract”), hereby agree as follows:

A. The Work.

The Contractor agrees to complete all Work as specified or indicated in the Contract 
including Extra Work in conformity with the Contract, On Call Milling Machines and 
Grinders, in the Regions awarded in the State of Maine. The Work includes 
construction, maintenance during construction, warranty as provided in the Contract, 
and other incidental work.

The Contractor shall be responsible for furnishing all supervision, labor, equipment, 
tools supplies, permanent materials and temporary materials required to perform the 
Work including construction quality control including inspection, testing and 
documentation, all required documentation at the conclusion of the project, warranting 
its work and performing all other work indicated in the Contract.

The Department shall have the right to alter the nature and extent of the Work as 
provided in the Contract; payment to be made as provided in the same.

B. Time.

This contract shall commence no earlier than April 1, 2021. The Contractor agrees to 
complete all Work beginning after contract execution and continuing until this contract 
expires on March 31, 2022.
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C. Price.

The regions in which Bids are received and accepted and Special Provision Section 103 
Basis of Award will be used as the basis for determining the original Contract amount. 
The Department does not guarantee the use of any or all of the Contract amount.  The 
final Contract amount will be determined by the actual work authorized and performed 
at bid prices.   

D. Contract.

This Contract, which may be amended, modified, or supplemented in writing only, 
consists of the Contract documents as defined in the Plans, Standard Specifications, 
March 2020 Edition, Standard Details March 2020 Edition as updated through 
advertisement, Supplemental Specifications, Special Provisions, and Contract 
Agreement.   It is agreed and understood that this Contract will be governed by the 
documents listed above.

E. Certifications.

By signing below, the Contractor hereby certifies that to the best of the Contractor’s 
knowledge and belief:

1. All of the statements, representations, covenants, and/or certifications required or 
set forth in the Bid and the Bid Documents, including those in the Contract are still 
complete and accurate as of the date of this Agreement.

2. The Contractor knows of no legal, contractual, or financial impediment to entering 
into this Contract.

3. The person signing below is legally authorized by the Contractor to sign this 
Contract on behalf of the Contractor and to legally bind the Contractor to the terms 
of the Contract.
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F.    Offer.

The undersigned, having carefully examined the site of work, the Plans, Standard
Specifications March 2020 Edition, Standard Details March 2020 Edition as updated 
through advertisement, Supplemental Specifications, Special Provisions, and Contract 
Agreement; contained herein for On Call Milling Machines and Grinders, in the 
Regions awarded in the State of Maine, on which bids will be received until the time 
specified in the “Notice to Contractors” do(es) hereby bid and offer to enter into this 
contract to supply all the materials, tools, equipment and labor to construct the whole 
of the Work in strict accordance with the terms and conditions of this Contract at the 
unit prices in the attached “Schedule of Items.”

The Offeror agrees to perform the work required at the price specified above and in 
accordance with the bids provided in the attached “Schedule of Items” in strict 
accordance with the terms of this solicitation, and to provide the appropriate insurance 
if this offer is accepted by the Government in writing.  

As Offeror also agrees:

First:  To do any extra work, not covered by the attached “Schedule of Items,” which 
may be ordered by the Resident, and to accept as full compensation the amount 
determined upon a “Force Account” basis as provided in the Standard Specifications, 
March 2020 Edition, and as addressed in the contract documents.

Second:  That this offer shall remain open for 30 calendar days after the date of 
opening of bids.

Third:  The Bidder hereby certifies, to the best of its knowledge and belief that:  the 
Bidder has not, either directly or indirectly, entered into any agreement, participated in 
any collusion, or otherwise taken any action in restraint of competitive bidding in
connection with its bid, and its subsequent contract with the Department.
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IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the Contractor, for itself, its successors and assigns, hereby 
execute this Agreement and thereby binds itself to all covenants, terms, and obligations 
contained in the Contract Documents.

CONTRACTOR

____________________________ _______________________________________
Date (Signature of Legally Authorized Representative

of the Contractor)

____________________________ _______________________________________
Witness (Name and Title Printed)

G. Award.  Your offer is hereby accepted for (see checked boxes):   

Your offer is hereby accepted for (see checked boxes):

Region 1 ____________________
Region 2 ____________________
Region 3 ____________________
Region 4 ____________________
Region 5 ____________________

The original contract amount is: $___________________________________________
________________________________________________________.

This award consummates the Contract, and the documents referenced herein.  

MAINE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

________________________________ _________________________________

Date        By: Benjamin W. Foster
Bridge Maintenance Engineer
Bureau of Maintenance & Operations
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Regions 1-5
On Call Milling Machines and Grinders

February 13, 2021

1 of 1

SPECIAL PROVISION
SECTION 107

TIME
(Contract Time)

The Contract shall commence no sooner than April 1, 2021.

Work will be assigned under these contracts beginning after contract execution and 
continuing until March 31, 2022.
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Regions 1 - 5
On Call Milling Machines and Grinders

February 13, 2021

Page 1 of 2

SPECIAL PROVISION 
SECTION 202

REMOVING STRUCTURES AND OBSTRUCTIONS
(Removing Pavement Surface & Removing Concrete Surface)

The March 2020 Revision of the Standard Specifications, Section 202 - Removing 
Structures and Obstructions, subsection 202.061-Removing Pavement Surface, has been 
removed and replaced in its entirety by the following: 

202.061 Removing Pavement Surface   The equipment for removing the bituminous 
surface shall be a power operated milling machine or grinder capable of removing 
bituminous concrete pavement to the required depth, transverse cross slope, and profile 
grade using an automated grade and slope control system. The controls shall automatically 
increase or decrease the pavement removal depth as required, and readily maintain desired 
cross slope, to compensate for surface irregularities in the existing pavement course. The 
equipment shall be capable of accurately establishing profile grades by referencing from a 
fixed reference such as a 30 foot minimum contact ski (floating beam), 24 foot non-contact 
ski (floating beam) with 3 or more sensors; or 3 non-contact sensors directly affixed at the 
fore, mid, and aft points of the milling machine. Systems designed to incorporate a contact 
sensor located at the mid-point of the milling machine in lieu of the non-contact sensor will 
be permitted.  Grade control sensors shall all be located on the same side. A single sensor, 
contact or otherwise, shall not be permitted unless otherwise approved by the Department.  

The rotary drum shall be a minimum of 7 feet in width and utilize carbide tip tools at a 
minimum triple wrap configuration. The difference in height from the top of any ridge to 
the bottom of the groove adjacent to that ridge shall not exceed ¼ inch. The forward speed 
of the milling machine shall be adjusted to produce a milled surface meeting the groove 
spacing, groove depth, and surface tolerance requirements of this specification. The tool
s on the revolving cutting drum must be continually maintained and shall be replaced as 
warranted to provide a uniform pavement texture. The Department may evaluate the texture 
of the milled surface for information purposes by performing the Sand Patch test according 
to ASTM E 965.

The Contractor shall locate and remove all objects in the pavement through the work area 
that would be detrimental to the milling or grinding machine.  Any structures or 
obstructions left within the travel lane or shoulders shall have tapers installed according to 
Standard Detail 202(01). The finished milled surface will be inspected before being 
accepted, and any deviations in the profile exceeding ½ inch under a 16 foot string line or 
straightedge placed parallel to the centerline will be corrected. Any deviations in the cross-
slope that exceed 3/8 inch under a 10 foot string line or straightedge placed transversely to
centerline will be corrected. All corrections will be made with approved methods and
materials. Any areas that require corrective measures will be subject to the same acceptance 
tolerances. Excess material that becomes bonded to the milled surface will be removed to 
the Resident’s satisfaction before the area is accepted.  
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Regions 1 - 5
On Call Milling Machines and Grinders

February 13, 2021

Page 2 of 2

The following is added to Section 202 - Removing Structures and Obstructions:

Method of Measurement Removing Pavement Surface and Removing Concrete 
Surface will be measured for payment by the square yard with no deductions made for 
areas occupied by existing obstructions.

Basis of Payment The square yard contract price will be full compensation for labor, 
supervision, cleaning of the milled surface, and all other incidentals required to complete 
the work. Hauling and stockpiling of the material will not be paid for directly but will be 
considered incidental to the milling items.

Payment will be made under:

Pay Item Pay Unit
202.2020 Removing Pavement Surface – Less than 2,500 square yards Square Yard
202.2029 Removing Pavement Surface – Greater than 2,500 square yards  Square Yard
202.302 Removing Concrete Surface – Less than 2,500 square yards  Square Yard
202.303 Removing Concrete Surface - Greater than 2,500 square yards  Square Yard
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