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Bid Tabulation Sheet
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BOSTON

PORTLAND

PORTSMOUTH

www.harriman.com

Contractor

Base Bid

Alternates

Unit Prices

Addenda

Proprietary Products List

Bond

Alternate No 1: Building

Area Expansion

Alternate No 2: Resilient

Athletic Flooring

Alternate No 3: LVT

Flooring

Alternate No 4: Carpet

Alternate No 5: Light
Fixture Replacement

Alternate No 6: Not Used

Alternate No 7: Window

Trim

Alternate No 8: Dome

Skylight

Alternate No 9: Exterior
Wall Bump-Outs

Alternate No 10: Fire Road

Width

Alternate No 11: Storage

131 Renovations

1 Excavation of unsuitable

material/ removal/

structural fill
2 Excavation unsuitable

material - open

3 Excavation unsuitable

material - trench

4 Excavation/backfill -

open

5 Excavation/backfill -

trench

6 Rock blasting/survey

7 Rock excavation - open

8 Rock excavation - trench

9 Granular borrow (off-

site)

10 Gravel base Type A (off-

site)

11 Gravel subbase (off-

site)

12 Structural Fill (off-site)

13 Crushed Stone

14 Bit. Pavement MDOT

HMA 9.5mm

15 Bit. Pavement MDOT

HMA 19mm

Addendum No. 1
Addendum No. 2

Addendum No. 3

Addendum No. 4

Fire Alarm Control Panel
Manufacturer/Cost

Manufacturer/Cost

Manufacturer/Cost

Clock System

Card Access System/ Video

Manufacturer/Cost

Intrusion Detection System

Manufacturer/Cost

Classroom Audio Syst.
Manufacturer/Cost

Bid Bond

100% Performance

100% Payment

Arthur C. Dudley
Contractor Builder Inc.
95 Blake Road
Standish, ME 04084

$5,480,376.00

$50,257.00

$101,864.00

$43,335.00

$3,226.00

$97,930.00

($11,279.00)

($3,290.00)

($25,418.00)

($14,000.00)

($5,096.00)

$45.00( $25.00

$50.00

$20.00

$30.00

$3,500.00

$250.00

$250.00

$25.00

$35.00

$28.00

$35.00

$40.00

$150.00

$150.00

Edwards
$32,200.00

Valcom
$35,141.00

Valcom
$22,396.00

Avigilon
$96,973.00

Bosch
$51,433.00

Light Speed
$72,683.00

Berkley
Insurance
Company

Blane Casey Building
Contractor, Inc.

757 Riverside Drive
Augusta, ME 04330

$5,057,609.00

$42,337.00

$86,567.00

$41,596.00

$2,798.00

$97,133.00

($22,734.00)

($6,470.00)

($14,347.00)

($14,000.00)

($10,181.00)

$45.00( $25.00

$50.00

$20.00

$30.00

$3,500.00

$250.00

$250.00

$25.00

$35.00

$28.00

$35.00

$40.00

$150.00

$150.00

Edwards
$32,200.00

Valcom
$35,141.00

Valcom
$22,396.00

Avigilon
$96,973.00

Bosch
$51,433.00

Light Speed
$72,683.00

Berkley
Insurance
Company

Bowman Contractors
552 Moosehead Trail
Newport, ME 04953

No Bid

Doten's Construction, Inc.
175 S Freeport Road
Freeport, ME 04032

$5,449,700.00

$64,980.00

$81,430.00

$29,400.00

$7,500.00

$91,809.00

($12,400.00)

($1,800.00)

($12,000.00)

($12,500.00)

($6,000.00)

$48.00( $27.00

$52.50

$21.00

$32.00

$3,675.00

$263.00

$263.00

$27.00

$37.00

$30.00

$37.00

$42.00

$158.00

$158.00

Edwards
$32,200.00

Valcom
$30,557.00

Valcom
$19,475.00

Avigilon
$84,324.00

Bosch
$44,725.00

Light Speed
$63,203.00

Merchants
Bonding
Company

Ducas Construction, Inc.
3 Southgate Road #8
Scarborough, ME 04074

No Bid

Ganneston Construction
Corp

3025 N Belgrade Avenue
Augusta, ME 04330

Did not attend
mandatory walk
thru

Great Falls Construction
20 Mechanic Street
Gorham, ME 04038

$5,281,101.00

$48,660.00

$102,781.00

$32,869.00

$3,855.00

$100,554.00

($5,948.00)

($11,080.00)

($13,143.00)

($13,300.00)

($5,421.00)

$50.49( $28.05

$56.10

$22.44

$33.66

$3,927.00

$280.50

$280.50

$28.05

$39.27

$31.42

$39.27

$44.88

$168.30

$168.30

Edwards
$36,129.00

Valcom
$39,429.00

Valcom
$25,129.00

Avigilon
$108,804.00

Bosch
$57,708.00

Light Speed
$81,551.00

Westfield
Insurance
Company

Harvey Construction
Corporation

10 Harvey Road Bedford,
ME 03110

No Bid

Jewett Construction Co.
51 US Route 1, Suite R2
Scarborough, ME 04074

Did not attend
mandatory walk
thru

Ledgewood Construction
27 Main Street South
Portland, ME 04106

$5,134,892.00

$57,175.00

$83,415.00

$21,617.00

$2,523.00

$91,896.00

($10,836.00)

($2,000.00)

($22,880.00)

($14,000.00)

($7,125.00)

$45.00( $25.00

$50.00

$20.00

$30.00

$3,500.00

$250.00

$250.00

$25.00

$35.00

$28.00

$35.00

$40.00

$150.00

$150.00

Edwards
$32,200.00

Valcom
$35,141.00

Valcom
$22,396.00

Avigilon
$96,973.00

Bosch
$51,433.00

Light Speed
$72,683.00

Berkley
Insurance
Company

Ouellet Construction
56 Bibber Pkwy Brunswick,
ME 04011

No Bid

PC Construction Company
131 Presumpscot Street
Portland, ME 04103

No Bid

Warren Construction
Group

8 Lambert Road Freeport,
ME 04032

No Bid

Wright-Ryan
Construction, Inc.
10 Danforth Street
Portland, ME 04101

Did not attend
mandatory walk
thru




