REGION 1 - 2014 Lanscape Task Order Contract

Gordon Norpine kosengren | Wingate [ Wingate
Gordon | TotalItem | Norpine | Total Item | Rosengren{ Total ltem | Unit | Total tem
Ttern No Schedule of Items Item Description Qty Unit  |Unit Prices Cost | Unit Prices Cost | Unit Prices Cost Cost
304.09 |[Aggregate Base Course- crushed Type A 3 CY 0] 72.00 3000 130.00 30051 129.00 no bid
411.131 |6" Compacted stone dust gravel base 100 SF 100.00 200.00 400.00 no bid
613.319 |Erosion Control Blanket 10 SY 20.60 40.00 22.00 no bid
615.07 |Loam 5 CY 195.00 250.00 210.00 no bid
616.08 |[Sod 100 SY 425.00 500.00 750.00 no bid
617.35 [Compost 5 CY 205.00 250.00 230.00 no bid
617.381 |Erosion Control Mulch 10 CY 390.00 560.00 420.00 no bid
618.13 [Seeding Method Number | 10 1,000 SF 380.00 490.00 450.00 no hid
618.14  |Seeding Method Number 2 20 1,000 SF 760.00 1000.00 840.00 no bid
618.141 |Seeding Method Number 3 10 1,000 SF 380.00 600.00 500.00 no bid
619.13  |Bark Mulch 5 CY 195.00 250.00 215.00 no bid
621.014 |Evergreen Trees 187 —24” Gr A ) 24 Each 528.00 600.00 576.00 no bid
621.025 |Evergreen Trees 3’- 4’ B&B Gr A 10 Each 510.00 600.00 540.00 no bid
621.026 |Evergreen Trees 3>- 4’ B&B Gr B 10 Each 570.00 650.00 630.00 no bid
621.031 |Evergreen Trees 4°- 5” B&B Gr A 10 Each 670.00 800.00 850.00 no bid
621.032 |Evergreen Trees 4°- 5 B&B GrB 10 Each 740.00 1100.00 1060.00 no bid
621.037 |Evergreen Trees 5'- 6’ B&B Gr A 10 Each 1230.00 1500.00 1300.00 no bid
621.038 |Evergreen Trees 5’- 6’ B&B GrB 10 Each 1280.00 15060.00 1380.00 no bid
621.039 |Evergreen Trees 5°- 6’ B&B Gr C 10 Each 1380.00 1600.00 1550.00 no bid
621.043 |Evergreen Trees 6°- 8’ B&B Gr A 10 Fach 1520.00 1800.00 1800.00 no bid
621.044 |Evergreen Trees 6°- 8° B&B Gr B 10 Each 1560.00 1800.00 1800.00 no bid
621.045 |Evergreen Trees 6'- 8" B&B Gr C 10 Each 1900.00 2250.00 2100.00 no bid
621.046 |Evergreen Trees 8’- 10’ B&B Gr A 10 Each 2420.00 3000.00 2830.00 no bid
621.047 |Evergreen Trees 8°- 10° B&B Gr B 10 Each 2660.00 3300.00 3100.00 no bid
621.048 |Evergreen Trees 8’- 10" B&B Gr C 10 Each 2830.00 3750.00 3360.00 no bid
621.101 |Plug/starter plant 2”cont. 6 min. 50 Each 198.00 250.00 200.00 no bid
621.122 |Small Decid Trees 57~ 6’multi Gr C 1 Each 114.00 125.00 122.00 no bid
621.127 1Small Decid Trees 6’- 8 Gr B 10 Each 1480.00 1750.00 1580.00 no bid
621.184 |Med Decid Trees 87-10’multi Gr A 3 Each 579.00 600.00 624.00 no bid
621.202 |Med Decid Trees 27-2 % "cal B&B Gr B 3 Each £10.00 975.00 861.00 no bid
621.247 |Lg. Decid Trees4’-5 Gr A 3 Each 153.00 210.00 189.00 no bid




REGION 1 - 2014 Lanscape Task Order Contract

Gordon Norpine Rosengren | wingate | wingate
Gordon | Total Item | Norpine | Total Item | Rosengren | Total Iterm |  Unit | Total Ttem
Itern No Schedule of Ytems Item Description Qty Unit Unit Prices Cost Unit Prices Cost Unit Prices Cost Prices Cost
621.249 |Lg. Decid Trees 6’-8’ Gr A 3 Each 0! 354.00 B! 405.00 010]  360.00 id no bid
621.255 [Lg. Decid Trees 8°-10° Gr A 3 Each 510.00 750.00 549.00 no bid
621.267 |Lg. Decid Trees 1% -2 cal Gr A 3 Each 669.00 750.00 780.00 no bid
621.273 |Lg. Decid Trees 2-2% ” cal B&B Gr A 6 Each 1782.00 1950.00 1800.00 no bid
621.279 Lé- Decid Trees 24 -3” cal B&B Gr A 6 Each 1938.00 2100.00 2016.00 no bid
621.285 |Lg. Decid Trees 3-3 1/27 cal B&B Gr A 3 Each 1230.00 1260.00 1251.00 no bid
621.297 [Lg. Decid Trees4-4 1/2” cal B&B Gr A 1 Each 59400 600.00 590.00 no bid
621.389 |Evergreen Shrubs 157-18” cont. Gr B 10 Each 420.00 450.00 420.00 no bid
621.396 |Evergreen Shrubs 18" -24" GrB 10 Each 420.00 500.00 460.00 no bid
621.397 |Evergreen Shrubs 18”-24” Gr C 10 Each 420.00 550.00 460.00 no bid
621.401 |Evergreen Shrubs 2°- 2 '2” Group A 10 Each 400.00 600.00 510.00 no bid
621.402 }Evergreen Shrubs 2°-2 4" cont. Gr B 10 Each 450.00 700.00 580.00 no bid
621404 |Evergreen Shrubs 3’-4” Group C 10 Each 790.00 1250.00 960.00 no bid
621.487 |Broadleaf Evergreens 18"-24"Gr A 10 Each 370.00 550.00 520.00 no bid
621.498 |Broadleaf Evergreens 212 *-3°Gr A 10 Fach 710.00 850.00 £70.00 no bid
621.51 |Decid Shrubs 15”°-18” . Group A 10 Each 210.00 300.00 300.00 no bid
621.54 Decid Shrubs 187-24" Group A 10 Each 270.00 340.00 300.00 no bid
621.546 |Decid Shrubs 2°-3" Group A 10 Each 310.00 390.00 360.00 no bid
621.552 |Decid Shrubs 3’-4* Group A 10 Each 390.00 450.00 440.00 no bid
621.558 |Decid Shrubs 4°-5° Group A 10 Each 640.00 800.00 820.00 no bid
621.654 |Vines 12" - 15" Group A 1 Each 16.00 15.00 18.00 no bid
621.661 |Vines 18" - 24" Group C 1 Each 23.00 25.00 24.00 no bid
621.71 |Perennials & Groundcovers 1gal. Group A 20 Each 230.00 360.00 260.00 no bid
621.711 |Perennials 1 gal. Group B 20 Each 250.00 360.00 280.00 no bid
621.713 |Perennials & Groundcovers 1 Quart cont. 20 Each 175.00 300.00 200.00 no bid
629.05 |Hand Labor, Straight Time 24 HR 936.00 1152.00 960.00 no bid
631.08 |Generator 1 LS 30.00 35.00 160.00 no bid
631.12 |Excavator and operator 8 HR. 600.00 680.00 640.00 no bid
631.122 [Mini-excavator and operator 8 HR 600.00 600.00 640.00 no bid
631.133 [Skid Steer/Bobcat and operator 8 HR 520.00 600.00 600.00 no bid
631.18 |Chainsaw and operator 1 LS 47.00 440.00 384.00 no bid




REGION 1 - 2014 Lanscape Task Order Contract

Gordon Normine Rosengren| Wingate | "Wingaie
Gordon | TotalItem } Norpine | Total Item | Rosengren | Total Item Unit | Total Ttem
Ttem No Schedule of Items Item Description Oty Unit | Unit Prices Cost | Unit Prices Cost | Unit Prices Cost Cost
631.2  |Stump Grinder and operator 1 LS BER0EE|  65.00  [Hies0.0c 650.00 48 548,00 no bid
631.111 |Hammer Drill and operator 1 LS ' 40.00 400.00 400.00 no bid
642.19  |Granite Post 2 Each 238.00 390.00 310.00 no bid
659.101 |Mobilization (Lump Sum) 1 LS wi| 32500 | il 900,00 1 350.00 no bid
Totals 43,226.00 54,842.00 50,738.00 no bid




REGION 2 - 2014 Lanscape Task Order Contract

Gordon Norpine Rosengren Wingate
Gordon | Total Item { Norpine | Total Item | Rosengren | Total Item | Wingate | Total Item
Item No Schedule of Items Item Description Qty Unit | Unit Prices Cost | Unit Prices Cost | Unit Prices Cost | Unit Prices Cost

304.09 Aggregate Base Course- crushed Type A 3 CYy [ i 150.00 51001 105.00 | 129.00 150.00
411.131 16" Compacted stone dust gravel base 100 SF 200.00 500.00 400.00 375.00
613.319  |Erosion Control Blanket 10 SY 20.00 40.00 22.00 45.00
615.07 Loam 5 CY 175.00 250.00 210.00 190.00
616.08 Sod 100 8Y 399.00 500.00 750.00 625.00
617.35 Compost 5 CY 195.00 250.00 230.00 200.00
617.381 Erosion Control Mulch 10 CY 340.00 400.00 420.00 350.00
618.1301 |Seeding Method Number 1 10 1,000 SF 370.00 490.00 450.00 500.00
618.1401 |Seeding Method Number 2 20 1,000 SF 740.00 1600.00 840.00 1000.00
618.1411 |Seeding Method Number 3 10 1,000 SF 390.00 600.00 500.00 650.00
619.1301 [Bark Mulch 5 CY 185.00 275.00 200.00 210.00
621.014  |Evergreen Trees 187~ 247" Gr A 24 Each 336.00 600.00 576.00 720.00
621.025  |Evergreen Trees 3°- 4° B&B Gr A 10 Each 510.00 600.00 540.00 690.00
621.026  |Evergreen Trees 3'- 4’ B&B Gr B 10 Each 560.00 650.00 630.00 690.00
621.031  [Evergreen Trees 4’- 5> B&B Gr A 10 Each 740.00 800.00 850.00 890.00
621.032 Evergreen Trees 4’- 3° B&B Gr B 10 Each 790.00 1100.00 1020.00 §90.00
621.037 |Evergreen Trees 5°- 6' B&B Gr A 10 Each $90.00 1500.00 1300.00 1100.00
621.038  |Evergreen Trees 5°- 6" B&B GrB 10 Each 1040.00 1500.00 1380.00 1100.00
621.039  |Evergreen Trees 5°- 6’ B&B Gr C 10 Each 1040.00 1600.00 1550.00 1150.00
621.043  |Evergreen Trees 6’- 8" B&B Gr A 10 Each 1240.00 1800.00 1700.00 1400.00
621.044 Everéreen Trees 6’- 8 B&B GrB 10 Each 1240.00 1600.00 1800.00 1500.00
621.045 Evergreen Trees 6°- 8' B&B GrC 10 Each 1480.00 2250.00 2100.60 1600.00
621.046 Evergreen Trees 8°- 10° B&B Gr A 10 Each 2230.00 3000.00 2830.00 2350.00
621.047 Evergreen Trees 87- 10° B&B Gr B 10 Each 2230.00 3300.00 3100.00 2400.00
621.048 Evergreen Trees 8- 10° B&B Gr C 10 Each 2230.00 3600.00 3360.00 2550.00
621.101 Plug/starter plant 2”cont. 6 min. 50 Each 149.50 200.00 200.00 157.50
621.122 Small Decid Trees 5°- 6’multi Gr C 1 Fach 84.00 125.00 122.00 125.00
621.127  |Small Decid Trees 6°- 8’ Gr B 10 Each 990.00 1650.00 1580.00 1450.00
621.184  |Med Decid Trees 8°-10"multi Gr A 3 Each 474.00 600.00 624.00 525.00
621.202  |Med Decid Trees 2”-2 ¥ "cal B&B Gr B 3 Each 669.00 975.00 861.00 696.00
621.247 Lg. Decid Trees4’-53" Gr A 3 Each 117.00 210.00 189.00 22500




REGION 2 - 2014 Lanscape Task Order Contract

Gordon Norpine Kosengren wingate
Total Item | Norpine { Total Ttem | Rosengren | Total Item Total Item

Item No Schedule of Items Item Description Qty Cost Unit Prices Cost Unit Prices Cost Cost
621.249  |Lg Decid Trees 6>-8° Gr A 3 297.00 0000 405.00  [H11200 360.00 375.00
621.255 |Lg. Decid Trees 8’-10° Gr A 3 387.00 750.00 549.00 450.00
621.267 {Lg Decid Trees 1% ™-2cal Gr A 3 564.00 750.00 780.00 675.00

621.273  |Lg. Decid Trees 2-2% ” cal B&B Gr A 6 1338.00 1950.00 1758.00 1500.00

621.279 |Lg. Decid Trees 2% -3” cal B&B Gr A 6 1488.00 2100.00 1992.00 1740.00

621.285 |Lg. Decid Trees 3-3 1/2”cal B&B Gr A 3 981.00 1260.00 1251.00 1005.00
621.297 |Lg. Decid Trees 4- 4 1/2” cal B&B Gr A 1 422.00 550.00 590.00 475.00
621.389  |Evergreen Shrubs 15”-18” cont. Gr B 10 290.00 450.00 420.00 350.00
621.396  |Evergreen Shrubs 18" -24" Gr B 10 370.00 500.00 460.00 420.00
621397 |Evergreen Shrubs 18- 24” Gr C 10 370.00 550.00 460.00 450.00
621401  |Evergreen Shrubs 2’- 2 %’ Group A 10 440.00 600.00 510.00 500.00
621.402  |Evergreen Shrubs 2’- 2 14’ cont. Gr B 10 440.00 700.00 580.00 500.00
621.404  |Evergreen Shrubs 3°- 4 Group C 10 490.00 1250.00 960.00 650.00
621.487  |Broadleaf Evergreens 18"-24"Gr A 10 390.00 550.00 520.00 500.00
621.498  |Broadleaf Evergreens 2% *-3’Gr A 10 390.00 850.00 870.00 600.00
62151  |Decid Shrubs 157-18” . Group A 10 200.00 300.00 300.00 320.00
621.54 Decid Shrubs 187-24” Group A 10 280.00 340.00 300.00 350.00
621.546  |Decid Shrubs 2°-3’ Group A 10 300.00 390.00 360.00 400.00
621.552  |Decid Shrubs 3’-4° Group A 10 340.00 440.00 440.00 430.00
621.558  |Decid Shrubs 4°-5° Group A 10 500.00 750.00 820.00 620.00
621.654  |Vines 12" - 15" Group A 1 16.00 15.00 13.00 30.00
621.661  |Vines 18" - 24" Group C 1 23.00 25.00 24.00 32.00
621.71 Perennials & Groundcovers 1gal. Group A 20 240.00 360.00 260.00 300.00
621.711 Perennials 1 gal. Group B 20 240.00 360.00 280.00 300.00
621.713  |Perennials & Groundcovers 1 Quart cont. 20 175.00 300.00 200.00 240.00
629.05 Hand Labor, Straight Time 24 888.00 1080.00 960.00 960.00
631.08 Generator 1 25.00 35.00 160.00 500.00
631.12 Excavator and operator 3 600.00 640.00 640.00 920.00
631.122  {Mini-excavator and operator 3 560.00 600.00 640.00 560.00
631.133  |Skid Steer/Bobcat and operator 8 520.00 600.00 600.00 560.00
631.18 Chainsaw and operator 1 40.00 440.00 384.00 400.00




REGION 2 - 2014 Lanscape Task Order Contract

(ordon Norpine Rosengren Wingate
Gordon | Total Itermn | Notpine | Total Item: | Rosengren | Total Item | Wingate | Total Item
Item No Schedule of Items Item Description Qty Unit | Unit Prices Cost | Unit Prices Cost | Unit Prices Cost | Unit Prices Cost

631.2 Stump Grinder and operator 1 LS 6 65.00 o0t L[ 650.00 48.0 54800 |1:800:00:07 800.00
631.111  |Hammer Drill and operator 1 LS 40.00 400.00 400.00 | 700.00
64219  |Granite Post 2 Each 280.00 390.00 310.00 600.00
659.101 Mobilization (Lump Sum) 1 s 240.00 600.00 350.00 375.00
Totals 36,532.50 54,000.00 50,517.00 46,090.50




REGION 3 - 2014 Lanscape Task Order Contract

Gordon Norpine Rosengren wingate
Gordon | Total Item | Norpine | Total Itemn | Rosengren | Total Jtem | Wingate | Total Iiem

Itemn No Schedule of Items Item Description Qty Unit | Unit Prices Cost Cost | Unit Prices Cost | Unit Prices Cost
304.09 Aggregate Base Course- crushed Type A 3 CY 72.00 120.00 50101 150.00 nobidi il nobid
411.131 |6" Compacted stone dust gravel base 100 SF 400.00 500,00 500.00 no bid
613319  |Erosion Control Blanket 10 SY 24.50 40.00 25.00 no bid
615.07 Loam 5 CY 220.00 250.00 240.00 no bid
616.08 Sod 100 SY 600.00 500.00 850.00 no bid
617.35 Compost 5 CY 220.00 250.00 240.00 no bid
617.381  |Erosion Control Mulch 10 CY 390.00 400.60 450.00 no bid
618.1301 |Seeding Method Number 1 10 1,000 SF 350.00 490.00 500.00 no bid
618.1401 |Seeding Method Number 2 20 1,000 SF 700.00 800.00 900.00 1o bid
618.1411 |Seeding Method Number 3 10 1,000 SF 390.00 600.00 530.00 1o bid
619.1301 |Bark Mulch 5 CcY 220.00 275.00 230.00 Do bid
621.014  |Evergreen Trees 187 — 24" Gr A 24 Each 504.00 600.00 672.00 no bid
621.025 |Evergreen Trees 3°-4” B&B Gr A 10 Each 570.00 600.00 560.00 no bid
621.026  |Evergreen Trees 3’- 4’ B&B GrB 10 Each 590.60 650.00 660.00 no bid
621.031 |Evergreen Trees 4’- 5’ B&B Gr A 10 Each 830.00 800.00 940.00 no bid
621.032  |Evergreen Trees 4’- 5 B&B GrB 10 Each 960.00 1050.00 1220.00 no bid
621.037  |Evergreen Trees 5°- 6’ B&B Gr A 10 Each 1290.00 1500.00 1430.00 no bid
621.038  |Evergreen Trees 5°- 6” B&B GrB 10 Each 1240.00 1500.00 1480.60 no bid
621.039 |Evergreen Trees 5°- 6’ B&B GrC 10 Each 1400.00 1600.00 1700.00 10 bid
621.043  |Evergreen Trees 6'- 8° B&B Gr A 10 Each 1560.00 1800.00 1850.00 no bid
621.044  |Evergreen Trees 6°- 8° B&B GrB 10 Each 1600.00 1600.00 1950.00 no bid
621.045  |Evergreen Trees 6°- 8° B&B Gr C 10 Each 1950.00 2250.00 2200.00 no bid
621.046  |Evergreen Trees 8°- 10° B&B Gr A 10 Each 2900.00 3000.00 2900.00 no bid
621.047  |Evergreen Trees 8- 10° B&B Gr B 10 Each 3000.00 3300.00 3200.00 no bid
621.048  |Evergreen Trees 8°- 10’ B&B Gr C 10 Each 3370.00 3600.00 3450.00 no bid
621.101  {Plug/starter plant 2”cont. §” min. 50 Each 195.00 200.00 250.00 no bid
621.122 | Small Decid Trees 5’- 6’noulti Gr C 1 Each 110.00 125.00 128.00 no bid
621.127  |Small Decid Trees 6'- 8 Gr B 10 Each 1450.00 1650.00 1580.00 1o bid
621.184  |Med Decid Trees 8’-10’multi Gr A 3 Each 630.00 600.00 654.00 no bid
621202 |Med Decid Trees 27-2 ' “cal B&B Gr B 3 Each 816.00 975.00 894.00 no bid
621.247 |Lg. Decid Trees4’-5" GrA 3 Each 150.00 210.00 207.00 no bid




REGION 3 - 2014 Lanscape Task Order Contract

Gordon Norpine Rosengren wingate
Gordon | Total Itern | Norpine | Total Item | Rosengren | Total Ttem { Wingate | Total Item

Ttem No Schedule of Items Item Description Qty Unit | Unit Prices Cost | Unit Prices Cost | Unit Prices Cost | Unit Prices Cost
621.249 |Lg Decid Trees 6'-8" Gr A 3 Each 351.00 00 405,00 366.00 no bid
621.255 Lg. Decid Trees 8°-10° Gr A 3 Each 561.00 750.00 579.00 no bid
621.267 |Lg. Decid Trees 1% - 2 cal Gr A 3 Each 654.00 750.00 840.00 no bid
621273 |Lg. Decid Trees 2-2% ” cal B&B Gr A 6 Each 1770.00 1950.00 1860.00 no bid
621.279  |Lg. Decid Trees 2% -3” cal B&B Gr A 6 Each 1560.00 2100.00 1992.00 no bid
621285 |Lg. Decid Trees 3-3 1/2” cal B&B Gr A 3 Each 1215.00 1260.00 1251.00 no bid
621.297  [Lg. Decid Trees 4-4 1/2” cal B&B Gr A 1 Each 540.00 550.00 620.00 no bid
621.389  |Evergreen Shrubs 157-18” cont. Gr B 10 Each 420.00 450.00 440.00 no bid
621.396  |Evergreen Shrubs 18" -24" GrB 10 Each 480.00 500.00 520.00 no bid
621.397  |Evergreen Shrubs 18- 24” Gr C 10 Each 410.00 550.00 500.00 no bid
621.401  |Evergreen Shrubs 2°- 2 14" Group A 10 Each 520.00 600.00 570.00 no bid
621.402  {Evergreen Shrubs 2°- 2 14’ cont. Gr B 10 Each 580.00 700.00 650.00 no bid
621404  |Evergreen Shrubs 3°’- 4’ Group C 10 Each 1140.00 1250.00 1030.00 no bid
621.487  |Broadleaf Evergreens 18"-24"Gr A 10 Each 380.00 550.00 550.00 no bid
621498  |Broadleaf Evergreens 2% *-3°Gr A 10 Each 400.00 850.00 870.00 no bid
621.51 Decid Shrubs 157-18" . Group A 10 Each 210.00 300.00 330.00 no bid
621.54 Decid Shrubs 187-24” Group A 10 Each 270.00 340.00 330.00 no bid
621.546  |Decid Shrubs 2’-3° Group A 10 Each 370.00 390.00 400.00 no bid
621.552  |Decid Shrubs 3°-4> Group A 10 Each 410.00 440.00 500.00 no bid
621.558  |Decid Shrubs 4°-5” Group A 10 Each 780.00 750.00 870.00 no bid
621.654  |Vines 12" - 15" Group A 1 Each 14.00 15.00 20.00 no bid
621.661 |Vines 18" - 24" Group C 1 Each 28.00 25.00 24.00 no bid
621.71 Perennials & Groundcovers 1gal. Group A 20 Each 220.00 300.00 280.00 no bid
621.711  [Perennials 1 gal. Group B 20 Each 280.00 360.00 320.00 no bid
621.713  |Perennials & Groundcovers 1 Quart cont. 20 Each 160.00 300.00 200.00 no bid
629.05 Hand Labor, Straight Time 24 HR 912.00 1080.00 960.00 no bid
631.08 Generator 1 LS 28.00 35.00 160.00 no bid
631.12 Excavator and operator 8 HR 584.00 640.00 720.60 no bid
631.122  |Mini-excavator and operator 8 HR 584.00 600.00 680.00 no bid
631.133  |Skid Steer/Bobcat and operator g HR 424.00 600.00 640.00 no bid
631.18 Chainsaw and operator 1 LS 45.00 440.00 400.00 10 bid




REGION 3 - 2014 Lanscape Task Order Contract

Gordon Norpine Rosengren Wingate
Gordon | Total Item | Norpine | Total Item | Rosengren | Total Item Wingate | Total Item

Ttem No Schedule of Items Item Description Qty Unit | Unit Prices Cost | Unit Prices Cost | Unit Prices Cost | Unit Prices Cost
631.2 Stump Grinder and operator 1 LS : i1 6s5.00 [ 650.00  PEge20000  620.00 idibH no bid
631.111 Hammer Drill and operator 1 LS 45.00 400.00 400.00 no bid
642.19 Granite Post 2 Each 234.00 390.00 370.00 no bid
659.101  |Mobilization (Lump Sum) 1 LS A, | 475.00 o 550.00 850.00 no bid
Totals 45,820.50 53,655.00 54,252.00 1o bid




REGION 4 - 2014 Lanscape Task Order Contract

(oraon Norpine Rosengren wmgate
Gordon | TotalItem | Norpine | Total Item | Rosengren | Total Item | Wingate | Total Item

Item No Schedule of Items Item Description Qty Unit | Unit Prices Cost | Unit Prices Cost | Unit Prices Cost | Unit Prices Cost
304.09 Aggregate Base Course- crushed Type A 3 CY { 7200 135.00 46 138.00 | no bid
411.131  |6" Compacted stone dust gravel base 100 SF 400.00 1000.00 500.00 no bid
613.319  |Erosion Control Blanket 10 SY 24.50 40.00 25.00 no bid
615.07 Loam 5 CY 220.00 250.00 235.00 no bid
616.08 Sed 100 SY 600.00 600.00 800.00 no bid
617.35 Compost 5 CY 220.00 250.00 230.00 no bid
617381  |Erosion Control Mulch 10 CY 440.00 400.00 450.00 no bid
618.1301 |Seeding Method Number 1 10 1,000 SF 390.00 490.00 500.00 no bid
618.1401 |Seeding Method Number 2 20 1,000 SF 760.00 800.00 900.00 no bid
618.1411 |Seeding Method Number 3 10 1,000 SF 380.00 600.00 530.00 no bid
619.1301 |Bark Mulch 5 CY 220.00 275.00 225.00 no bid
621.014  |Evergreen Trees 187~ 24" Gr A 24 Each 504.00 600.00 672.00 no bid
621.025  |Evergreen Trees 3’- 4’ B&B Gr A 10 Each 570.00 600.00 580.00 no bid
621.026  |Evergreen Trees3’- 4 B&B Gr B 10 Each 780.00 650.00 650.00 no bid
621.031  {Evergreen Trees 4’- 5’ B&B Gr A 10 Each 820.00 800.00 940.00 no bid
621.032  |Evergreen Trees 4’- 5 B&B Gr B 10 Each 950.00 1050.00 1160.00 no bid
621.037 |Evergreen Trees 5°- 6’ B&B Gr A 10 Each 1290.00 1500.00 1430.00 no bid
621.038  |Evergreen Trees 5’- 6" B&B GrB 10 Each 1280.00 1500.00 1480.00 no bid
621.039  |Evergreen Trees 5°- 6’ B&B GrC 10 Each 1440.00 1600.00 1700.00 no bid
621.043 Evergreen Trees 6- 8" B&B Gr A 10 Each 1450.00 1800.00 1740.00 no bid
621.044 Evergreen Trees 6- 8" B&B GrB 10 Each 1610.00 1700.00 1930.00 no bid
621.045 |Evergreen Trees 6~ 8 B&B GrC 10 Each 1950.00 2250.00 2200.00 no bid
621.046  |Evergreen Trees 8°- 10° B&B Gr A 10 Each 2900.00 3250.00 2900.00 no bid
621.047  |Evergreen Trees 8’- 10’ B&B Gr B 10 Each 3000.00 3300.00 3100.00 no bid
621.048  |Evergreen Trees 8- 10° B&B Gr C 10 Each 3390.00 3600.00 3450.00 no bid
621.101 Plug/starter plant 2”°cont. 6 min. 50 Each 192.50 200.00 250.00 no bid
621.122  [Small Decid Trees 5°- 6’ muld Gr C 1 Each 114.00 125.00 128.00 no bid
621.127  |Small Decid Trees 6’- 8’ Gr B 10 Each 1450.00 1650.00 1580.60 no bid
621.184  |Med Decid Trees 8-10’multi Gr A 3 Each 651.00 600.00 654.00 no bid
621.202  |Med Decid Trees 27-2 14 "cal B&B Gr B 3 Each 846.00 $75.00 864.00 no bid
621247 |Lg. Decid Trees 4’-5" GrA 3 Bach 150.00 210.00 204.00 no bid




REGION 4 - 2014 Lanscape Task Order Contract

Gordon Norpine Rosengren Wingate
Gordon | Total Item | Norpine | Total Item | Rosengren | Total ltem | Wingate | Total Item

Iter No Schedule of Items Item Description Qty Unit | Unit Prices Cost Unit Prices Cost  [Unit Prices Cost Cost
621.249  [Lg. Decid Trees 6°-8” GrA 3 Each 354.00 405.00 366.00 no bid
621255 |Lg. Decid Trees 8-10° Gr A 3 Each 561.00 750.00 579.00 n0 bid
621.267 |Lg. Decid Trees 1% -2 cal Gr A 3 Each 654.00 750.00 840.00 no bid
621.273 Lg. Decid Trees 2-212 ” cal B&B Gr A ) Each 1770.00 1950.00 1860.00 no bid
621.279  |Lg. Decid Trees 2% -3” cal B&B Gr A 6 Each 1770.00 2100.00 2070.00 no bid
621.285  |Lg. Decid Trees3-3 1/2”cal B&B Gr A 3 Each 1245.00 1260.00 1251.00 no bid
621.297 Lg. Decid Trees4-~41/2” cal B&B Gr A 1 Each 540.00 550.00 620.00 no bid
621.389  |Evergreen Shrubs 157-18” cont. Gr B 10 Fach 420.00 450.00 420.00 no bid
621.396  |Evergreen Shrubs 18" -24" Gr B 10 Each 480.00 500.00 520.00 no bid
621.397  |Evergreen Shrubs 187- 24" Gr C 10 Each 410.00 550.00 500.00 no bid
621401 _|Evergreen Shrubs 2™- 2 %’ Group A 10 Each 510.00 600.00 570.00 no bid
621.402 Evergreen Shrubs 2°- 2 %4’ cont. Gr B 10 Each 580.00 700.00 650.00 no bid
621404  {Evergreen Shrubs 3’-4° Group C 10 Each 1140.00 1250.00 960.00 no bid
621.487 Broadleaf Evergreens 18"-24"Gr A 10 Each 480.00 550.00 530.00 no bid
621.498  |Broadleaf Evergreens 21 -3°Gr A 10 Each 400.00 850.00 §70.00 no bid
621.51 Decid Shrubs 157-18” . Group A 10 Each 310.00 300.00 330.00 no bid
621.54 Decid Shrubs 187-24” Group A 10 Each 340.00 340.00 330.00 no bid
621.546  |Decid Shrubs 2-3” Group A 10 Each 370.00 390.00 400.00 no bid
621.552 Decid Shrubs 3°-4° Group A 10 Each 440.00 440.00 500.00 no bid
621.558  {Decid Shrubs 4°-5” Group A 10 Each 850.00 750.00 870.00 no bid
621.654  |Vines 12" - 15" Group A 1 Each 20.00 15.00 20.00 no bid
621.661 Vines 18" - 24" Group C 1 Each 32.00 25.00 28.00 no bid
621.71 Perennials & Groundcovers 1gal. Group A 20 Each 220.00 360.00 280.00 no bid
621.711  |Perennials 1 gal. Group B 20 Each 300.00 360.00 300.00 1o bid
621.713  |Perennials & Groundcovers 1 Quart cont. 20 Each 175.00 300.00 240.00 no bid
629.05 Hand Labor, Straight Time 24 HR 912.00 1080.00 1008.00 no bid
631.08 Generator 1 LS 28.00 35.00 160.00 no bid
631.12 Excavator and operator 2 HR 584.00 680.00 720.00 no bid
631.122 Mini-excavator and operator 8 HR 584.00 600.00 680.00 no bid
631.133  |Skid Steer/Bobeat and operator 8 HR 504.00 600.00 600.00 no bid
631.18 Chainsaw and operator 1 LS 45.00 440.00 400.00 no bid




REGION 4 - 2014 Lanscape Task Order Contract

Gordon Norpine Rosengren wingate

Gordon | Total Itern | Norpine | Total Item | Rosengren | Total Item | Wingate | Total Item
Ttem No Schedule of Items Item Description Qty Unit | Unit Prices Cost | Unit Prices Cost Cost | Unit Prices Cost
631.2 Stump Grinder and operator 1 LS  [[i}iesio0f 65.00 51 650.00 620.00 | nobid
631.111  |{Hammer Drill and operator 1 LS 45.00 ; 400.60 400.00 no bid
642.19 Granite Post 2 Each 234.00 390.00 370.00 no bid
659.101 Mobilization (Lump Sum) 1 LS 475.00 675.00 725.00 no bid
Totals 46,941.00 54,845.00 53,762.00 no bid




REGION 5 - 2014 Lanscape Task Order Contract

Gordon Norpine Rosengren ‘Wingate
Gordon | Total Ttem | Norpine | Total Item | Rosengren | Total Item | Wingate | Total Item

Item No Schedule of Items Item Description Qty Unit Cost | Unit Prices Cost | Unit Prices Cost Cost
304.09 Aggregate Base Course- crushed Type A 3 CY i 72.00 0 150.00 1 138.00 no bid
411.131  |6" Compacted stone dust gravel base 100 SF 400.00 1600.00 500.00 no bid
613.319  |Erosion Control Blanket 10 SY 24.50 50.00 25.00 no bid
61507  |Loam 5 Y 240.00 250.00 235.00 no bid
616.08 Sod 100 8Y 700.00 700.00 800.00 no bid
61735 Compost 5 CY 220.00 250.00 230.00 no bid
617.381  |Erosion Contro]l Mulch 10 CYy 440.00 500.00 500.00 no bid
618.1301 {Seeding Method Number 1 10 1,000 SF 380.00 590.00 500.00 no bid
618.1401 Seedin; Method Number 2 20 1,000 SF 760.00 1000.00 960.00 no bid
618.1411 |{Seeding Method Number 3 10 1,000 SF 430.00 650.00 550.00 no bid
619.1301 |{Bark Mulch 5 CY 220.00 275.00 240.00 no bid
621.014  |Evergreen Trees 18" — 24" Gr A 24 Each 456.00 600.00 648.00 no bid
621.025 |Evergreen Trees 3’-4’ B&B Gr A 10 Each 590.00 600.00 580.00 no bid
621.026  |Ewvergreen Trees 3°-4’ B&B GrB 10 Each 590.00 650.00 680.00 no bid
621.031  |Evergreen Trees 4’- 5° B&B Gr A 10 Each 860.00 800.00 960.00 no bid
621.032  |Evergreen Trees 4’- 5’ B&B Gr B 10 Each 1040.00 1200.00 1160.00 no bid
621.037  |Evergreen Trees 5°- 6° B&B Gr A 10 Each 1380.00 1500.00 1480.00 no bid
621.038  |Evergreen Trees 5- 6’ B&B GrB 10 Each 1380.00 1500.00 1480.00 no bid
621.039  |Evergreen Trees 5- 6’ B&B GrC 10 Each 1560.00 1600.00 1760.00 no bid
621.043  |Evergreen Trees 6’- 8’ B&B Gr A 10 Each 1620.00 1800.00 1740.00 no bid
621.044  |Evergreen Trees 6’- 8’ B&B GrB 10 Each 1680.00 1800.00 1950.00 no bid
621.045 |Evergreen Trees 6>- 8’ B&B GrC 10 Each 2080.00 2250.00 2200.00 no bid
621.046  |Evergreen Trees 8- 10’ B&B Gr A 10 Each 2950.00 3500.00 3250.00 no bid
621.047  |Evergreen Trees 8°- 10’ B&B Gr B 10 Each 3150.00 3500.00 3300.00 no bid
621.048  |Evergreen Trees 87- 10° B&B Gr C 10 Each 3450.00 3750.00 3620.00 no bid
621.101 | Plug/starter plant 2cont. 6” min. 50 Each 195.00 250.00 250.00 no bid
621.122  |Small Decid Trees 5’- 6’multi Gr C 1 Each 114.00 125.00 130.00 no bid
621.127  |Small Decid Trees 6~ 8° Gr B 10 Each 1480.00 1750.00 1600.00 no bid
621.184  |Med Decid Trees 8’-10"multi Gr A 3 Each 675.00 600.00 675.00 no bid
621202 |Med Decid Trees 27-2 % "cal B&B Gr B 3 Bach 885.00 975.00 909.00 no bid
621.247 |Lg. Decid Trees4-5 Gr A 3 Each 153.00 210.00 204.00 no bid




REGION 5 - 2014 Lanscape Task Order Contract

Gordon Norpine Rosengren wingate
Total Ttem Total Item | Rosengren | Total Item Total Item

Item No Schedule of Items Item Description Qty Unit Cost Cost | Unit Prices Cost Cost
621.249 [Lg Decid Trees 6’-8" Gr A 3 Each 354.00 405.00 B0 3%0.00 no bid
621.255  {Lg. Decid Trees 8’-10° Gr A 3 Each 576.00 750.00 600.00 no bid
621.267 L;_ Decid Trees 1% 7-2cal Gr A 3 Each 654.00 750.00 849.00 no bid
621.273  |Lg. Decid Trees 2-2% ” cal B&B Gr A 6 Each 1890.00 2100.00 1908.00 no bid
621.279  |Lg. Decid Trees 2'4 -3” cal B&B Gr A 6 Each 1470.00 2100.00 2070.00 no bid
621.285 |Lg. Decid Trees 3-3 1/2” cal B&B Gr A 3 Each 1170.00 1200.00 1251.00 no bid
621.297 |Lg. Decid Trees4-4 1/2” cal B&B Gr A 1 Each 490.00 600.00 620.00 no bid
621.389  |Evergreen Shrubs 15”-18” cont. Gr B 10 Each 440.00 450.00 420.00 no bid
621.396  |Evergreen Shrubs 18" -24" Gr B 10 Each 480.00 500.00 520.00 no bid
621.397  |Evergreen Shrubs 187-24” Gr C 10 Each 410.00 550.00 500.00 no bid
621.401  |[Evergreen Shrubs 2°- 2 14° Group A 10 Each 550.00 600.00 570.00 no bid
621402  |Evergreen Shrubs 2’- 2 %4 cont. Gr B 10 Each 610.00 700.00 660.00 no bid
621.404 Evergreen Shrubs 3°- 47 Group C 10 Each 1140.00 1250.00 960.00 no bid
621.487  |Broadleaf Evergreens 18"-24"Gr A 10 Each 400.00 550.00 530.00 no bid
621.498  |Broadleaf Evergreens 2\ *-3°Gr A 10 Each 1400.00 850.00 900.00 no bid
621.51 Decid Shrubs 157-18" . Group A 10 Each 210.00 300.00 330.00 no bid
621.54 Decid Shrubs 18”-24” Group A 10 Each 260.00 340.00 350.00 no bid
621.546 Decid Shrubs 2°-3> Group A 1¢ Each 380.00 390.00 400.00 no bid
621.552  |Decid Shrubs 3°-4’ Group A 10 Each 430.00 450.00 500.00 no bid
621.558  {Decid Shrubs 4°-5" Group A 10 Each §70.00 800.00 900.00 no bid
621.654  |Vines 12" - 15" Group A 1 Each 15.00 15.00 24.00 no bid
621.661  |Vines 18" - 24" Group C 1 Each 35.00 26.00 28.00 no bid
621.71 Perennials & Groundcovers 1gal. Group A 20 Each 220.00 360.00 300.00 no bid
621.711  |Perennials 1 gal. Group B 20 Fach 300.00 360.00 320.00 10 bid
621.713  |Perennials & Groundcovers 1 Quart cont. 20 Each 175.00 300.00 240.00 no bid
629.05 Hand Labor, Straight Time 24 HR 912.00 1080.00 1008.00 no bid
631.08  |Generator 1 LS 25.00 35.00 160.00 no bid
631.12 Excavator and operator 8 HR 592.0¢ 680.00 720.00 no bid
631.122 Mini-excavator and operator 8 HR 592.00 600.00 680.00 no bid
631.133  |Skid Steer/Bobeat and operator 8 HR 512.00 600.00 640.00 no bid
631.18 Chainsaw and operator 1 LS 46.00 440.00 400.00 no bid




REGION 5 - 2014 Lanscape Task Crder Contract

Gordon Norpine kosengren wingate
Gordon | Total Itern | Norpine | Total Item { Rosengren | Total Item Total Item

{tem No Schedule of Items Item Description Unit Prices Cost | Unit Prices Cost nit Prices Cost Cost
631.2 Stump Grinder and operator 1 68.00 50,00 650.00 1162 620.00 no bid
631.111  [Hammer Drill and operator 1 48.00 400.00 400.00 no bid
642.19  [Granite Post 2 234.00 390.00 400.00 10 bid
659.101 Mobilization (Lump Sum) 1 1245.00 2000.00 1400.00 no bid
Totals 49,381.50 57,946.00 55,702.00 no bid




