Maine Department of Transportation

Tabulation of Bids

|Statewide Paving Services 2013

Letting Date: 4/10/2013

. . Glidden
Bard Paving Bruce A F;:nevt:ne Excavating E tiagfi;es Con;:'r;etion R&? ST:I::O TwW
Construction | Manzer Inc aving | & paving nterp ¢ > Paving Inc
Corp LLC Inc Inc Corp Paving Inc
REGION 1
ZONE 1-ENTIRE REGION

|UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS | per hr no bid $930.00 nobid | $685.00 N/A $925.00 | $640.00 | $590.00

PAVING TRAIN SERVICES 1

UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS I per hr $695.00 $930.00 | $590.00 | $600.00 N/A $918.00 $595.00 | $580.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES

UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS Il per hr $489.00 $720.00 | $420.00 | $475.00 $425.00 $656.00 $415.00 |_$400.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES

UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS IV per hr $339.00 "$630.00 | $390.00 | $475.00 $400.00 $415.00 | $400.00 | $400.00
HAND CREW SERVICES -

UNIT QUOTE FOR SKIDSTEER__|per hr $75.00 $84.00 $55.00 $75.00 $60.00 |  $140.00 $56.00 | $50.00
659.11 MOBILIZATION perCD | $1,37500 | $2,650.00 | $1,000.00 | $2,500.00 | $1,200.00 | $1,725.00 | $950.00 [ $1,500.00
659.12 MOBILIZATION perhr |  $350.00 $720.00 | $320.00 | $475.00 | $350.00 $597.00 $320.00 | $400.00
409.15 TACK pergal | $5.00 $4.50 $5.00 $3.50 $5.00_ $4.00 $3.00 $4.00
IDISTRIBUTOR TRUCK _ per hr no bid $13500 | nobid | $115.00 N/A $94.00 $103.00 | $110.00
[PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $30.00 $25.00 $31.00 $20.00 | $20.00
LESS THAN 250 SY

PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY $20.00 $22.50 | $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $22.00 $22.00 | $20.00
GREATER THAN 250 SY !

BITUMINOUS CURB per LF 1 $15.00 | $10.00 $15.00 $10.00 $13.00 $7.50 $8.00




IMaine Department of Transportation ) 1 _

Tabulation of Bids .

Paving Services 2013
Letting Date: 4/10/2013
Bruce A " . Hagar Lane R D Torno .
Bard Paving | Manzer P:m.e L':fc Enterprises | Construction| & Sons T Wl:avung
Construction Inc ving Inc Corp Paving Inc ¢
Corp
REGION 2
ZONE 2
SOMERSET COUNTY
KENNEBEC COUNTY -

UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS | per hr no bid $930.00 o bid $850.00 $925.00 no bid $590.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES T

UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS Il per hr $695.00 | $930.00 | $590.00 | $600.00 $918.00 $595.00 | $580.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES | | |

\ | ! L

UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS il per hr $489.00 | $720.00 | $420.00 $420.00 $656.00 $415.00 | $400.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES ] | i -
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS IV per hr $339.00 $630.00 | $375.00 $390.00 $415.00 $400.00 | _$400.00
HAND CREW SERVICES ]

UNIT QUOTE FOR SKIDSTEER _|per hr $75.00 $84.00 $55.00 $60.00 $140.00 §56.00 | $50.00
659.11 MOBILIZATION perCD | $1,375.00 | $2,650.00 | $1,000.00 | $1,200.00 | $1,725.00 | $950.00 | $1,500.00
659.12 MOBILIZATION per hr $350.00 | $720.00 | $325.00 | $350.00 $597.00 $350.00 | $400.00 |
409.15 TACK gal $5.00 $4.50 $5.00 $5.00 |  $4.00 $3.00 $4.00
DISTRIBUTOR TRUCK per hr nobid | $135.00 no bid N/A $94.00 $103.00 | $110.00
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY $20.00 $30,00 $20.00 $25.00 $31.00 $20.00 $20.00
LESS THAN 250 SY

PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY $20.00 $22.50 $20.00 $20.00 $22.00 $22.00 $20.00
GREATER THAN 250 SY

BITUMINOUS CURB perLF | $11.90 $12.00 $10.00 $10.00 $13.00 $7.50 $8.00

|




. Bruce A . Hagar Lane RD Torno .
Bard Pavin
ar v 9 Manzer Fin_e Line Enterprises | Construction| & Sons ™ tajmg
inc Inc Corp Paving Inc e
REGION 2
ZONE 3 B
SAGADAHOC COUNTY - ‘ B
| ANDROSCOGGIN COUNTY
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS | per hr no bid no bid no bid $850.00 $925.00 o bid $590.00
| PAVING TRAIN SERVICES i
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS Il per hr $695.00 no bid $590.00 $600.00 $918.00 $595.00 | $580.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES

" lperhr $489.00 o bid $420.00 $420.00 $656.00 | $415.00 | $400.00

UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS IV perhr |  $339.00 no bid $325.00 $390.00 $415.00 $400.00 | $400.00 |
HAND CREW SERVICES

UNIT QUOTE FOR SKIDSTEER _ |per hr $75.00 no bid $55.00 $60.00 | $140.00 $56.00 $50.00
669.11 MOBILIZATION perCD | $1,375.00 nobid | $1,000.00 | $1,200.00 | $1,725.00 | $950.00 | $1,500.00 | _
659.12 MOBILIZATION per hr $350.00 no bid $340.00 $350.00 $597.00 $350.00 | $400.00
1409.15 TACK per gal $5.00 no bid $5.00 $5.00 $4.00 $3.00 | $4.00
DISTRITUTOR TRUCK per hr o bid no bid no bid N/A $94.00 $103.00 | $110.00
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT perSY | $20.00 no bid $20.00 $25.00 |  $31.00 $20.00 $20.00
LESS THAN 250 SY -
[PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY $20.00 no bid $20.00 $20.00 $22.00 $22.00 | $20.00
IGREATER THAN 250 SY —
BITUMINCUS CURB per LF $11.90 nio bid $10.00 $10.00 $13.00 $7.50 $8.00




. Bruce A " . Hagar Lane RD Torno .
Bard Paving Fine Line . TW Pavin:
Construction Manzer Paving LLC Enterprises | Construction| & _Sons Inc 9
Con inc Inc Corp Paving Inc
P
REGION 2
ZONE 4
LINCOLN COUNTY
B KNOX COUNTY .
WALDO COUNTY
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS | per hr no bid no bid no bid $850.00 $925.00 no bid no bid
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS Il |perhr | _ $695.00 nobid | $625.00 | $600.00 $918.00 no bid no bid
| PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
[UNIT QUOTE FORCLASS Il |perhr |  $489.00 nobid | $42500 | $420.00 $656.00 o bid no bid
| PAVING TRAIN SERVICES B o
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS IV per hr $339.00 nobid | $325.00 $390.00 $415.00 no bid no bid ]
HAND CREW SERVICES ]
UNIT QUOTE FOR SKIDSTEER _|per hr $75.00 no bid $55.00 $60.00 $140.00 no bid no bid
perCD | $1,375.00 nobid | $1,000.00 | $1,200.00 nobid | nobid
659.12 MOBILIZATION per hr $350.00 nobid | $350.00 $350.00 $597.00 no bid no bid
409.15 TACK per gal $5.00 no bid $5.00 $5.00 $4.00 no bid no bid |
DISTRIBUTOR TRUCK per hr no bid no bid no bid N/A $94.00 no bid no bid
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY $20.00 nobid | $20.00 $25.00 $31.00 no bid no bid
LESS THAN 250 SY ]
PAVEMENTBUTT JOINT _ |perSY |  $20.00 no bid $20.00 $20.00 $22.00 no bid no bid
|GREATER THAN 250 SY
BITUMINOUS CURB per LF $11.90 no bid $10.00 $10.00 "$1300 | nobid no bid




Maine Department of Transportation

Tabulation of Bids

ie Paving Services 2013
Letting Date: 4/10/2013

Bard Paving | Bruce A Fine Line |RD Torno & [TW Paving
Construction | Manzer Inc | Paving LLC Sons Inc
Corp Paving Inc
REGION 3
ZONE 5
Y
—_FRANKLIN COUNTY
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS | per hr nobid | $930.00 no bid no bid $590.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES —
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS I perhr |  $695.00 '$930.00 $600.00 no bid $580.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS il per hr $489.00 $720.00 $425.00 no bid $400.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
[UNIT QUOTE FORCLASS IV |perhr $339.00 $630.00 $350.00 no bid $400.00
| HAND CREW SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR SKIDSTEER |perhr | $75.00 $84.00 $55.00 no bid $50.00
659.11 MOBILIZATION perCD | $1,37500 | $2,650.00 | $1,000.00 | nobid | $1,500.00
659.12 MOBILIZATION perhr | $350.00 $720.00 $350.00 no bid $400.00
409.15 TACK per gal $5.00 $4.50 $5.00 no bid $4.00
DISTRIBUTOR TRUCK per hr no bid $135.00 no bid no bid $110.00
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 no bid $20.00
LESS THAN 250 SY
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY $20.00 | $22.50 $20.00 no bid $20.00
GREATER THAN 250 SY
[BITUMINOUSCURB per LF $11.90 $12.00 $10.00 no bid $8.00




Bard Paving Bruce A Fine Line |RD Torno & |TW Paving
Construction | Manzer inc | Paving LLC Sons inc
Corp Paving Inc
REGION 3
ZONE 6
Y

UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS | per hr no bid $930.00 no bid no bid no bid

PAVING TRAIN SERVICES

UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS I per hr $695.00 $930.00 $600.00 $595.00 no bid

PAVING TRAIN SERVICES

UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS il per hr $469.00 $720.00 $410.00 $415.00 no bid

PAVING TRAIN SERVICES

UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS IV per hr $339.00 $630.00 | $325.00 $400.00 no bid

HAND CREW SERVICES

UNIT QUOTE FOR SKIDSTEER |perhr | $75.00 $84.00 $55.00 $56.00 no bid

659.11 MOBILIZATION per CD | $1,375.00 | $2,650.00 | $1,000.00 | $950.00 no bid

659.12 MOBILIZATION per hr I $350.00 ~$720.00 $290.00 $350.00 no bid

409.15 TACK per gal $5.00 $4.50 $5.00 $3.00 nobid |
DISTRIBUTOR TRUCK per hr no bid $135.00 no bid $103.00 no bid
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00 no bid

LESS THAN 250 SY ] - —

PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY $2000 | $22550 $20.00 $22.00 no bid -
GREATER THAN 250 SY ]
BITUMINOUS CURB per LF $11.90 $12.00 $10.00 $7.50 no bid




Bard Paving | Bruce A Fine Line |RD Torno & |TW Paving
Construction | Manzer Inc | Paving LLC Sons inc
Corp Paving Inc
REGION 3 |
ZONE 7| !
Y i o
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS | per hr no bid $930.00 no bid no bid no bid
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
|UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS 1i per hr $695.00 $930.00 $750.00 no bid_ nobid_
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
JUNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS il per hr $489.00 $720.00 $500.00 no bid no bid
"PAVING TRAIN SERVICES o -
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS IV___|per hr $339.00 $630.00 $400.00 nobid | nobid _
HAND CREW SERVICES
|UNIT FOR SKIDSTEER per hr $75.00 $84.00 $55.00 no bid no bid
659.11 MOBILIZATION perCD | $1,375.00 | $2,650.00 | $1,300.00 no bid no bid
659.12 MOBILIZATION per hr $350.00 $720.00 $400.00 no bid no bid
t

409.15 TACK per gal $5.00 ~ $4.50 9500 | nobid | nobid
DISTRIBUTOR TRUCK per hr no bid $135.00 nobid | nobid no bid
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY | $20.00 $30.00 $24.00 no bid no bid
LESS THAN 250 SY |

PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT ___ |per §Y $20.00 $22.50 $20.00 no bid no bid
GREATER THAN 250 SY

BITUMINOUS CURB per LF $11.90 $12.00 |  $10.00 no bid no bid




Maine Department of Transportation

Tabulation of Bids

Statewide Paving Services 2013

Letting Date: 4/10/2013

Bard Pavi Bruce A Fine Line Lane
ar awlng Manzer Inc Paving | Construction
Construction LLC Corp
Corp
REGION 4
ZONE 8
WASHINGTON COUNTY .
HANCOCK COUNTY

|UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS | [perhr_ nobid | nobid | nobid $925.00

PAVING TRAIN SERVICES ;

UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS Il per hr $78000 | nobid | $750.00 |  $918.00 ]

PAVING TRAIN SERVICES |

UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS Il |perhr $489.00 nobid | $500.00 |  $656.00

PAVING TRAIN SERVICES

UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS IV |per hr $339.00 | nobid | $370.00 $415.00

HAND CREW SERVICES

UNIT QUOTE FOR SKIDSTEER _|per hr $75.00 nobid | $55.00 |  $140.00

659.11 MOBILIZATION perCD | $1.375.00 nobid | $1,300.00 | $1,725.00 i
659.12 MOBILIZATION perhr | $440.00 nobid | $400.00 |  $597.00 .
409.15 TACK per gal $7.00 nobid |_ $5.00 $4.00
DISTRIBUTOR TRUCK per hr no bid no bid no bid $94.00

PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY $30.00 | nobid $24.00 $31.00

LESS THAN 250 SY !

PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY $20.00 | nobid | $24.00 $22.00

GREATER THAN 250 SY

BITUMINOUS CURB per LF $11.90 no bid $10.00 $13.00




]
| . Fine Line Lane
i Bard P
| ¢ :_r:sm:w"gr M:.r‘\;:e' :‘c Paving | Construction
Corp LLC Corp
REGION 4
ZONE 9|
SOMERSET COUNTY
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS | |per hr no bid $930.00 | no bid $925.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES ]
|UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS II per hr $695.00 $930.00 | $650.00 $918.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS Il |per hr $489.00 $720.00 | $470.00 |  $656.00 ]
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS IV |per hr $389.00 | $630.00 | $290.00 | $415.00
 HAND CREW SERVICES
[UNIT QUOTE FOR SKIDSTEER _|per hr $75.00 $84.00 | $55.00 $140.00
659.11 MOBILIZATION perCD | $1,375.00 | $2.650.00 | $1,000.00 | $1,725.00
659.12 MOBILIZATION perhr | _$720.00 | $290.00 $597.00
409.15 TACK per gal $500 | $450 $5.00 $400 ]
IDISTRIBUTOR TRUCK per hr no bid $135.00 | no bid $94.00
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY $26.00 $30.00 | $20.00 $31.00
LESS THAN 250 SY R
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY $20.00 $2250 | $17.50 $22.00
GREATER THAN 250 SY
BITUMINOUS CURB per LF $11.90 $12.00 | $10.00 $13.00




Bard Pavi Bruce A Fine Line Lane
ard Paving Manzer inc| Paving | Construction
Construction el LLC Corp
Corp |
REGION 4
ZONE 10|
PENOBSCOT COUNTY
PISCATAQUIS COUNTY — | )
UNIT QUOTE FORGLASS | |perhr no bid $930.00 | no bid $925.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES B ]
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS Il perhr | $789.00 $930.00 | $850.00 $918.00 ]
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS Il |per hr '$489.00 | $720.00 | $475.00 |  $656.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS IV___lperhr | $339.00 | $630.00 | $295.00 |  $415.00
HAND CREW SERVICES |
[UNIT QUOTE FOR SKIDSTEER |per hr $75.00 $84.00 | $55.00 |  $140.00
|659.11 MOBILIZATION perCD | $1,375.00 | $2,650.00 | $1.000.00 | $1,725.00
659.12 MOBILIZATION perhr | $375.00 nobid | $30000 |  $597.00
409.15 TACK r gal $5.00 | nobid $5.00 $4.00 |
1
[DISTRIBUTOR TRUCK per hr no bid __nobid no bid__ $94.00
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT lpersy | $25.00 1o bid $24.00 $31.00 ]
[LESS THAN 250 SY 77
. i
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT perSY |  $20.00 no bid $21.00 $22.00
|GREATER THAN 250 SY
[BITUMINOUS CURB per LF $11.90 nobid | $10.00 $13.00




Maine Department of Transportation
Tabulation of Bids ] ]
le Paving Services 2013 L
Letting Date: 4/10/2013
Bard Paving Fine Line c Ltane i Steelstone | Trombley
Construction Paving °"(S: ruction | | dustries | Industries
Corp LLC orp Inc
REGION §
ZONE 11
NORTHERN 1
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS | per hr nobid | nobid $925.00 $805.00 | $810.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS II per hr $789.00 no bid $918.00 $805.00 | $810.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES T
|UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS Il perhr | $539.00 no bid $656.00 $580.00 | $620.00 |
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES )
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS iV perhr |  $389.00 no bid $415.00 $450.00 | $425.00
HAND CREW SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR SKIDSTEER _|per hr $75.00 no bid $140.00 $90.00 | $100.00
659.11 MOBILIZATION _ |per €D $1,375.00 no bid $1,725.00 | $1,500.00 | $1,500.00 |
659.12 MOBILIZATION perhr | $375.00 no bid $597.00 $390.00 ”‘ $400.00 |
409.15 TACK lpergal|  '$7.00 no bid $4.00 $4.75 $5.00
DISTRIBUTOR TRUCK iper hr o bid no bid $94.00 ~ $95.00 $95.00
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT _____iperSY| _ $30.00 no bid $31.00 $26.50 $26.00
LESS THAN 250 SY L
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT perSY|  $30.00 | nobid |  $2200 | $2350 | $24.00
GREATER THAN 250 SY
[BITUMINOUS CURB____ ~ |perLF| $15.00 no bid $13.00 $14.25 $13.50




Bard Paving Lane Trombley
Construction | Fine Line | Construction | Steelstone | Industries
Corp Paving LLC Corp Industries Inc
REGION 5
ZONE 12 - MID
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS | per hr no bid no bid $925.00 $805.00 | $810.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES ~
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS ii per fr $747.50 $800.00 $918.00 $805.00 | $810.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES )
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS il per hr $539.00 $575.00 $656.00 $580.00 | $620.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS IV per hr $339.00 $380.00 $415.00 $450.00 | $425.00
HAND CREW SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR SKIDSTEER _|perhr | §75.00 | '$75.00 $140.00 $90.00 $100.00
659.11 MOBILIZATION per CD| $1,37500 | $1,300.00 | $1,725.00 | $1,500.00 | $1,500.00
659.12 MOBILIZATION per hr $350.00 | $360.00 |  $597.00 $390.00 | $400.00
409.15 TACK per gal $5.00 ~$4.00 $4.75 $5.00
DISTRIBUTOR TRUCK per hr no bid no bid $94.00 $95.00 | $95.00
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY $25.00 $23.00 $31.00 $26.50 $26.00
LESS THAN 250 SY -
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT perSY|  $20.00 $21.00 $22.00 $23.50 $24.00
GREATER THAN 250 SY
IBITUMINOUS CURB per LF $15.00 $12.00 $13.00 $14.25 $13.50




Bard Paving Lane Trombley
Construction | Fine Line | Construction | Steelstone | Industries
e g e Dauvines 1 1 £ ~_ Industrine | Y
Corp Paving LLC Corp Industries Inc
REGION 5
ZONE 13-SOUTHERN
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS | per hr no bid $925.00 $805.00 $810.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS I per hr $747.50 no bid $918.00 $805.00 $810.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS il per hr $539.00 no bid $656.00 $580.00 $620.00
| PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS IV per hr $339.00 no bid $415.00 $450.00 $425.00
HAND CREW SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR SKIDSTEER _|per hr $75.00 no bid $140.00 $90.00 $100.00
659.11 MOBILIZATION perCD| $1,375.00 | nobid | $1,725.00 | $1,500.00 | $1,500.00 |
659.12 MOBILIZATION per hr $350.00 no bid $597.00 $390.00 $400.00
409.15 TACK per gal $5.00 no bid $4.00 $4.75 $5.00
DISTRIBUTOR TRUCK ___|perhr no bid no bid $94.00 $95.00 $95.00
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT perSY|  $25.00 no bid $31.00 $26.50 $26.00
LESS THAN 250 SY
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT perSY|  $2000 | nobid $22.00 $23.50 $24.00 |
|GREATER THAN 250 SY
[BITUMINOUS CURE per LF $15.00 o bid $13.00 $1425 | $13.50




