Maine Department of Transportation

Tabulation of Bids

Statewide Paving Services 2012

Letting Date: 4/11/2012

Fine Line | Glidden Lane R D Torno
Bard Paving [ Bruce A | Paving & | Excavating Constr Rampart | RC & Sons % Sons TW
Construction| Manzer Inc | Grading | & Paving P Bituminous | Paving Inc Paving Inc| P2ving Inc
Corp Co Inc orp LLC aving Inc
REGION 1
ZONE 1-ENTIRE REGION
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS | per hr no bid $930.00 no bid $640.00 $830.00 $750.00 $595.00 $650.00 no bid
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS il per hr no hid $930.00 $590.00 $580.00 $925.00 $750.00 $595.00 $590.00 no bid
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS I} per hr $450.00 $720.00 $425.00 $450.00 $665.00 $650.00 $514.00 $420.00 $450.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS IV per hr $425.00 $630.00 $375.00 $450.00 $420.00 $45G.00 $370.00 $400.00 $425.00
HAND CREW SERVICES '
UNIT QUOTE FOR SKIDSTEER  |per hr $75.00 $84.00 $55.00 $70.00 $110.00 $75.00 $55.00 $56.00 $65.00
659,11 MOBILIZATION per CD $1,500.00 $2,650.00 | $1,000.00 | $2,500.00 | $1,710.00 | $2,500.00 | $2,910.00 | $999.00 | $1,200.00 |-
659.12 MOBILIZATION per hr $400.00 $720.00 $320.00 $450.00 $605.00 $550.00 $450.QO $320.00 $500.00
409.15 TACK per gal $5.00 $3.60 $3.00 $3.75 $4.25 $3.50 $2.75 $3.05 $10.00
DISTRIBUTOR TRUCK per hr no bid $135.00 no hid $135.00 $95.75 $115.00 $110.00 $106.00 no bid
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY $26.00 $27.00 $20.00 $30.00 $31.65 $30.00 $20.00 $21.00 $35.00
LESS THAN 250 SY
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per 8Y no bid $21.00 no bid $30.00 $21.75 $26.50 $20.00 $23.00 no bid -
GREATER THAN 250 SY
BITUMINOUS CURB per LF $15.00 $12.00 $8.00 $15.00 $12.10 $14.00 $13.00 $7.00 $12.00




Maine Department of Transportation

Tabulation of Bids

Statewlde Paving Services 2012

Letting Date: 4/11/2012

Bard Bruce A | Fine Line Lane RD Torno .
Paving Manzer | Paving & | Constr RBe;;n Lp:ét l;:vis?:': &Sons |7 W;zvmg
Construc. B&B Inc Grading Co| Corp 9 Paving Inc
Corp Paving
REGION 2
ZONE 2
SOMERSET COUNTY
KENNEBEC COUNTY
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS | per hr no bid no bid $930.00 na bid $930.00 | $750.00 $595.00 no bid no bid
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS I per hr no bid no bid $930.00 $595.00 $925.00 | $750.00 $595.00 $590.00 no bid
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS I per hr $450.00 no bid $720.00 $425.00 $665.00 | $650.00 $514.00 $420.00 $450.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS IV per hr $425.00 no bid $630.00 $285.00 $420.00 $475.00 $370.00 $400.00 $425.00
HAND CREW SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR SKIDSTEER  |per hr no bid no bid $84.00 $55.00 $110.00 $75.00 $55.00 $56.00 $65.00
659.11 MOBILIZATION per CD | $1,500.00 no bid | $2,650.00 | $1,000.00 | $1,710.00 | $2,500.00 | $2,910.00 $999.00 $1,200.00
659.12 MOBILIZATION per hr $400.00 no bid $720.00 $290.00 $605.00 no bid $450.00 $345.00 $500.00
408.15 TACK gal $5.00 no bid $3.60 $3.00 $4.25 no bid $2.75 $3.05 $10.00
D!S;FRIBUTOR TRUCK per hr no bid no bid $135.00 no bid $95.75 no bid $110.00 $106.00 no bid
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY $26.00 ne bid $27.00 $20.00 $31.65 no bid $20.00 $21.00 $35.00
LESS THAN 250 SY
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY no bid no bid $21.00 no bid $21.75 no bid $20.00 $23.00 no bid
GREATER THAN 250 SY
BITUMINOUS CURB pertF $15.00 no bid $12.00 $8.00 $12.10 no bid $13.00 $7.00 $12.00




Bard

Bruce A

Fine Line

Lane

RD Torno

Paving Rampart | RC & Sons TW Paving
Construc. | B&B M‘I‘"zer Gpa;:“g g‘ Cg"s" Bit LLC | Paving Inc P& Is°"|5 Inc
Corp Paving nc rading Co arp aving Inc
REGION 2
ZONE 3
SAGADAHOC COUNTY
ANDROSCOGGIN COUNTY
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS | per hr no bid no bid no bid no bid $930.00 $750.00 $595.00 no bid no bid
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS I per hr ne bid no hid no bid $595.00 $925.00 $750.00 $595.00 $590.00 no bid
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS il per i $450.00 no bid no bid $425.00 $665.00 $650.00 $514.00 $420.00 $450.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS IV per hr $425.00 no bid ne bid $325.00 $420.00 $475.00 $345.00 $400.00 $425.00
HAND CREW SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR SKIDSTEER _ |per hr no bid no bid no bid $55.00 $110.00 $75.00 $55.00 $56.00 $65.00
659.11 MOBILIZATION per CD | $1,500.00 no bid no bid $1,000.00 | $1,710.00 | $2,500.00 | $2,810.00 $999.00 $1,200.00
659.12 MOBILIZATION per hr $400.00 no bid no bid $340.00 $605.00 no bid $450.00 $345.00 $500.00
409.15 TACK per gal $5.00 no bid no bid $3.00 $4.25 no hid $2.75 $3.05 $10.00
DISTRITUTOR TRUCK per hr no bid ne bid no bid no bid $95.76 no bid $110.00 $106.00 no bid
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per8Y | . $26.00 no hid no bid $20.00 $31.65 no bid $20.00 $21.00 $35.00
LESS THAN 250 SY '
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per 8Y ne bid no bid no bid no bid $21.75 no bid $20.00 $23.00 no bid
GREATER THAN 250 8Y
BITUMINOUS CURB per LF $15.00 no bid no bid $8.00 $12.10 no bid $13.00 $7.00 $12.00




Bard

Bruce A

Fine Line

Lane

RD Torno

Paving . Rampart | RC & Sons TW Paving
Construc, B&B MTnzer GPa;!ng g anstr Bit LLC | Paving Inc P& lSonIs Ine
Corp Paving ne rading Co orp aving Inc
REGION 2
ZONE 4
LINCOLN COUNTY
KNOX COUNTY
WALDO COUNTY
UNIT QUOTE FORCLASS | per hr no bid $760.00 no bid no bid $930.00 no bid $640.00 no bid no bid
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS I per hr no bid $750.00 no bid $625.00 $925.00 no bid $640.00 no bid no bid
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS Il per hr $475.00 $430.00 no bid $425.00 $665.00 ne bid $514.00 no bid no bid
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS IV per hr $425.00 $350.00 no bid $300.00 $420.00 no bid $345.00 no bid no bid
HAND CREW SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR SKIDSTEER |per hr ne bid $60.00 no bid $55.00 $110.00 ng bid $55.00 no bid no bid
659.11 MOBILIZATION per CD | $1,500.00 | $1,000.00 | no bid $1,000.00 | $1,710.00 | no bid $2,910.00 no bid no bid
659,12 MOBILIZATION per hr $425.00 $350.00 no bid $350.00 $605.00 no bid $450.00 no bid no bid
409,15 TACK per gal $5.00 $4.75 ne bid $3.00 $425.00 ne bid $2.75 no bid no bid
DISTRIBUTOR TRUCK per hr no bid $105.00 no bid no bid $95.75 no bid $110.00 no bid ne bid
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY $26.00 $25.00 no bid $20.00 $31.65 no bid $20.00 no bid no bid
LESS THAN 250 SY
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY no bid $23.00 no bid no bid $21.76 ne hid $20.00 no bid no bid
GREATER THAN 250 §Y
BITUMINOUS CURB per LF $15.00 $10.00 ne bid $8.00 $12.10 no bid $13.00 no bid no bid




Maine Department of Transportation

Tabulation of Bids

Statewide Paving Services 2012

Letting Date: 4/11/2012

Bard

Paving Bruce A ';2‘\:':""8‘? Rampart Bit| RC & Sons TW Paving
Construc, B&B Manzer Inc ) 9 LLC Paving Inc |RD Torno & Inc
) Grading Co
Corp Paving Sons
REGION 3
ZONE 5
OXFORD COUNTY
FRANKLIN COUNTY
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS | per hr no bid no bid $930.00 no bid $750.00 $640.00 no bid no bid
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS I perhr no bid no bid $030.00 $590.00 $750.00 $610.00 no bid no bid
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS Il per hr $475.00 no bid §720.00 $425.00 $650.00 $514.00 no bid $450.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS IV per hr $425.00 no bid $630.00 $295.00 $475.00 $345.00 no bid $425.00
HAND CREW SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR SKIDSTEER - [per hr no bid no bid $84.00 $55.00 $75.00 $55.00 ne bid $65.00
659.11 MOBILIZATION per CD | $1,500.00 no bid $2,650.00 $1,000.00 $2,500.00 | $2,010.00 no bid $1,200.00
659.12 MOBILIZATION per hr $425.00 no bid §720.00 $280.00 $550.00 $450.00 no hid $500.00
409.15 TACK per gal $5.00 no bid $3.60 $3.00 $3.50 $2.75 no bid $10.00
BISTRIBUTOR TRUCK per hr no bid no bid $135.00 no bid $115.00 $110.00° no bid no bid
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY $26.00 no bid $27.00 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 no hid $35.00
LESS THAN 250 SY
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY no bid no bid $21.00 no bid $18.00 $20.00 no bid no bid
GREATER THAN 250 §Y
BiITUMINOUS CURB per LF $15.00 ne bid $12.00 $8.00 $13.00 $13.00 no bid $12.00




Bard . .
Paving Bruce A l;:n\:;.m; Rampart Bit| RC & Sons TW Paving
Construc. B&B | Manzerinc Gradi 9 c LLC Paving Inc | RD Torno & Inc
Corp Paving rading Lo Sons
REGION 3
ZONE 6
SOMERSET COUNTY
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS | per hr no bid $750.00 $930.00 no bid no bid $640.00 no bid no bid
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS I per hr no bid $650.00 $930.00 $650.00 no bid $610.00 $590.00 no bid
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS I per hr $450.00 $475.00 $720.00 $475.00 no bid $514.00 $420.00 no bid
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS IV per hr $425.00 $350.00 $630.00 $295.00 no bid $345.00 $400.00 no bid
HAND CREW SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR SKIDSTEER  |per hr no bid $60.00 $84.00 $55.00 no bid $65.00 $56.00 no bid
659.11 MOBILIZATICN per CD | $1,500.00 | $1,000.00 | $2,650.00 | $1,000.00 no bid $2,910.00 $999.00 no bid
659.12 MOBILIZATION per hr $425.00 $300.00 $720.00 $290.00 no hid $550.00 $345.00 no bid
409.15 TACK per gal $5.00 $5.00 $3.60 $3.00 no bid $2.75 $3.05 no bid
DISTRIBUTOR TRUCK per hr no bid $115.00 $135.00 no bid no bid $110.00 $3.05 no bid
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY $26.00 $20.00 $27.00 $20.00 no bid $20.00 $21.00 no bid
LESS THAN 250 SY
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per 8Y no hid $17.50 $21.00 no bid no bid $20.00 $23.00 no bid
GREATER THAN 250 SY
BITUMINOUS CURB per LF $15.00 $9.50 $12.00 $8.00 no bid $13.00 $7.00 no bid




Bard Fine Line
Paving Bruce A | oo "& Rampart Bit| R C & Sons TW Paving
Construc. B&B | Manzerinc 'ng LLC Paving Inc |RD Torno & Inc
) Grading Co
Corp Paving Sons
REGION 3
ZONE 7
PISCATAQUIS COUNTY
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS | per hr no bid no bid $930.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES .
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS il per hr | no bid no bid $930.00 $750.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS Il perhr $525.00 no bid $720.00 $540.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS IV per hr $425.00 no bid $630.00 $370.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
HAND CREW SERVICES
UNIT FOR SKIDSTEER per hr no bid no bid $84.00 $55.00 no bid no bid no bid no bhid
659.11 MOBILIZATION per CD | $1,500.00 no bid $2,650.00 | $1,000.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
659.12 MOBILIZATION per hr $475.00 no bid $720.00 $325.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
409.15 TACK per gal $5.00 no bid $3.60 $3.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
DISTRIBUTOR TRUCK per hr no bid no bid $135.00 no bid no bid ne bid no bid no bid
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY $26.00 no bid $27.00 $20.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
LESS THAN 250 SY
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY no bid no bid $21.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
GREATER THAN 250 SY
BITUMINOUS CURB per LF $15.00 no bid $12.00 $8.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid




Maine Department of Transportation

Tahulation of Bids

Statewide Paving Services 2012

Letting Date: 4/11/2012

Bard

. Bruce A Fine Line Lane
Paving B & Manzer Inc Paving & Constr
Construc. ) B Grading Co Corp
Corp Paving
REGION 4
ZONE 8
WASHINGTON COUNTY
HANCOCK COUNTY
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS | per hr no bid $876.00 no bid no bid $930.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS I per hr no bid $876.00 no hid no hid $925.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS 1l per hr $525,00 $550.00 no bhid no bid $665.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS IV per hr $425.00 $375.00 no bid ne bid $420.00
HAND CREW SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR SKIDSTEER |per hr no bid $85.00 no bid no bid $110.00
659.11 MOBILIZATION per CD $1,500.00 | $1,400.00 no bid no hid $1,710.00
659.12 MOBILIZATION per hr $475.00 $475.00 no bid fno bid $605.00
409.15 TACK per gal $5.00 $4.50 no bid no bid $4.25
DISTRIBUTOR TRUCK per hr no bid $101.00 no bid no bid $95.75
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY $26.00 $30.00 no bid no bid $31.65
LESS THAN 250 8Y
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per Y no bid $24.00 no bid no bid $21.75
GREATER THAN 250 SY
BITUMINOUS CURB per LF $15.00 $12.00 no bid no bid $12.10




Bard

Paving Bruce A f;ine. LII"I; CLame
Construc. B&B |Manzerine aving onstr
Corp Paving Grading Co Corp
REGION 4
ZONE 9
SOMERSET COUNTY
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS | per hr no bid $775.00 $930.00 no bid $930.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS I perhr no bid $775.00 $930.00 $650.00 $925.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS it per hr $474.00 $500.00 $720.00 $480.00 $665.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS IV per hr $425.00 $290.00 $630.00 $290.00 $420.00
HAND CREW SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR SKIDSTEER [per hr no bid $60.00 $84.00 $55.00 $110.00.
659.11 MOBILIZATION per CD $1,500.00 | $1,000.00( $2,650.00 $1.000.00 ! $1,710.00
659.12 MOBILIZATION per hr $400.00 $300.00 $720.00 $290.00 $605.00
409.15 TACK per gal $5.00 $3.50 $3.60 $3.00 $4.25
DISTRIBUTOR TRUCK per hr no bid $115.00 $135.00 no bid $95.75
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY $26.00 $20.00 $27.00 $20.00 $31.656
LESS THAN 250 SY
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per 8Y no bid $17.50 $21.00 no bid $21.75
GREATER THAN 250 SY
BITUMINOUS CURB perLF $15.00 $10.00 $12.00 $6.00 $12.10




Bard

Pavi Bruce A Fine Line Lane
c avtng 888 |Manzerine Paving & Constr
onstrue. ) Grading Co Corp
Corp Paving
EGION 4
ZONE 10
PENOBSCOT COUNTY
PISCATAQUIS COUNTY
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS | per hr no bid $875.00 | $930.00 no bid $930.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES :
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS Il per hr no bid $875.00 $930.00 o bid $925.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS 1l per hr $575.00 $500.00 | $720.00 no bid $665.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS IV per hr $425.00 | $300.00 | $630.00 no bid $420.00
HAND CREW SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR SKIDSTEER _ [per hr no bid $60.00 $84.00 no bid $110.00
659.11 MOBILIZATION per CD $1,500.00 | $1,000.00 | $2,650.00 no bid $1,710.00
659.12 MOBILIZATION per hr $450.00 $300.00 no bid no bid $605.00
409.16 TACK per gal $5.00 $4.25 no bid no bid $4.25
DISTRIBUTOR TRUCK per hr no bid $101.00 no bid no bid $95.75
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per 8Y $26.00 $25.00 no bid no bid $31.65
LESS THAN 250 SY
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY no bid $24.00 no hid no bid $21.76
GREATER THAN 250 SY
BITUMINOUS CURB perLF $15.00 $10.00 no bid no bid $12.10




Maine Department of Transportation

Tabulation of Bids

Statewide Paving Services 2012

Letting Date: 4/11/2012

Fine Line L
Paving Coannetr Steelstone
Bard Paving B&B | Grading c s Ind
Construc Corp| Paving LLC orp
REGION 5
ZONE 11
NORTHERN

UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS | per hr no bid no bid no bid $930.00 $805.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES

UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS il per hr no bid no bhid no bid $925.00 $805.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES

UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS III per hr no bid no bid no bid $665.00 $580.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES

UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS IV per hr $425.00 no bid no bid $420.00 $450.00
HAND CREW SERVICES

UNIT QUOTE FOR SKIDSTEER  |per hr no bid no bid no bid $110.00 $90.00
659.11 MOBILIZATION per CD|  $1,500.00 no bid no bid $1,710.00 | $1,500.00
659.12 MOBILIZATION per hr no bid no bid no bid $605.00 $390.00
400.15 TACK per gal $5.00 no bid no bid $4.25 $4.75
DISTRIBUTOR TRUCK per hr no bid no bid no bid $95.75 $95.00
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY $26.00 no bid no bid $31.65 $26.50
LESS THAN 250 SY

PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY no bid no bid no bid $21.75 $23.50
GREATER THAN 25¢ SY

BITUMINOUS CURB per LF $15.00 no bid no bid $12.10 $14.25




Fine Line

Paving & Lane
. ; Constr

Bard Paving B&B Grading Steelstone

Construc Corp| Paving LLC Corp Ind
REGION 5

ZONE 12 - MID

UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS 1 per hr no bid $800.00 no bid $930.00 $805.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS I per hr ne bid $800.00 $800.00 $925.00 $805.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS Il per hr no bid $575.00 $575.00 $665.00 $580.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES

UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS IV per hr $425.00 $390.60 $400.00 $420.00 $450.00

HAND CREW SERVICES

UNIT QUOTE FOR SKIDSTEER  |per hr no bid $80.00 $80.00 $110.00 $90.00
659.11 MOBILIZATION: per CD|  $1,500.00 $1,400.00 | $1,300.00 | $1,710.00 $1,500.00
659.12 MOBILIZATION per hr no bid $370.00 $360.00 $605.00 $390,00
409.15 TACK per gal $5.00 $5.00 $3.00 $4.25 $4.75
DISTRIBUTOR TRUCK per hr no bid $90.00 no bid $95.75 $95.00
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY $26.00 $23.75 $23.00 $31.65 $26.50
LESS THAN 250 3Y

PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY no bid $21.75 no bid $21.76 $23.50
GREATER THAN 250 SY

BITUMINOUS CURB per LF $15.00 $13.75 $11.00 - $12.10 $14.25




Fine Line

Bard Paving Paving & Lane
Construc. B&B Grading Constr Steelstone
Corp Paving LLC Corp Ind
REGION 5
ZONE 13-SOUTHERN
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS | per hr no bid $800.00 no bid $930.00 $805.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS i per hr no bid $800.00 no bid $925.00 $805.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS I per hr $575.00 $575.00 no bid $665.00 $580.00
PAVING TRAIN SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR CLASS IV per hr $425.00 $390.00 ne bid $420.00 $450.00
HAND CREW SERVICES
UNIT QUOTE FOR SKIDSTEER  |per hr no bid $80.00 no bid $110.00 $90.00
659.11 MOBILIZATION per CD|  $1,500.00 $1,400.00 no bid $1,710.00 | $1,500.00
659.12 MOBILIZATION per hr $450.00 $320.00 no bid $605.00 $390.00
409.15 TACK per gal $5.00 $5.00 no bid $4.25 $4.75
PISTRIBUTOR TRUCK per hr no bid $90.00 no bid $95.75 $95.00
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY $26.00 $23.75 no bid $31.65 $26.50
LESS THAN 250 8Y
PAVEMENT BUTT JOINT per SY no bid $21.75 no bid $21.75 $23.50
GREATER THAN 250 8Y
BITUMINOUS CURB per LF $15.00 $13.75 no bid $12.10 $14.25




