Maine Department of Transportation I I B
I Tabulation of Bids | Bid date 4/13/2011 EXCAVATORS-TRACKED & RUBBER TIRED _
Section 1 (Region 1) Section 2 (Region 2) Section 3 (Region 3) Section 4 (Region 4) Section 5 (Region 4)
Rank [Bidder Total Rank  [Bidder Total Rank [Bidder Total [Rank [Bidder Total Rank [Bidder [Total
1 Nortrax $48,600.00 |1 Beauregard 1$57,400.00 |1 Nortrax Inc 43,200.00 |1 Beauregard [$20,500.00 |1 Hertz Equip :$35,550.00
2 Beauregard |$49,200.00 |2 2 Hertz Equip 47,400.00 |2 2 Beauregard :$36,900.00
3 3 3 Beauregard 49,200.00 |3 3
4 4 4 4 4
Seaction 8 {Ranion B} Saction 7 Saction 8 Saction O/Whaalad Raainn 4) Saction 10{Whaalad Raaion 5)
Section 6 (Region 5) Section 7 Section & Section 9(Wheeled Region4}) =~ [Section 10(Wheeled Region 5)
[Rank [Bidder Total Rank Bidder Total Rank Bidder Total "ﬁank Bidder Total Rank Bidder Total
1 Hertz Equip [$11,850.00 |1 Hertz Equip jirregular  |Hertz Equip |irregular 1 NO BIDS n NO BIDS
|2 |Beauregard |$12,300.00 |2 Hertz Equip |irregular  |Hertz Equip |irregular 2 2 R
3 3 Eagle Rental {$22,800.00 |Nortrax irregular 3 3
4 4 Nortrax irregular  |Eagle Rental |$19,800.00 4 4 i
BIDDERS Beauregard Equip. Eagle Rental Hertz Equip. Rental Nortrax Inc. B
qty mos $/MO BID AMT $/MO BID AMT |$/MO BID AMT $/MO BID AMT
SEC 1 J2ea. 6 $4,100.00 | $49,200.00 — $4,050.00 | $48,600.00 )
Tot Sec 1| $49,200.00 | Tot Sec 1 NOBID |Tot Sec 1 NO BID |Tot Sec 1 $48,600.00
SEC 2 |2ea. 4 $4,100.00 | $32,800.00 B
1ea. 3 $4,100.00 | $12,300.00 |
1ea. 3 $4,100.00 | $12,300.00
Tot Sec 2| $57,400.00 | Tot Sec 2 NOBID |Tot Sec 2 NO BID |Tot Sec 2 NO BID
SEC 3 |3ea. 4 1%$4,100.00 | $49,200.00 1$3,950.00 $47,400.00 | $3,500.00 | $43,200.00 ! B
] Tot Sec 3| $49,200.00 | Tot Sec 3 NOBID |Tot Sec 3 $47,400.00 [Tot Sec 3 $43,200.00 {
SEC 4 | 2ea. 25 |$4,100.00 | $20,500.00
Tot Sec 4| $20,500.00 | Tot Sec 4 NO BID |Tot Sec4 NO BID |Tot Sec 4 NO BID
SEC 5 |1ea. 2 $4,100.00 | $8,200.00 1$3,950.00 $7,900.00
1ea, 3 $4,100.00 | $12,300.00 |$3,850.00 $11,850.00
1ea. 4 $4,100.00 | $16,400.00 ]$3,950.00 $15,800.00
Tot Sec 5! $36,900.00 | Tot Sec 5 NO BID |Tot Sec 5 $35,550.00 |Tot Sec 5 NO BID




BIDDERS Beauregard Equip. Eagle Rental Hertz Equip. Rental Nortrax Inc
qty mos $/MO BID AMT $/IMO BID AMT |$/MO BID AMT $/MO BID AMT
SEC 6 |1ea. 3 $4,100.00 | $12,300.00 $3,950.00 $11,850.00
Tot Sec 6| $12,300.00 | Tot Sec 6 NO BID Tot Sec 6 $11,850.00| Tot Sec 6 NO BID N
SEC 7 [1ea. 2 $11,400.00 | $22,800.00
| Tot Sec 7| NO QUOTE | Tot Sec7 | $22,800.00 Tot Sec 7 irregular | Tot Sec 7 irregular
SEC 8 [1ea. 1.5 $13,200.00 | $19,800.00
Tot Sec 8| NO QUOTE | Tot Sec8 | $19,800.00 TotSec8 | irregular | Tot Sec 8 irregular
SEC 9 [1ea. 5 -
Tot Sec 9| NO QUOTE | TotSecd | NO BID TotSec9 | NOBID | TotSeco | _NOBD | | 1T
SEC 101ea. 4
2ea. 3 _ _
1ea. 1
Tot Sec 10| NO QUOTE | Tot Sec 10 NO BID Tot Sec 10 NOBID | Tot Sec 10 NO BID




