MAINE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

TABULATION OF BIDS 4/22/2009

EXCAVATORS TRACKED
\
BIDDERS Chadwick-BaRoss Inc. Beauregard Eq. Milton Cat
$/MO BID AMT $/MO BID AMT $/MO BID AMT
REG1 |1EACH $4,900.00 $24,500.00 $2,687.00 $13,435.00 $2,635.00 $13,175.00
5 MOS.
1 EACH $4,900.00 $24,500.00 $2,687.00 $13,435.00 $2,635.00 $13,175.00
5 MOS.
Total Reg 1 | $49,000.00 Total Reg 1 $26,870.00 Total Reg 1 $26,350.00
REG 2 |1 EACH $4,900.00 $24,500.00 $2,687.00 $13,435.00 $2,635.00 $13,175.00
5 MOS.
1 EACH NO BID $2,687.00 $13,435.00 $2,635.00 $13,175.00
5 MOS.
Total Reg2 | $24,500.00 Total Reg 2 $26,870.00 Total Reg 2 $26,350.00
REG 3 |1EACH $4,900.00 $22,050.00 $2,687.00 $12,091.50 $2,635.00 $11,857.50
4.5 MOS.
1 EACH NO BID $2,687.00 $12,091.50 $2,635.00 $11,857.50
4.5 MOS.
1 EACH NO BID $2,687.00 $9,404.50 $2,635.00 $9,222.50
3.5 MOS.
1 EACH NO BID $2,687.00 $9,404.50 $2,635.00 $9,222.50
3.5 MOS.
Total Reg3 | $22,050.00 Total Reg 3 $42,992.00 Total Reg 3 $42,160.00
REG 4 |1 EACH $4,900.00 $14,700.00 $2,687.00 $8,061.00 $2,635.00 $7,905.00
3 MOS.
1 EACH NO BID $2,687.00 $8,061.00 $2,635.00 $7,905.00
3 MOS.
1 EACH NO BID $2,687.00 $8,061.00 $2,635.00 $7,905.00
3 MOS.
Total Reg4 | $14,700.00 Total Reg 4 $24,183.00 Total Reg 4 $23,715.00
REG5 |1EACH $4,900.00 $14,700.00 $2,687.00 $8,061.00 $2,635.00 $7,905.00
3 MOS.
Total Reg5 | $14,700.00 Total Reg 5 $8,061.00 Total Reg 5 $7,905.00




