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- Customer Name Page 1
INVOICE DEPT OF -ENVIRONMENTAL PROT
Customer Number Invoice Number Invoice Date
Remit to: 17AD$P.1022 14DT0036631 03-06-14
DEPT OF TRANSPORTATION AR Dept BERO “Due Date
AUGUSTA ME  04333-0016 ) Amount Due Amount Enclosed
ENTERED $126.27
Bill to:
DEPT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROT GDS
STATION #17
AUGUSTA ME 04333
Payment Method: Check D Money Order I:]
D Please check if address has changed. Write correct Please write Invoice No on front of

address on back of stub and attach with payment

check or Money Order. DO NOT MAIL CASH

Please detach the above stub and return with your remittance payable to TREASURER, STATE OF MAINE

TRANSPORTATION

i ORIGINAL __. 1

__ Customer Number .~ ‘ Orig. Inv.” Date: :- ;iJ7 Orig.” Due-Date’ ™
17ADEF1022 03-06-14 04-05-14
Customer Name B Invoice Number "~ Invoice Date
DEPT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROT 14DT0036631 03-06-14
Invoice Charges
Ref Date of No.of Unit of Unit Charges/
g;x‘le DESCRIPTION Sexvice Units Measure Price Credit
1 LEGAL SERVICES FOR JUNE 201l - WIN 03~-06-14 $126.27
18015.00 CORINNA
TOTAL INVOICE Charges $126.27
RECER/AZN
Other Charges R L
DESCRIPTION e . mmas - Date Charges
MAR T 201 63-06-13
NATURAL RESOURCES Total Other Charges 50.00
AGENCIES SVCS CENTER
Credit Payments Applied APPROVED FOR PAYMENT CT# : $0.00
Total Amount Due By 04-05-14 w AR ] $126.27
Frd_O14 _peprosaunit /32 subunit 27 MW{V‘“’X
g2 opp YR A REMO suvactv_OHFT 5“}&’-7‘ M
Inastructions Spli#t e— Jij"‘ \? ﬁ]."l
3 \ Program_——_ s (2627 3\‘0

Authorized Slgnature:W [/f)"“? 6\-‘0
- - £ _

207-624-3125 N

CONTACT:
Amber Corum
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018015.00
February - 2014

Corinna

Voucher Name C&0 JAmount
11293 49582_1 3110 83.49
49582_2 3901 18.78
49582_3  [3905 0.58
49582 4 3906 3.52
49582 5 3908 6.71
49582_6 3910 348
49582 7 3911 0.53
- 49582_8 3912 0.82
7 49582_9 3960 8.87
]139j5:' :‘__ 49682_2 3110 -0.53]
rand Tot 126.27

Grand Total ST

Kathy Rollins - Title Office Manager

June 27th 2011

2 hours
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LeClair, Brenda

From: Roliins, Kathy

Sent: Wednesday, January 29, 2014 11:46 AM
To: LeClair, Brenda

Subject: RE: Salary Voucher

Hi Brenda,

| believe | intended to charge to Corinna, 18015.00 which is an outside agency project. My coding should have been
9052 99 ADM.
Thanks, Kathy

From: LeClair, Brenda

Sent: Wednesday, January 29, 2014 11:36 AM
To: Rollins, Kathy

Subject: Salary Voucher

Good Morning: ‘

| was reviewing 18105.00 WIN which is for Cumberland and you had charged your salary to iton June 28,2011, The
“town you listed was Corinna. Did you actually want the charges to go to 18015.00?

Thanks
Brenda




